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LKK Auto.Gonsultants Pte Ltd
£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01.25 Paya Uibl Industrial Park. Singapore 408833
TEL 6256 3561 FAX 6256 4315
Reg. Mo 199807188R GST Reg. No. 19-8607158-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD Rel CC4/AIG18000413lyb3
RS BN MR
CHARTIS BUILDING Date: 0B-01-2018
SINGAPORE 078120
Code: AIG
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKH 8507E Veh. Inspected YP B77C
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 08/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odomaeter Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Frant Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
|
5. General Information
Accident Date  20/09/2017 |Inspection Date

Survey held at

HUA HONG PTE LTD
25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 728332

Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

Sungel Eodut Sest | Sngopore 729337
Tot [65) &b1 FE88 Foo: [85) 448] 9499 Emait inlo@twohong comag

@
12 January 2018 HHTPClaims18-03

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#09-16 AIG Building

Singapore 079120

ma ir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 6677 C & SKH 8507 E ON 20/09/2017 ALONG SERANGOON
AVENUE 2 AT ABOUT 0745 HOURS

Insured ¢ FLY BUILD PTELTD
Vehicle Registration No : YPBSITC
Vahicle Make - HINOG
Vehicle Model i XZUT10R-HKFMS3
Vehicle Chassis No i JHHUCS3H90K010587
Palicy No : VCA/P1568830
Date of Accident : o 2009/2017 Type of Claim: Third Party
S/N  Quantity Description Unit Price 5% Amount 8§
1 1 Rear Bumper ~ =7 5 600.00
2 2 Rear Bumper Bracket (LH/RH) v~ ' $ 250.00 3% 500.00
3 1 Rear Bumper Step ., R 3 250.00
T $ 1,350.00
To dismantle & change rear bumper, rear bumper step, knocking & pull $ “BB6.00
straight rear chassis frame and all area affected by accident. Seo
To spray rear bumper, rear bumper LH/RH bracket, rear bumper step and $ 800.00 -
rear chassis frame.
$ 2,950.00
7% GST § 206.50
2 d ~% Total $ 3,156.50
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Hsiao Tnnﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 10:38 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kalvin Ang (LKKAutO]

Subject: RE: LOD documents for Vehicle No. YPEET7C

Attachments: RENTAL INVOICE pdf; TAX INVOICE. pdf; TP Insurer Enquiry.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong

Please refer to the revised LOD documents as attached.

Thanks & Regards
Ashley Tan

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGE| KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

f i G0

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 October 2018 5:59 PM

To: 'Kalvin Ang (LKKAuto)' <kalvinang@lkkauto com>
Subject: Finalisation for Vehicle No. YP6&TTC

Hi Kalvin

Please refer to photos attached for finalisation.

Thanks & Regards
Ashl&g Tan

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T.6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

M@ @
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 27 October 2018 9:31 AM

To: Ashley Tan'

Ce: Kalvin Ang (LKKAuUtO)

Subject: RE: LOD documents for Vehicle No. YPEETTC

Without Prejudice
Hi Ashley,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as lollows: -

1. Cost of Repair{w/G5T| $2.37005
2. Loss of Rental (3days x $90.00) $ 270.00
3. LTA/GIA search fee 3 200

Total $2,642.05

Please confirm acceplance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liabllity/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Hest Regards,
Hsiano Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: firaz-1097 | emnil; chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 10:38 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Kalvin Ang (LKKAuto) <kalvinang@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LOD documents for Vehicle No. YPBRTTC

Dear Hsiao Tong

Please refer to the revised LOD documents as attached.



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 12:46 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD documents for Vehicle No. YP&6T7C

Dear Hsiao Tong

As spoken yesterday, please advise the loss of rental.

Thanks & Regards

A:shLE.U TAawn
e HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
f" 25D SUNGE!I KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPDRE 722332
7 s T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F, 6661 9699

Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

 fMin GO

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Saturday, 27 October 2018 9:31 AM

To: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Cc: Kalvin Ang (LKKAuto) <kalvinang@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LOD documents for Vehicle No. YPEE77C

Without Prejudice
Hi Ashley.
We reler to the above malter.

We propose setlement as follows:; -

I, Cos! of Repair[w/GST) $ 237005
2. Loss of Rental {3days x $90.00) ¥ 27000
3. LTA/GIA search fee 3 2.00

Total 52.642.05

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resalving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October 2018 10:38 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Kalvin Ang (LKKAwto) <kalvinang@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LOD documents for Vehicle No. YPEETTC

Dear Hsiao Tong

Please refer to the revised LOD documents as attached.

Thanks & Regards
Ashley Tan
/ - HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F, 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

® ©
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From: Ashley Tan <ashl huahong.com. sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 October 2018 5:59 PM

To: 'Kalvin Ang (LKKAuto)' <kalvinang@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Finalisation for Vehicle No. YP6677C

Hi Kalvin

Please refer to photos attached for finalisation.

Thanks & Regards
Ashley Tan
o HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
/"' 25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
3 = T. 6661 9690 | M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699
Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

8 ©®
bl



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 15 December 2018 12:07 PM

To: ‘Ashley Tan'

Subject: RE: LOD documents for Vehicle No. YPe677C
Attachments: DV_YPB&TTC pdf

Without Prejudice
Hi Ashley,

We are prepared fo revise our offer as follows: -

|. Cost of Repair{w/GST) $2.370.05
2. Loss of Rental (3days x $100.00) $ 300.00
3. LTA/GIA search fee ] 200

Total $2.672.05

If our offer is occeptable by your client, please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with the
following document to us|{LKK) tor our necessary action: -

« Authorisation to Act signed by your client, Fiy Build Pte Ltd
Thank you,

“Kindly note that this negotiation betwesn parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resalving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. Mo admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred
from this negatiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email; chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 December 2018 12:46 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LOD documents for Vehicle No. YP6677C

Dear Hsiao Tong

As spoken yesterday, please advise the loss of rental.



51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX @ (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CCA/AIG18000413/Smb3

20 MARCH 2018

GEEVA S/0 GOPAL KRISHNAN -~
BLK 242 SERANGOON AVE 3 .~
#02-198 ¥

SINGAPORE 550242 7

Dear Sir/Madam,
P

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKH 8507E AND YP 6677C ON 20/09/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or vour authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us, We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due 1o this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Bevan Lim

Case Handler

DID: 6749 4274

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: bevanlim/a lkkauto.com

cc.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Mator Claims Dept)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

L. Mﬂfﬂthn third party claimant”)
af “ muﬂ ulﬂ, -*Hb"’l( MM E,“ L1‘1Eﬁlddr-:l5.

owner of ‘ﬂ' b1l {(vehicle no.] hececby authorize

Huna H:ﬂkﬁ_wn_url

|*the workshep”) to act for me with respact to my claim for

repair costs and/or rental and/ex less of use ("claim™) lor my

vehicle no. b L1 that was damaged pursuant toc the

accident which ocecurred on “H !Hﬂ (date) along

__Jﬂl'ﬁﬂﬂ ﬁm"’ff_} {location)

involving vehicle no/s ﬂ_‘ﬂ‘l E

{"tha accident”).

e

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mantioned
claim in 2 manner that they deam £it and the workahop is further
authorized to receive payment fusther to settlement of my claim
with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshcp.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach
on my bahalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of
liability basia insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of tha other
vahicla/s ia concerned.

Pated this

F?
e Lﬁ)ﬁ@%

{with chep)




Al ia P = Th

“We/l, HUA HONG PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (neme of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
532.370.05 (Repair Cost), $5300.00 (Loss of Use/Reyfal), $52.00 (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
YP 6677C that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 20/09/2017 (date) along
SERANGOON AVE 2 (location) involving vehicle no/s SKH 8S0TE. This is pursuant to the
inspection conducted on 23/01/2018 (date) at “the workshop".

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner FLY BUILD PTE LTD (the third party
claimant”) of vehicle no. YP 6677C make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have
full authority to settle the mattar on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement Jodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to YP 6677C (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimamt™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Jan___ (month) 20_t% (year)

S LY .
i)
jre
f:;; Y

Sigaed by “the whskltog " (with chop)




2580 Sungel Kodul Steed | Sngopon 777333
ok |AS) 6581 FARE Fom [£5] d4d) 9499 Email infoditwobong comoag

P
@ HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

TAX INVOICE
19 October 2018 HHTPClaims18-03F

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid
78 Shanton Way

#05-16 AIG Bullding

Singapore 078120

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP 6677 C & SKH B507 E ON 20/09/2017 ALONG SERANGOON
AVENUE 2 AT ABOUT 0745 HOURS

Insured - FLY BUILD PTELTD

Vehicle Reglstration No : YPEETTC

Vehicle Make : HINO

Vehlele Model H XZUT10R-HKFMS3

Vehicle Chassis No : JHHUCSIHI0K019587

Policy No ! VCA/P1869630

Date of Accident : 20/09/2017 Typo of Claim: Thirg Party

SIN  Quantity Description Unit Price S§  Amount S§

1 1 Rear Bumper $ 60000

2 2 Rear Bumper Bracket (LH/RH) $ 25000 $ 50000

3 1 Rear Bumper Step £ 25000
$ 1.350.00

Less 10% § (135.00)

$ 1,215.00

To dismanlle & change rear bumper, rear bumper step, knocking & pul!

straight rear chassis frame and all area affected by accident. $ 50000

To spray rear bumper, rear bumper LH/RH bracket, rear bumper step and

rear chassis frame. $ 500.00
$ 2,215.00

7% GST _§ 155.05
3 2371005

Authoriged by Cfaim's Dept
Mrs Tan & 0630 81065

Co, Reg, Mo, 2000000060 } huahong comasg i GiT Rag, Mo, Z00F000744



Invoice

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone; +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
Operafing Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm

GST Registration No: M4D0D17735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-17-174436
Date of Requast: 21112017 Your Raf No: Onilne Purchase
Hua Hong Pia Lid
250 Sungei Kadul Street 1
Singapore 720332
Dear SitMadam,
Enquiry Date 21112017
Enquiry By TOH SIEWNG
TP Vehicle No. SKHEs07E
Accident Date 20/09/2017
DESCRIPTION {AMOUNT (S%)
TP Insurer Enquiry | 187
GS5T Amount | 013
Total Amount Due (GST Indusive) I 200

Thank You.

This is a computer generaled document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official use:
Data

%] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Chegue

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=ds...

21 Nov 2017



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING B .
Casz | Noofied (Est Submitted | Ad) Aswigned | Ad) Rpr (Ad) Submatted | Ins Auth'ed | Status
- 21 Sep 2017 ﬁ,ﬁ 018 '§$2.215.00  $$2,215.00 Panding for Survey
" ;
e A | Edit Adj it | ‘NEMII view gt | Cancel Case |

Claim Detalls

[Created by adjuster]

" | Geeva 5/0 Gopal Krishnan, 1D: 591406185
FLY BUILD PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 201634895

YPGGTTC

Main
Clairnamnt:
Vahicle Reg.
No.:

[20/09/2017 07:00 - :59

Date of LosE: |13 uonths From LTA Reg Date {Man ¥r)]

Clairm Type:

TP / 76768789585G

Policy/Cover |
g (2100427991

Policy No.

{Claimant) YOAPI969630

_ |Excess; |
Hua Hong Pie Ltd (Sungei Kadut) 250 Sunge: Kadut Strest 1, 729332 Sungel Kadut - Tel: 6760 BE1S / 6760 053%

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 . [Handled by Ler, Bernard-1Q]
BernardQian. Lerghaig. com

_mmmmm{nm-Tm 6338 7288

| LMK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6256-1561 . [Handied by Sebastian Yeang Wail Keen] . | Final Rpt due
17/01/2018] l o

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECETVED
?hi'l'l oare no mail for this case.

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS-
Due Date Priority  Type

 ViewAll | Search Tasks | Craate New Tast | Complete |

Task Group Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 15/1/2019



Merimen e-Claims

_Uplead bocuments | Upload #hotos | Compess Mew Letter | Lipinad Vides | Upioad Autie | -

Claim Documents

*YP6677C (76768789585G)
[SKHBS07E]
TP
FLY BUILD PTE LTD
Sep 20 2017 7:00AM
[Geeva S/0 Gopal Krishnan]
Hua Hong Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2
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9 2M08/1617:41 | General View O oawc | 2
g_qil_.réy_l_l_:?:u General View (1] Load PG =3
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(22 [26/05/1817:41 | Genersl View - O | ouvs | A
21 |28/05/18 17:41 | General View 0 | Lesarc | B
24 [268/05/1817:41 | General View o N O oaws |
25 |01/11/18 10:58 | Reinspection Photo 0 v | M
26 DI/11/18 10:58 | Reinspection Photo 0 | Lo | &
27 01/11/1810:58 | Relnspection Pheto O eaws |
28 0111181058 Relnspection Phota O s | &
29 0/11/1810:55 | Reinspection Photo - O leivc | B
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_|LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

=
| | Thumbnail Print

Mo | Finslaed Cn

\No_|Finahaed On  Auto Ce 1 per page E__@

Mo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print |

L OBOL/IE 1616 EMALL FROM AIG DD 05012018 @ [ toadeor ||

7 OB/0L/18 16:16 | NOTICE & GIA REPORT | Load POF |

3 |25/01/18 18:05 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF

A4 | 16/03/18 12:01 LETTER TO 01 Losd FDF |

5 15/01/19 1200 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF

& 15/01/19 12:00  AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM [ B l

7 15/01/1812.00 Release Voucher Load POF |

B | 15/01/1912:00 | GIA SEARCH a Load POF |
Documents Checklist

'DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | pont |

“There are no document checklists configured.

Our Checklist Remarks - LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HQ)

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insures
Mgt Bemars §re proogie giliess wisg s it 10 sifier Dartees
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Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
1v-hi-n1- No: SKHB507E (Insd veh) Model: HINO XZUT10R-HKFMS3 4.0

YPEETTC (TP veh) D (M)
[Date of Accident: |20/09/2017

Global Sum Settlement | l | ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate 4 3,156.50
Final Repair Cosl - 2.370.05
Loss of Use - 300.00 3.00 days at $100.00 per day
Rental (if any) - 000 days
LTA / GIA Search Fea 5 2.00
Others ] 0.00
]
Final Settlernant Sum ] 2672.05

s Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [X ] NO  (Kindly indicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

=N BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*); (%)

* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks
Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |Hua Hong Ple Ltd -1 267205
2) 31
3) 3

15 Jan
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN im__
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice: Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill (if any)

hrtps:Hsingapﬂre-mcn'mcn.c{:-mr’c]aimsfindt:x,cﬁn?thseanSVCdﬂc&fuscactinn—'rdsp_dnclt... 15/1/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico reguo 1sssor1sem

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall: sur@ikkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG18000413/SPB302

Date: 15/01/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer; AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No: 21004279081
Mg Insured Vehicle No : SKHBS07E
Date of Loss: 2010802017 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: TE7B8TBE58SG
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: YPBETTC
Make & Model: HINO XZUT10R-HKFMS3, 4.0 D (M) Engina No: NO4CUS30662
Req Date: 20/06/2017 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No JHHUCS3HB0K019587
Colour: Silver Odometer. 22793 km
Engine Capacity: 4009 cc
Market Value/New Car Price; N/A
Sum Insured (S3); Market Value/Mew Car Price
NDITION OF VEHI AT THE T
General Condition; Steering (Serviceabla). Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 7.00R16 Rear Tyre Size: 7.00R18
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Left Side Bridgestone & mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone & mm Rear Right Side Bridgestone & mm
The above values represant the remaining lyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS B N Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Farts 1,350.00 1.215.00 135.00 10.00
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 D.00 0.00
Labour 1,600.00 1.000.00 600.00 37.50
Paintwark Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S5) 2,950.00 2.215.00 735.00 2492
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (SS) 206.50 155.05 51.45 2492
Nett Amount (S§) 3,156.50 2,370.05 786,45 2492
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x $5100.00/day) (5%) 300.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 200
Nett Liability (S$) 2,672.05
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: a0
Date Inspected. 230172018 Inspected At Hua Hong Ple Ltd (Sunged Kadut)
25D Sungei Kadut Street 1
Singapore 728332
Estimated Period of Repair; 3.0 days
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Adjuster: Sebastian Yeang Wai Keen Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: Thi report represents our fncings af ihe fime and place of inapecton staled hererm. Such nspechion has been carmed ool 1o the bes! of our
knpwiedge and ahifity but any other lability undar any otfier circumsisnces |5 henaby expressly axcladed.
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
Mo. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 “REAR BUMPER Bent 600.00 F *600.00 FL
2 2 ‘“REAR BUMPER BRACKET [LH/RH) Bent 500.00 F *500.00 FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER STEP Benl 250.00F *260.00 FL
F=Fmnchise par. L=ListlismDsc
Sub Total (S$) 1,350.00 1,350.00
- List tem Discount on L Items 0,00/10.00% (S$) 0.00 135.00
Total Parts (S$) 1,350.00 1,215.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out |
https://singapore.merimen.comvclaims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 15/1/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellansous ems selocied.
Recommended Labour
Ne Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour items
1 TO DISMANTLE & CHANGE REAR BUMPER,REAR BUMPER New BO0.00 500.00
STEP,KNOCKING & PULL STRAIGHT REAR CHASSIS FRAME
AND ALL AREA AFFECTED BY ACCIDENT
2  TO SPRAY REAR BUMPER,REAR BUMPER LH/RH New 800.00 500.00
BRACKET,REAR BUMPER STEP AND REAR CHASSIS FRAME
Gross Labour Cost [S§) 1,600.00 1,000.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out ]
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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