Asher SnE (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 30 October 2019 12:56 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto): GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your Ref, 17/17/18/VP05/020310, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJS
3634H AND 5GP 2930K ON 30/12/2017

Follow Up Flag: Fallow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Asher

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li LI

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

—_———

The all "%&% " |onpac.com.sqg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2019 2:51 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG LI LI

Ce: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your Ref: 17/17/18/VP05/020310, ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJS 3634H AND SGP 2930K ON
30/12/2017

Your Ref. 17/17/18/N/P05&/020310
Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter

ACCIDENT INVOLVI S 3634H AND SGP 2930K ON 30/12/2017

We have highlighted to your good office on 02/01/2018 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settiement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

The accident occurred when our insured open door hit third party parked vehicle.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability

Summary to offer to repairer SK AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD is as follows: -



Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $6.508.16 51,381.00
2. Loss of Rental (7days x $140) 5 980.00 5 500.00 (5days x $100)
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee 5 200 5 200
Total | § 1,893.00

**3 days recommendaticn for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

ve is for your a le

Thank You,

Best Regoras.

Asher Sng | Cose Handler

LEK Auto Consuitants Pe Lid

phone: §841-6051 | emall: ashisnng S kkauto corm | fox: 6741-4108
Bik 51. Pava Ubl Incdustrial Park, Lb Avenige | #02-25 | 5(408%313)



Asher Snﬂ (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2019 2:51 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'; 'ONG LI LI

Cc: '‘WMT_Claim_5G'

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] Your Ref: 17/17/18/VP05/020310, ACCIDENT INVOLVING 515
3634H AND SGP 2930K ON 30/12/2017

Attachments: LKK INSPECTION.pdf: LKK ADJUSTMENT pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; LKK RESURVEY

PHOTO.pdf; TP LOD.pdf

Your Ref, 17/17/18/VP05/020310

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter
ACCID VING S5.JS 3634H AND SGP 2 272017

We have highlighted to your good office on 02/01/2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settiement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd,

The accident occurred when our insured open door hit third party parked vehicle.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability

Summary to offer to repairer SK AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1 Cost of Repair (w/GST) $6.508.16 $1.391.00
2 Loss of Rental (7days x $140) § 98000 & 500.00 (5days x $100)
3 LTA/GIA Search Fee 5 200 s 2.00
Total | § 1,893.00

**3 days recommendation for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference

The abo for your approva

Thank You.

Besi Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Hondles
LKK Auto Consullonts Ple Lid

pitone: 4841-4051 | emall: gshenngidikkauto.com | o 4741-24108

Bk 51 Porvel Ulal Inclusitial Park. Ubl avenue | #02-25 | 5(408%33)



/—Q

SK AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
ROC No,: 201500047H
23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, #03-01
Vicom Inspection Centre (Soulh Wing) 5415833
Tel. 8789 5165 Fax: 6783 5165

LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION
To Workshop 25K Automoblle Pte Ltd
Fr Owner's Name | l:l".“l'-*.’jll' r’.‘-.‘l"l"liﬁl'H:‘h:i !'llﬂ--r . Wn r*:-.l'-'ﬂ ‘
Company (Ifany)
Address : Al ﬂj o _|"--a,~~,5;'n_.~-. L[ l[ ‘—f‘ 64-139 i '7-'"‘-'5;”'\I
NRIC No LR _IL-"'T'
Accident on :4b Ii | [ '7 involving vehicle{s) 3 § 3634 1-\
Along : }U‘ _'-: “d—[':’""n_""! 8 A Opa G 'rrrl’--
l/we, M&"\ﬁnﬂ.ﬁfit ﬂ'ﬂf | E"_‘"L f"irL' the owner of motar vehicle,

registration no. 2G6PI93CK  hereby do authorize you to commence repalrs to my
abovementloned vehicle.

I/We confirm that you are authorized to handle the repair of the vehicle and/or to negotiate and
settle my claims relating to the above mentioned accident, which |/we may have, against the other
third party/parties or Insurers (excluding my own Insurer) and/or to Instruct lawyers on my/four
behalf, to facilitate the third party claim for me/us.

You are hereby authorized to execute and/or sign any documents/discharge vouchersfagresments
regarding my/four claim/case for my convenience. You are alss hereby authorized to recelve on
my/our behalf monies/claims, correspondences in connection with this said clalm.

I/We confirm that in the event of an unsuccessful claim against the negligent party, and/or my own
insurer for the damages caused to my vehicle, | agree to pay all repair costs, car rental and any
incidental expenses incurred by you or to lodge an own damage (only for comprehensive cover) to
cover the expenses incurred,

/
Witness's Name : it rlak Dot

/
Witness's Signature : A Owner's Signature : d‘g/

Revlsed: 1%/2/2017




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 1717/18/NVPOSN20310
DATE 1 06 NOV 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

[/'We, MUHAMMAD AZRI BIN ADAS confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner SJS 3634H the sum of Singapore Dollars ONE
THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED AND NINETY THREE ONLY, ($1,893.00) in full
and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property losses competent to
mefus upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property
losses sustained by mefus whether now or hereafter to become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accidemt involving, SGP 2930K on 30/12/2017 along/at
BLK 270 TAMPINES STREET 21.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (NG SOEN HOW /LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any
person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to
M/s SK AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

I'We hereby acknowledge that this payment 15 made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

Signature of vehicle owner/Date
1
Wahammad. . B fidus (2149

MName of vehicle owner/Date



SK AUTOMOBILE PTELTD

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #03-01

Vicom Inspection Centre (South Wing) 5415933
Phone +65 6789-5155 Fax +65 6783-5155

CO Reg No. 201500047H GST Reg No. 201500047H

DATE: 30-Jul-18
INVOICE # IV18-80207
VEH REG NO: SGP 2930 K
Bill To:
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Being cost of repair inclusive of labour charges, parts and accessories 5 1,300.00

for the abovementioned vehicle,

Sub.Toul | § 1.300.00
7% GST | § a1.00

Total 1,391.00

Make all cheques payable to "SK AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD"

THANK YOU FOR YOUR BUSINESS!



CARS FOR RENT (2016) PTE LTD

5 TANAH MERAH KECHIL ROAD
#17-05 SINGAPORE 466665
TEL: 67808 5155 FAX: 6783 5155

INVOICE

DATE INVOICE #
Invoice To: 08/01/2018 VIl50858
MUHAMMAD AZRI BIN ADAS
BLK 270 TAMPINES ST 21
#04-138 SINGAPORE 520270
VEH REG NO TERMS
SGP2930K | DUE ON RECPT
DESCRIPTION NO. OF DAYS RATE AMOUNT
CAR RENTAL FROM 31/12/17 TO 08/01/18 7 $140.00 $980.00
TOTAL $980.00




Supr <M

CARS FOR RENT (2016) PTE LTD

O T et S1es Fax B7AIS1S5 No: 2258
ROC Na: 201608732N VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT  w5fodink o Ao Pl
HIRER'S PARTICULAR veniceNa: 515 1637T Repiace Vieh Ne:
Name: =3 in VC) Layi Milsage Out Mileage Out
293412 Maka & Modal - Auto / Manual
NRIC/PASSPORT m_;}r = MAZOA 3 o
Addiress (Fes) 3]0 lseamng L =
doi-119 <(£30)0) ou e A J131T  nme: 1230h:
Name & Address of Employer HIRE/PERIOD EXPIHY:
COLLISION DAMAGE WAIVER Ewmpaual.e YES/NO
FERSONAL ACCIDENT INSURANCE YES/NO
Occupation: Mw&m.Mf CHARGES
Oiriving Licance No: — BVl Type:  Local [1 :
Ryt O s nilin oty 7 @8 [4D-4) pre % |
ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULARS Monthly — @% per morith
Nama: (s in VG) Hours as per hour )F
.Wﬂu Others 08 f
P cow of per day/month /
Drving Licence No:_____ O/ Type: Local / international | PAJ a3 par day/month /
lasiin Cate Data of Birth: __ | Dwiivery Sarvice f(
Oecupation: DrivingExp P sl
— — __SE-TOTL ¢ ﬁ ah |
VEHICLE CHECK LIST PETROL
o |E |4tz Jas|F
HEAR In E 14 12 ars 3 ]
i O\ = ==
iy Collection Sarvice
ke Misc.
TOTAL CHARGES $
; E—_ ——

.g.“’ﬂ‘“ FRONT TOP LEFT @
‘ %

[ Astwray [ ogugnter [ sy
[ STD Tools 1 ek [ HubCaps
[ | Radio/Clasa [__]CD [ Catndges

ummmwmm:mmmmmnnmmmmw.nlmmﬂ:mmmnmwmvmt | agres
that &fl amount payabia under this agreemant and for parking snd traffic infringernmants may be billed to that account and my sgnature above
willl be considerad 1o have besn made an the charge/credit card voluchar. All informatian | have given CARS FOR RENT (2016) FTELTD In

connaction with this agreamant is trus,

* IMPORTANT

1 mrmmnmmnmmmtmmm.mm:mmmmmuvﬂﬂm

1. ALL PRRKING AN TRAFTIC VIDULATIONS ARE THE RESPOMSIEILITY OF THE HiFER mmmmrmmmmmm

3 THE MERER SHALL -mmmmmmmmuwmmmmmmw.mwmmmm#“m

& 1N CASE OF ACCIDENT, THE HIFER SHALL REFORT T0 MENTAL DFFIGE IMMETRATELT |F THERE 1 BOCILY IMARES & POLCE RERDRT MUST BE WADE WITHIN 24 HOURS.

4 VEMICLE 8 STIOCTLY FOR SGAPORE UGE OMLY S Ry HOTT BE EIAVEN DUT DF SHsEssOg WITHOUT B0 COMBENT OF THE COMIWNY CARS FOR RENT (3018] FTE LTD
BEOW Bl | DERMED TO

umwm,munrmnmmmmmmmwmwrm:wmwmswmmm
BE THE WY AMD TS THE YEHICLE I RETUNNED TO mmmmﬂlHEmemmmnmummuﬂmmmW

B CHALLEWGED OF CUESTIONED 08 ANY ACTOLINT MIATSEEVER

DATE IN | TIME IN | MILEAGE | CHECKED 8Y FEMARKS Q%:b A !

{
‘!'{w q?- SIGNATURE OF HIRER/ORIVER




il

GENERAL

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Our Rel No: GR-18-000439
Date of Requeast: 02/01/2018

SK Automobile Pte Lid
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#03-01 Vicom Inspection Cantre

INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

Irvoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapare 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am ta Spm

GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Your Rel No: Onling Purchase

Singapore 415833

Daar SirfMadam,

Enquiry Data 020172018

riquiry By Siew Huey Lea
Vehicle Na SJ53634H

Accident Date JoM2/2017

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicla No. Insurar Period of Insurance Insurar Tel. No.

5J53634H Lanpac Insurance Bhd 13/08/2017-12/08/2018 +H5 625073588
Thank You.

The images provided 1o you are 1aken from tha original reports forwarded to the
Singapore and we take no responsibliity for their accuracy or conents and ghall

or In connactian with the reports or thair images

.nis Is & computer generaled document and requires no signalure.

cantre by the members of the Genaral Insurance Association of
be under no lisbility whatsoever for any loss or damage arsing out of

hitps:/isingapore. marimen com/claimsndex.cim Tlusebox=MTHRsashfuseacton=dsp, _geninvipArefid=18833544CFID=260795348CF TOKEN=848 . 112



w2016 Imvaice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
ERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSUWE Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax; +85 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday ta Friday S8am to Spm
GST Registration No: MA0D017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE

Our Ral No: GR-18-000439
Date of Request: 02/01/2018 Your Rel No: Online Purchase
SK Aulomobile Pta Lid
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#03-01 Vicom Inspection Cantre
Singapore 415933
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Data 02/01/2018

nquiry By Siew Huey Lee

Vehicle No, SJS3834H

Accident Date annzro7
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is & computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [ ]| Cash | | Cheque

hitps Halngapors merimen comiclaimeindex cim?lusebox=MTRsas&luseacton=dsp _geninviphrafid=s 18833548 CFID=260785344CF TOKEN=8d8 22



