Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: April 14,2020 12:21 PM

To: utauto@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Accident involving SKX1784H (AXA) claiming against GBD1728H (AXA)

on 02.01.2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/ASM18000336/Uhb3s2

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $5,100.00

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused
is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 March, 2020 9:04 AM

To: YT(KB)

Cc: utauto@singnet.com.sg; Vic (LKKAuto); CS A Team

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Accident involving SKX1784H (AXA) claiming against GBD1728H (AXA) on 02.01.2018 *** LKK
REF: CC4/ASM18000336/Uhb3s2

Dear Sirs / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Vic,

Kindly assist.



To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: YT(KB) <info@yewteegroup.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 March, 2020 11:48 AM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM Motor Doc <motor.doc@axa.com.sg>

Cc: utauto@singnet.com.sg

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Accident involving SKX1784H (AXA) claiming against GBD1728H (AXA) on 02.01.2018

Dear AXA,
Resend LOD with GIA Report.
Kindly let us have the DV soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards
MAY

—_—
TOUE: TowiTiD padfaa

YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
Branch Office:

Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4,
#01-61, Singapore 417800

Office: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg
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Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified recipient(s)
to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your system. You may not
copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.



