Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 29 January 2018 2:49 PM

To: 'LSMTYC'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle No. SKB 9884R & SKF8504Z On 30.12.2017 *LKK
REF: CC4/AIG18000334/ks3

Attachments: RV AIG SKB9884R 30122017.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Apple,
We refer to our previous tele-conversation.

We confirmed on the global sum settlement of $7,050.00 (all in).

Attach DV for your necessary actions.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: LSMTYC [mailto:Ismstyc@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 23 January 2018 11:59 AM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle No. SKB 9884R & SKF8504Z On 30.12.2017 *LKK REF: CC4/A1G18000334/ks3

Dear Zaini,
Our Ref: SKB 9884R “WITHOUT PREJUDICE”
Your Ref: CC4/AIG18000334/ks3

Enclose herewith attached for your perusal.
Please let us have your DV & payment as soon as possible.
TQ

Wishing you a happy Chinese new year
Gong Xi Fa Cai



