Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Olea, Maricel <Maricel.Olea@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 October 2018 9:52 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: #7265323753SG003#023# Our Ref: CC3/LCR18000328/K1ps3 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SLK 2059T(Ol) & SH 7654A(TP) ON 29/12/2017]

Attachments: 7265323753SG scene photos.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong,

The video footage shows that our driver was forced to stop while inching out. The taxi driver refused to give way
and drove her way into the front scraping OIV front bumper with taxis corner left hand side bumper.

Immediately after the scene, our driver took the attached photographs. It clearly shows that OIV was already % into
the lane when the taxi driver side-swipe OIV.

Please maintain our proposal to settle at 50:50.

Best Regards,

Maricel Olea

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1826 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416
maricel.olea@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If
you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts
thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in
any way from its use.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, October 11, 2018 7:51 AM

To: Olea, Maricel

Subject: RE: #72653237535G003#023# Our Ref: CC3/LCR18000328/K1ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 2059T(OI)
& SH 7654A(TP) ON 29/12/2017]

Hi Maricel,
We refer to our email dated 11 Aug 2018.

Kindly let us have your further instruction on this maftter.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 1 October 2018 11:26 AM

To: 'Olea, Maricel' <Maricel.Olea@aig.com>

Subject: RE: #72653237535G003#023# Our Ref: CC3/LCR18000328/K1ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 2059T(Ol) &
SH 7654A(TP) ON 29/12/2017]

Hi Maricel,
We refer to our email dated 11 Aug 2018.

Kindly let us have your further instruction on this maftter.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 15 September 2018 10:46 AM

To: 'Olea, Maricel' <Maricel.Olea@aig.com>

Subject: RE: #72653237535SG003#023# Our Ref: CC3/LCR18000328/K1ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 2059T(Ol) &
SH 7654A(TP) ON 29/12/2017]

Hi Maricel,
We refer to our email dated 11 Aug 2018.

Kindly let us have your further instruction on this maftter.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 11 August 2018 1:57 PM

To: 'Olea, Maricel' <Maricel.Olea@aig.com>

Subject: RE: #72653237535G003#023# Our Ref: CC3/LCR18000328/K1ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 2059T(Ol) &
SH 7654A(TP) ON 29/12/2017]

Hi Maricel,
We attached here with a copy of longer video from third party for your easy reference.

We have offered 50% global sum at $500.00(all-in) to third party. However they rejected our offer and
proposed g/s $850.00(all-in).

The summary of claim is as follows : -

Our offer TP proposal
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 577.80
2. Loss of Rental (2.5days x $129.28) [ $ 323.20
3. Loss of Income (2.5days x $50.00) [ $ 125.00
$1,026.00
@50% | S 513.00

4. LTA/ GlA search fee $ 7.49
Total | $ 520.49

Global Sum | $§ 500.00

G/S $850.00(all-in)

Kindly let us have your further instruction on this maftter.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Olea, Maricel <Maricel.Olea@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June 2018 4:22 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: #7265323753SG003#023# Our Ref: CC3/LCR18000328/K1ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 2059T(Ol) & SH
7654A(TP) ON 29/12/2017]

Dear Hsiao Tong,
As spoken, please request for the longer copy of the video depicting before and actual collision.
Otherwise, please offer up to 50% liability for side-swipe collision.

Best Regards,

Maricel Olea

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1826 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416
maricel.olea@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If
you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts
thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in
any way from its use.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, June 05, 2018 3:00 PM

To: Olea, Maricel

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 7265323753SG *Our Ref: CC3/LCR18000328/K1ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 2059T(OI)
& SH 7654A(TP) ON 29/12/2017]

Hi Maricel,

We refer to the above matter.

Attached is a copy of video footage from third party for your easy reference.

Third party reported that he was on lane 3 queue towards Taxi stand at Clark Quay. Suddenly OID from bus
stop came out and intercept to his lane and forcing third party to move more to right. When third party was
moving straight, OID hit onto his taxi.

OID reported that he signalled right and intended to filter back to main road from bus stop. His car was
stationary when third party came from his right to overtake his car. Third party taxi brushed against the front

right portion of his car.

Based on the video footage and damage profile of both vehicles, we are of the view that our insured
vehicle was stationary when the collision happened.

For an amicable settlement, we would like to propose 50/50 in view of our insured vehicle had encroached
into the main road of third party. Third party did not attempt to avoid our stationary vehicle.

Kindly let us have your instruction/comments please.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 January 2018 5:16 PM

To: 'Maricel.Olea@aig.com' <Maricel.Olea@aig.com>

Subject: Your Ref: 7265323753SG *Our Ref: CC3/LCR18000328/K1ps3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 2059T(Ol) & SH
7654A(TP) ON 29/12/2017]

Your Ref: 72653237538SG
Our Ref: CC3/LCR18000328/K1ps3

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK 2059T(Ol) & SH 7654A(TP) ON 29/12/2017
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly assist to upload Ol's video in Merimen for our viewing.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
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"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



