Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Focus Auto <focus.autopteltd@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 29 January 2018 10:01 AM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBC5624C Our Ref:  SJH4475B_DOA: 29/12/2017 ALONG DHL AIR

EXPRESS CENTRE WAREHOUSE GROUND FLOOR AT ABOUT 1400 HOURS *** LKK
REF - CC6/AIG18000325/Uks3

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Dear Zaini,

Thanks for your email.

We agreed to the offer $2,320.00 (all-in) as stated.
Please enclose us the DV

Thank You

Best Regards
Laura

Focus Auto Pte Ltd
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#02-50 AutoBay Singapore 417883
Tel: 6886 9097 Fax: 6481 9095

On Monday, 29 January 2018, 9:25, Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SUH4475B
Our Ref: CC6/AIG18000325/Uks3

Dear Laura,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC 5624C & SJH 4475B ON 29/12/2017
We refer to the above matter

For a quick and amicable settlement, we offer to settle global sum at S$ 2,320.00(all in)

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settiement.
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