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¥y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
o

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref CS/EGI1B000311/Avd3
Jou 31 SINTEG W, AR
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 05-01-2018
SINGAPORE 038385
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJN 2546L Veh. Inspected SKZ 8785
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DSMPCWV1703100/SE/pl Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 05/01/2018
P : Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mim
4, Description of Damages
5, General Information
Accident Date  26/12/2017 Inspection Date
Survey held at AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD
18 UBI ROAD 4
SINGAPORE 408623
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,




8 74 74

- - Consuitanrs
sEme s Company Registration No. 199607 198R

&1 URIAVE 1, #02-23 PAYA UKL INDUSTRIAL FARK, SINGAPORE 08933 TEL : 1065 62563561 FAX : (065 62364315

Your ref: DSMPCV1703100/5E/pl
Our ref; CS/EGII800031 1/Avd3 Date : 16/1/2018
The Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice

M/s: ERGO Insurance Pte Lid

Dear SirMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SKZ 8788
We thank vou for your instruction on 4/1/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned
vehicle on_15/1/2018 at the premises of M/s

AUTOLUTION IND PTE LTD and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §53,209.36
Revised Estimate Amount : 551,457.84
"Check" Items Amount : 551,048.08
Market Value : 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%
Nett Value : 5%

nearside

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear f f [ ‘ ':]Ir'—ﬁ front
rear portion. i | i :ﬁ;

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAM LING WAl PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE, AMSAE-A,M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser



Survey Department Check List (Case Handler)

Referance No. : {:5[ EQTL |Bock 51\[ Pvels
Policy Type: OD / TP / TP RES / TL/ EVA

Admin (

(1) Office Asmgn Form
C F.eference Nu
Cusmmer Cude )
.ﬁ.ssagn me
| Assign Date
h.feh No {mspected}

_' |‘u’eh No {Insured)

'D{J A

Pnhw No

'Elalm No
-jlnsurance .ﬁ.uthunsattun [CA ,."REWFIEP]
‘Report Type

. Weckend Charges
Survey held atfﬂep"airer

.E:IICCEEE“I o

A ﬁ!{lﬁfl"‘l|ﬁ zn

nfnZ N 000

Surveyor (
[1} {kssign_rne_m:__Fa; m
' C  Vehicle No

L Regn Month}"rear
'Vehicle Type

C

N e

N Make & Model
C uEngme Capamtyr (CC)
N

N 1Culnur
C  'Odometer. {5p. Readmg}

E '_ Chassis No
N _Generaiﬂnnd:tmn

h! Steeri ing

N MDdLFEEt]Dﬂ {Mﬂdl}
C _ "fvré Size
N
C

Tyre Make - B

Tyre Balance
¢ 'Dateof Inspection
N Surveyheld

N Des.of Damages

{2} | System - [‘Ulews,"Meﬁmen) e
C Damaged Uehme Phntographs Upluadeﬁ

{3] Workshop Estimate/Assignment Form

" [ALL Parts condition
1rﬁ.-'1ar‘ru5:1: value for oD 0D cases
‘Estimate Repair Cost for PRI (RSI, TMI, MSIG)
Days of repair
' Flnailig?ﬂmﬁu nt _
Re-inspection Cases o Fmalize within 5 Days

(4) .S\rst_,em {VlewsfMer{men]
€ TResurvey photo Uploaded

N0 o r‘u_z

Case Handler
}: Case handler to make sure all Information created by the assignme

Typist

v

! Y-Date

N-Date ¥-Date | N-Date

S| %S

%

): Case handler to make sure the surveryor completed all required information.

Check By: | VERON \&

iR

Case Handler Date

=C: Critical *N: MNon-Critical

‘.[‘-\‘.ﬁ‘n‘\ sUsis ] S SEMIS Y INVIR|s

—
q

nt team are ACCURATE.

21/05/2014



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 9:54 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.)'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SIN2546L / TP : SKZBTBS/LKK / DOA : 26/12/2017 (DSMPCV1703100)
Attachments: SKZ 8785 PRELI REVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SKZ 8788
Date of survey: 15/1/2018
Number of days:3 days

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 January 2018 9:14 AM

To: 'Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg=; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJN2546L /TP : SKZ878S/LKK / DOA : 26/12/2017 (DSMPCV1703100)

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed vehicle not in workshop, repairer arrange on 08/01/2017.

"Wishes you a Happy New Year 2018"

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkagto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408033)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.) [mailto:Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 4 January, 2018 3:20 PM

To: 'admin-d@lkkauto.com’
Subject: Ol : 5IN2546L /TP : SKZ8785/LKK / DOA : 26/12/2017 (DSMPCV1703100)

Dear Ashley,



In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Please assist to conduct this survey from AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD,

ADDRESS : 19 UBIROAD 4
SINGAPORE 408623
PERSON TO CONTACT : HAMZAH SA’AD @ 6703 8690 / 9645 0079

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE ~ : STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on DIRECT SETTLEMENT basis. Please inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to
conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep
us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGQ PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey

status via Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are estimate, insured and third party SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).

Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.

Thank you.

Yee Pei Li

Claims Assistant (Molor)

ERGOD Insurance Pte, Lid

5 Temasek Boulevard

#04-01 Suntec Tower Five

Singapore 038885

Tel.: 65 BB29 9189 DID: 65 6829 8194
Vebsite: www Ergo.com.sg

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGQ is represented in more than 30 countrias
and concentrales on Europe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re {Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers



MNivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd.) <Survey.Report@ergo.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 4 January, 2018 3:20 PM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’

Subject: Ol : SJN2546L / TP : SKZ8785/LKK / DOA ; 26/12/2017 (DSMPCV1703100)
Attachments: SIN2546L- SAS.pdf; SKZ878S - SAS.pdf; SKZ878S - PRS FORM.pdf

Dear Ashley,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016” in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,

both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single loint Expert”,

Please assist to conduct this survey from AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD,

ADDRESS : 18 UBIRDAD 4

SINGAPORE 408623
PERSON TO CONTACT © HAMZAH SA’AD @ 6703 8690 / 9645 0079
ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE @ STEVE LIM

Note: To survey on DIRECT SETTLEMENT basis. Please inform the repairer in writing, that you are require to
conduct a re-survey before vehicle is returned to claimant. They are to contact your office directly. Please do keep
us in the loop.

Please fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
status via Survey Report@ergo.com.sg.

Attached are estimate, insured and third party SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party).
Kindly acknowledge receipt of this email.
Ik you

Yee Pei Li

ERGC iz one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 530 countries

ind concentrates on Eurape and Asia, ERG part of Munich Re (5 ] 1e of the world's leading risk carriers



Bata: 04.01.2018

ERGO

Sent via Fax

DSMIPC1703100/SE/pl

Our Reference:

Your Roforence:  SKZ 8785

T

AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE. LTD.

Ernail
hamzah_saad@tanchong.com

Pre-Repair Survey (PRS) Acknowledgement

Wehicle Far Inspectian: SKZ 8785

Insured's Vehicle: SIN 2546L

Date Of Accident: 26.12.2017

We acknowledge receipt of your request for BRS on:

_03.01.2018

In compliance with "State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016", do select an assessor fram

the list below and indicate your selection in the box marked *.

Fre

* Liclke Aubo Conguldaat
Lheh ]

AlS Automoblie Inspection Services Pte Lid LBS L.B.S Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Lid LECK LKK Aute Consultants Pte Led s
145 Infiniti Appraisal Service PS Priority Services

IPK 1P Knights Pte Lid VAL Vicom Ltd

vV |vour request for inspection does net have your client's cost of repair estimate, kindly forward a copy,

Your request for inspection does mot have your client's complete GIA report, kindly forward a copy.
We acknowledge your interest for direct settlement, we will assess & rovert soon upon receipt of estimate,

Qur Insured's driver has not reparted the accident te us todate.

V' lothers:  We write to confirm our agreement to have a direct settlement of this claim with
guantum to be agreed. OFFICER-IN-CHARGE STEVE LIM
Prepared by Q‘% l_ Pei Ll £829 9194 claims@ergo.com.sg
Signature: ‘ | FAX : 6829 9247
Assessor use only: Waorkshop use only:
Assessor attend shop on:
Assignment Date: Date:
Assignmeant Time: Time
Inspecior:

Remarks:

[ vehicle not avallable at the appointed date and time,

Kindly acknowledge our Assessar presence for the above job ,

Warkshop Acknowledgement & Stamp,
Note: Qur Inspection Is on a without admission to lability basis.



AMUTOLUTEON INDUSTRIAL PTE. LT0L

ESTIMATE 1 MCCICENTSECOY REPALRS
REFERENCE + INSSIGHANTSE/TT
OATE t Z8-DEC-2017

ERGD INSURAKCE FTE LTD
5 TEHASEX BOULEVARD
#4-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE
5003855

L § 68799199
Fax ; 6299247/ %248
ATTH : CLATM MAKSGER

OWKER'S NAME @ COH CHEE YEW

ADDRESS : BLE 7500 PUNGGOL FIELD
#14-51
SlE2arsa)

TELEFHONE MO - S004R176

TYPE OF CLAIM i THIRD PARTY CLAIM

POLICY WO o

VEHICLE MO i SKIETES

MODEL CODE ¢ FRLARBIJIIUEA--A--
MOOEL/YEAR £ NISSAN DASHOAL 1.2
EMGINE N ; HRAZZ130624
CHASSTS NO : SJNFEAITIUIRA0GT2
MILEAGE 3 3B433 KM

[ATE 1N B2
LTABTLITY 7 .00
EXCESS CLMSE @ .00

ESTIMATE BY

ACCIDENT DATE @ 26."1{.’201? Cl é\tﬂb Cco }L\

Ax 6846 7487



AUTOLUTTON TNDUSTRIAL PTE, LTO.

ESTIMATED LABDUR CHARGES FOR ACCIOENT VEWICLE REGH WD SKZE7ES

5/ND JOB CODE NATURE OF )08

1 Ieroi LABOUR [HARGES TO REPAIR REAR PANEL AKD REREW REAR
BUMPER,

2 I3i00e CHARGES T SPRAY PAINTINMG SAME.

3 I3/003 REMOVE AN INSTALL REVERSE SENSOR.

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

ESTIMATED  SURVEYDR'S
CHAAGES  RECIMHENDATION



AJTOLUTION TNDUSTRIAL PTE. LTD

MATERTAL LIST FOR ACCIDENT VEHICLE REGN MO SKIBVAES

DAMAGED PARTS & PRICES

S/N) PARTS DESCRIFTION PARTS MIMEER WETT LIST  S/NETT REMARKS
1 SUNDRIES phan WPt irte—T 23 o
pet
2 SENSOR-REVERSE SENSOR xo.g0 7T
A
3 REAR BUMPER STA¥ LH et HE211 -4EanA 12600 7 2,
4 RER BuvwER sTav Mol N HEZ10-4EAM 200 ' w
o ML
5 REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT et X HE030-4EAMS slgm 2 A
1
6 ENERGY ABSORBER: Riak auweer UL AW/ BE000- 45408 126.40
Pefou'ad s
7 BEAR BUMPER (LIS & SA3-BO-FAGH  Adav 791R4- 4FAA T
8 FEAR BMPER TOW WOOK COvER. 2P T P BEO71 -4EADA .80 X
Fs

5 REAR BUMPER FASCIA e E“:""—'U:." BE0EZ-AEADH e L

SUB TOTAL 1874.20 0.00  350.00

LESS DISCOUNT (NETT-20.008, LIST-30.00%, S/NETT-.00%) 374,84 .00 0.00

ERAND TOTAL 1495, 3 0.00  350.00

OVERALL TOTAL 1549, 36

LEGEND; AEMARKSL O ) = APPROVED, REMARKSE X ) = NOT APPROVED



ASTOLUTEON TWDUSTRIAL PTE. LTD,
'

SUMMARY OF ESTEIMATE FOR VEHICLE REGN WO SKZBTES

TOTAL LABOUE CHARGES

TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES

CRAKD TOTAL

1380.00
1649,34

* ALl charges do? not incluge GT.

SURVEYDR' S PARTICULARS
HAME

SURVEYED DATE
AUTHORITED: DWTE

EXCESS CLAUSE
LIABILITY

REMARES

. IS/:HI{‘B

0.00 0501,7/7

BLS NOTE ¢ This estimate is baszed on visual inspection of the
affected vehicle, Should we require further Tabour
charges & zpare parts in the process of repatre, wWe
shall inforn you accordingly.

LKK Aulo Consultants hence notify

the Repairer of the following:

= To resurvey befors/afier spray painting
-ﬁmmmnmm-g

= Pats prices ave subject to confirmation

= Third party survey = on 8 “"Without Prejudics” basis
= No ilegal modification(s) is allowsd

* Supplementary herm(s) must be resurveyed and
iﬂlﬂﬂbﬁmﬁmmm

Acknowledged by Repairer

Signature:
Dinlec

96893735




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 March 2018 8:06 AM

To: 'Hamzah Saad / TCMS"; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)
Ce: Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SKZ8TES - for survey

Dear Hamzah,
Confirmed final amount $1457.84 before GST
Mo of days: 3 days

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent to ERGO

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hamzah Saad / TCMS [mailto:hamzah_saad@tanchong.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 6 March 2018 11:44 AM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Pwd: SKZ8785 - for survey

Dear Adrian,

Attachment final repair copy.

Kindly revert for invoicing.

Regards

-------- -- Forwarded message ----------

From: Hamzah Saad /f TCMS <hamzah saad@tanchong.com:>
Date: Thu, Jan 4, 2018 at 1:09 PM

Subject: SKZ878S - for survey
To: "ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)" <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Hi,
Pls refer to the attachment and arrange LKK to survey.

Regards



Hamzah 5a'ad

Service Supervisor

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

19 Ubi Road 4

S{408623)

Tel: +65 6490 9666 DID: +65 6703 8690 Fax: +65 6846 7483
H/P: +65 9645 0079

Email: hamzah saad@tanchong.com

Website: www.tanchong.com www.nissan.com.sg

Hamzah Sa'ad

Service Supervisor

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

19 Ubi Road 4

5(408623)

Tel: +65 6450 5666 DID: +65 6703 8690 Fax: +65 6846 7483
H/P: +65 9645 0079

Email: hamzah saad@tanchong.com

Website: www.tanchong.com www.nissan.com.sg




M"‘l"\.—m L\eic B
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AUTOLETION TROUSTRIAL FTE. LTD.

AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD
FIMALLZED : ACCIDEMT/BODY REPAIAS 19 UBI ROAD 4

SINGAPORE 408523

TEL: 5480 9666 FAX: GE46 7483

REFEREHCE ¢ INSZIC/HAQTSE/1T7
DATE 1 28-0EC-2017

ERGD [NSURAKCE FTE LTD
5 TEMASEE BOULEYARD
#14-0]1 SUNTEC TOWER FIWE
SOCEEREs)

TEL + 68299139

FAN @ HE2OGRLT 0243
ATTH ¢ CLAIM MANAGER

‘?»ALD«V\Q.

(WHER S NAME : G0H CHEE YEW

ADDRESS + BLK FREC PUNGGOL FIELD
#14-51
STER32E9)

TELEFHIRE KO 1+ 46176

TYPE OF CLAIM  : THIRD PARTY CLAIM

POLICY MO g

VEHICLE KD ¢ SETEES

MIEL CDOE i FRLARBZJIIUEA--A--
MEL/YERR 1 MESSAN DASHOAL 1.2
EKGINE KD 1 HRAZZ13062A
CHASS]S NO : SINFEAJLIUISA0G72
MILEMGE i 39433 KM

OATE IR » #/12/2017
L1ABILITY : 0.0
ENCESS CLAUSE 0.00

ACCIDENT DATE  + 26/12/2017

ESTIMATE EY T HAMTAH — c{ l‘ak-l, TBD B 1



MIILUTIR IHDUSTRIAL PTE. LTG.

LRHOUR CHARGES AR ALL

30 208 {00E  KATURED

1 I50al ARG
EARMPER.

¢ 1I/00E CHAREES

DERT M

EoRsll ) SHTRIES

CSVIMATED  SLRNEYOR'S
i RECTRMENDAT ITR

[HARGES 7O REPAIR RLAR PAKEL AMD RENEW REAR B0, 00 35000

D OSERAY BRINTING SAME. .00 255,00

3 drhoa RERDVE  ANG HETALL SEVERSE SEWSIR. 130,00 134,400

TOTAL LA0OUR CHARGES 135000 150,00



AJTOLUTI0N IROUSTRIAL FPE, LTL

e R

S/R] PARTS CESCRIPTEON
s

£ SENSDS-ALVIESE

3 REAR BUMPER 5TAY oM

4 FIAR BUMPER STAY BH

5 RZAR BUMPER ASINFIRCEHENT

£ EHERGY MBSORBER Hoif fuxbiik

WATERIAL LUST FOR ALCIOERT VEHICLL HOGH 10 SKIBTAS

REN

SENE0R

WER1 145

FLELD- AENA

TN

HEDG]- AEAE

7 AEAR BUMPER CLIF € 325.B0 EACH TEIR4 SEAGA

8 REAR BUWPER TOM HODK £0vER

9 REAR BLMPER FASLIA

SIE TOTAL

LESS DESCOURT (METT- 008,

GAAKD TOTAL

CYERALL TOTAL

BEOT] -4CAON

BEOEE - ATANH

L157-30.00%, S/NETT-.00%)

LEGERD: REMERNS( O )= APPROVID, HEMBRESE X ) @ KO ARFROVEY

FRATE RVBIR

[AHaGED FARTS B PRICES

LIST SIRETT REMARKS

000 X



AUTOLLTION INDUSTRIAL F7E. LTD.

SurheRY OF OVERALL CHAAGES FOR VEHICLE REGH MJ SKIBFGS

RETT ITFEM |E4.80
LESS 20,00%) =171.96
KETT BT GET B

EIST TTEN 0.0
LESE 30.00%) Q.00
LIST #0LT .00

SPECIA, RETT TEM .00
LEes 00T 0.0
L HETT AMILNT .00

ABTUR (HARGES 150.00

TOFAL SARE PARTS Cidfis Ti g

TOTAL THARGES 1457 . B4
KX} 7 X GS1 L. 0

GAAND TOTAL 552,09



' 74l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-gf‘:-;i-—; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6266 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Feg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref . CS/EGI1B000311/Avd3n2
| IRRAIAN
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 08-03-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJN 25461 Veh. Inspected SKZ 8785
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DSMPCAT03100/SE/pl Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 04/01/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN QASHQA| C.C 1187
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. SINFEAJ11U1540672 Colour GREY
Odometer 40710 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R17 COMNTINENTAL & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/12/2017 |Inspe:tinr| Date 15/01/2018
Survey held at AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD
19 UBI ROAD 4
SINGAPORE 408623
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKZ 8785
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =SUnEte I;H {'gl’
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER STAY LH (M) NOT NECESSARY 126.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER STAY RH (N) NOT NECESSARY 126.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT (N) NOT NECESSARY 61820 -
1|ENERGY ABSORBER REAR BUMFER (N) NOT NECESSARY 126.40 -
1|REAR BUMPER RETAINER (N) MECESSARY 142 .80 142 80
1|REAR BUMPER TOW HOOK COVER (N) NOT NECESSARY 16.BD -
1|REAR BUMPER FASCIA (N) DEFORMED T17.00 T17.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -374.84 -171.96
1,498 .36 687.84
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 20.00
1|SENSOR-REVERSE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
350.00 20.00
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES TO REPAIR REAR PANEL AMD 650.00 380.00
RENEW REAR BUMPER.
CHARGES TO SPRAY PAINTING SAME. 60000 260.00
REMOVE AND INSTALL REVERSE SENSOR 110.00 110.00
1,360.00 750.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,209.36 1,457.84
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | [ 1,457.84)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18000311/Avd3n2

%g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE,AMIRTE, AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appralser

CISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repor is made sclely Tor the use and benelil of the Cliend named on the frond page of this Repon.




