Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 March 2018 11:31 AM

To: ‘Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)'

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR EM2222K & SKB198Y ON 04/01/2018 ***

LKK REF: CC3/AIG18000286/ka3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: EM 2222K
Our Ref: CC3/A1G18000286/Wka3

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKB 198Y & EM 2222K ON 04/01/2018
We refer to the above matter.

We confirmed settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) S 7,487.75
2. Loss of Use(9days x $60.00) S 540.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 2.00

TOTAL $8,029.75

The Cheque amount is to be made payable to
1. $7,489.75: VOLKSWAGEN CENTRE SINGAPORE
2. $540.00: CHIA GEK ENG.

We will proceed to close the file.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore) [mailto:shushi.tang@vw.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 1 March 2018 10:25 AM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR EM2222K & SKB198Y ON 04/01/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG18000286/ka3



Hi Zaini,

Please revised the offer of LOU to $60, most company are offer a higher amount now.
Much appreciated, Thank you.

Best Regards,

Tang Shu Shi
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampat
Singapore 368314

DID: +65 6922-3502
Mobile: +65 9386-7833
Main Line : +65 6305-7299
Main Fax: +65 6285-8620
shushi.tang@vw.com.sg
http://www.vw.com.sg

New Arteon.

This is high performance art.

From: Zaini (LKK Auto) [mailto:Zaini@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February, 2018 9:12 AM

To: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR EM2222K & SKB198Y ON 04/01/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG18000286/ka3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: EM 2222K
Our Ref: CC3/A1G18000286/Wka3

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKB 198Y & EM 2222K ON 04/01/2018
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $7,487.75
2. Loss of Use(9days x $50.00) S 450.00
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3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 2.00
TOTAL $7,939.75

Please confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Tang, Shu Shi (VWG Singapore) [mailto:shushi.tang@vw.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 22 January 2018 10:24 AM

To: Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
<Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: REQUEST DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR EM2222K & SKB198Y ON 04/01/2018 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG18000286/ka3

Hi,
Please find attached final bill for your processing.
Best Regards,

Tang Shu Shi
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Centre Singapore (Macpherson)
1 Kampong Ampat
Singapore 368314

DID: +65 6922-3502
Mobile: +65 9386-7833
Main Line : +65 6305-7299
Main Fax: +65 6285-8620
shushi.tang@vw.com.sg
http://www.vw.com.sg




