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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408533

TEL: 52556 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg Mo 198607198R GS5T Reg. No 19-9607198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automabile

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

78 SHENTON WAY #08-18

CHARTIS BUILDING

Raf CCa/AIG180002TRMbI

Date : 04-01-2018

AT

SINGAPORE 078120
Code: AIG
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKZ 4703L Vah. Inspected GBE 8270J
Paolicy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 04/01/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No, Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Maodification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date 01/01/2018 Inspection Date
Survey held at ABWIN SERVICE PTELTD
MNo. 8 KAK] BUKIT AVENUE 4
#07-48 PREMIER@KAKI BUKIT GATE 2
SINGAPORE 415875
Sa. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company

Owner ID: 1221H

WVehicle Details

WVehicle No. GBEBZ70)

Vehicle to be Exported No

Intended De-registration 27 Feb 2018

Date:

Vehicle Make: NISSAN

Vehicle Model: NV200 1.5 MT ABS AIRBAG
2WD 6DR E5 W/RC

Primary Calour: Silver

Manufacturing Year: 2015

Engine No.: KFKC400D0554 16

Chassis No., VSKYBAM20Z0123670

Maximum Power Cutput:

Open Market Value $19.981.00

Original Registration Date: 06 Apr 2016

First Registration Date: 04 Apr 2016

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $1,000.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligbility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 05 Apr 2024

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus

COE Period(Years)! 10

PQP Paid: $5.35%.00

COE Rebate Amount: $4.34500

Total Rebate Amount: $4,345.00

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 27 Feb 2018

oK

hitps://vrllta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput 7FUNCTION _1D=F030400...

Page | of 2

27-Feb-18



Please arrange to survey vehicle at
8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 - GATE 2
#07-48 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT

rf

At ABWINE

AN
< gw" LINDA LIAD

ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD
DID: 67139417

'7(/ :
Fax: 67139415
¥ 7/ f HP: 97519596

SINGAPORE 415875

Date : 24/01/2018

TP Vehicle No. : 5KZ-4703-L

Ta : AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD

Attn : Motor Claim Department S

Owner - WELLBUILT PTE LTD (el 7-' v
NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD

Certificate No. : 5078661476-01

Vehicle No. : GBE-B270-]

Make & Model : NMISSAN NV200 1.5 MT ABS AIRBAG 2WD GDR ES W/RC

ESTIMATED REPAIR COST DETAILS

Yd'_%’ .r‘:f/ -

Accident Date: 01/01/2018

ary DESCRIPTION REPAIR AMOUNT SURVEYOR APP.
List Item
1 TAILGATE RH A s1os3z0] X
1 AH TAILLAMP 2-"1"69 A Au gg._:‘-._g.ﬁn".u)a{"
1/ RHREAR FENDER .(_,,{ { H?/MSLEED.EG e
RH REAR FENDER ARCH GARNISH A -1 545690 )( (LT %
Sub Total $3,518.00
Discount 30% on Parts ($1,055.40)
$2,462.60
Nett ltem
1 REAR BUMPER 641. % aq 74000
1 REAR BUMPER RETAINER RH Ay $35200 —
1 REAR BUMPER RETAINER LH A1 53520 X
Sub Total $810.40 "‘ﬁ c]L
Discount 10% on Parts (581.04) “n 1 ‘ . 6 J'
$729.36
Special Nett
1 REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR 1 $360.00 X
Sub Total $360.00
Labour & Misc
TO PANEL BEAT , REAR FENDER RH, RH TAILGATE $1,200.00 c{’u:}
TO SPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREAS $1,100.00 j-o o
Sub Total $2,300.00
A
[T Gl i :.'r;';-nnm Sub Total $5,851.96 5333 y y
et i so0h P GST 7% $409.64 U
: | ) PESUY
Total $6,261.60
: , “eyihiat Prisudics” Bam
i 2= ::..W"'\""" L]

Asnnoxarhndind TF P et

. [ MO Inlurance CompiTy

iy L L=
ABWIN SERVICE

e

Fagzlofl

| BUIKTT AVENUE 4 - GATE 2, #07-48 FREMIER @ KAKI BLIKIT, SINGAPORE 415875

Company Raglstration No. 2013136856
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Vic (LKKAuto) =

From: Linda Liao <lindaliao@abwin.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 October, 2018 10:01 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: RE: GBE8270) Against SKZ4703L Date of accident : 01/01/2018 ***LKK
REF:CCB/AIG18000278/hb3

Attachments: GBES270] DV pdi

Dear Vic

Please refer to attached discharge voucher and payable to WELLBUILT PTE LTD .

Thank you
Regards

ABWINS

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

HO7-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit Gate 2
Singapore 415875

Linda Liao
Maotor Claim Executive
DID +65 6713 9417 HP:9751 9596

T +65 6713 9400 | F +65 6713 9415
YWebsite | Facebook | Linkadin

Looking to start a new business soon? Find out how we can provide you with a complete vehicle ownership solution and much
maorel

Click here to view our listing =>

From: Vic [LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@ lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 19 October, 2018 5:28 PM

To: Linda Liao <lindaliac@abwin.com.sg>

Cc: lvan Teo <ivanteo@abwin,com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vit (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBEB270) Against SKZ4703L Date of accident : 01/01/2018 ***LKK REF;CCA/AIG1B000278/hb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Linda,

We refer further to our below email.



-

Please be informed that we have our principal’s instruction to maintain our offer as per our email dated 16/08/2018.
Kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward a copy to us for payment processing.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settiement arising from the obove offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of Kability on our part or on the part of our insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should aiso not be disclased in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made In respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other reloted maotiers.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | emmall: vicalpeh@ lkkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(308933)

¥F L ==

SLSRET ST Suve the Earthe Print only whan necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged matenal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law, If you believe that you received this e-mall in efror, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the
sander thal you have deleted the e-mall, all atachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Linda Liao [mailto:lindaliao @abwin.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 5:18 PM
To: Vic [LKKAuto)

Cc: lvan Teo; Admin A
Subject: RE: GBES8270J Against SKZ4703L Date of accident : 01/01/2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18000278/hb3

Dear Vic
My client don't agree to claim on 50/50 , the owner claim that he was not fault at this incident.

Thank you
Regards

ABWIN%

Abwin Service Pte Lud

MNo. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

H#07-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit Gate 2
Singapore 415875

Linda Liao

Maotor Claim Executive

DID +65 6713 9417 HP:9751 9596

T +65 6713 9400 | F +65 6713 9415
Website | Facsbook | Linkedin

Looking to start a new business soon? Find out how we can provide you with a complete vehicle ownership solution and much
more!

Click here to view our listing ==



From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mallto.vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 16 August, 2018 3:24 PM

To: Linda Liap <lindaliap@abwin.com.sg>

Cc: lvan Teo <ivantec@abwin.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBES270) Against SKZ4703L Date of accident : 01/01/2018 ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18000278/hb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Linda,
We refer to your below emall

On a without prejudice basls and purely for an amicable settlement and without admission of liabllity to our
Insured’s part, we are of the view that this is a conflicting versions without concrete evidence to prove each parties
version. As such, we are prepared to settle your client’s claim on a 50/50 basis and we offer a global sum of
$1,540.00 (all in).

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward to us together with the Final Repair Invoice for
payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD.

Thank you.

“Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the obove offer are made on o without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an odmission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settiement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our affer made in respect of this present
matter is mode solely to resolve this matter only. No reference sholl be mode to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any ather related matters.

Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | emall: vicalpehi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | S[408933)

= == Ssve the Eartkh: Print only when necessary

This &-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the inlended reciplenl. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited. and may be a viclation of law. if you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do nol
read this e-mall or any attached tems. Please delele the e-mall and all attachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any copies thareaf Thank you



o}
ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD
A,_BWIN.m B KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4 - GATE 2
ﬂ #07-48 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875

Your Ref:
Our Ref: AC1B010005

01/08/2018 \l

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD A",
7B SHENTON WAY

#0O7-16 AIG BUILDING

SINGAPORE 079120

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT ON 01/01/2018 INVOLVING GBE-8270-) & SKZ-4703-L JURONG POINT BASEMENT CARPARK

We are authorised repair workshop for the owner of vehicle, GBE-8270-1, which was invalved in the captioned accident
with your insured's vehicle. The vehicle owner has requested and authorised us to assist him/her in presenting his claim

against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured, SKZ-4703-L, we are submitting these claims for your
consideration on behalf of the owner/driver/claimant.

1. Cost of Repalr 52,835 .50
2. 0 days Car Rental x 50.00
3. Loss of Use (4 x $200.00) SB00.00
4. Survey Fees
5. LTA Fees 57.45
6. TP/GIA Fees 5
7. Medical Fees
8. Others

[EE.OE) $3,642.95

We enciose the following documents o support the claims:-
Eﬂemlrﬁmm Bill D GIA/Palice Reportis) D Power of Attorney D Medical Bl

D Surveyor Repart D GIAJTP Search D Car Rental BIII D Witness Statement

D Coloured Photographs I:I Insurance Certificate D Others:

Kindly loak inte the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our client's claim as soon as possible.

Please note that It Is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim
[if any) of the owner/driver/claimant

Yours falthfully, <=
ABWIN SERVICE PTELTD .

h
ot
!_.
=
J,:.

LINDA LIAC

Claims Department
E-mail: lindaliao@abwin.com.sg
DID: 67139417

ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD, 8 KAK) BUKIT AVENUE 4 - GATE 2, 20728 PREMIER @ KAK| BUKIT, SINGAPORE 415875
Company Registrabon No. 2013186856
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51 UBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBIL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC6/AIGI8000278/hB3

08 JANUARY 2018

EUROKARS LEASING PTE LTD
12 SUNGE]I KADUT AVE
SINGAPORE 729648

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKZ 47031 AND GBE 8270J ON 1.1.18

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
A

Siti

Case Handler

DID: 6256 3561
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh/alkkauto.com

cc.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Depi)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
(AIG Asia Pacific — EXPRESS THIRD PARTY CLAIM)

| Weibast  Pe¢ U (“the third party claimant”)
of N1 Tuas View fi0)-1t W¥thne Pne  Cffifets ) (address),
owner  of (FESIPT (vehicle no.) hereby authorize

Tﬁ};ﬂ: o/ NERVICE P7t 17D
(“the workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or

rental and/or loss of use (“claim”) for my vehicle no. _(“F€ 5777 1 that was

damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on__ ¢ 'r;‘m"a’ II  (date) along
Juy by F’” M Basrgna Conperk (location)

involving vehicle no/s Yk 2 ¢Fad (“the accident").

| further authorize the workshop to settle the above mentioned claim in a
manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment furtherto settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in
favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my
behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar
as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Datethis  2>7'" dayof F¢lh  (month)20/F (year)

”}1 \ A S, ARG

Signed by 'l% third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop"

OO0 13



RELEASE VOUCHER
AIG Pacific - Express Claim

“We/l, ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for $$1.540.00
(Global Sum - all in) for vehicle no. GBE 8270] that was damaged pursuant to the accident which

occurred on 01/01/2018 (date) along JURONG POINT CAR PARK (location) involving vehicle
no/s SKZ 4703L. This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 27/02/2018 (date) at “the

warkshop™.

We/l confirm that we/T are/am authorized by the owner WELLBUILT PTE LTD (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. GBE 8270] make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have
full authority to settle the matter on histher behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein
the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that "the third party claimant™
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to GBE
 8270] (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this 25 (day)of ___[J_ ] (month) 2018 (year)

k ||I ‘-arl'l:-l'l'l __-:' e ..:I...I:-_r:_
\>- CAS Sy Lk
Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the-workshop" (with chop)

peymgnt o WLUbalt Fre L2

NE(LE Mike



a ABWIN SERVICE PTE (1D
o § WAK) BLIIT AVENUE 4 - GATE 2

ABWIN 1% FOT-A8 PRENNER & CAK BUKT
- SINGAPORE 415875

Tel: 67139400, Fan: 07138415
Co Reg. Mo J01318685C, G57 No - 201118685

INVOICE
To: WELLBUILT PTELTD Inwoice No.: PACIB010005
181 YUNG SHENG ROAD Involce Date: 01/08/2018
B05-97 Our Ref.: AC1801000%
SINGAPORE 610181 Date of Accident: 01/01/2018
Vehicle No.: GRE-B270-)
Make: NIS5AN
Model: NV200 1.5 MT ABS AIRBAG 2WD
GDR E5 W/RC
S/N |DESCRIPTION aTy AMOUNT (55}
1 |BEING COST OF REPAIR TO ABOVEMENTIONED VEHICLE FOR ACCIDENT ON 1 52,650.00
01/01/2018 AT JURONG POINT BASEMENT CARPARY
|
rHEmarhs:
SUB TOTAL 52,650.00
7% GST $185.50
TOTAL 52,835.50
Payment by chegue should be crossed and made payable 1o ABWIN ABWIN SERVICE PTE LTD
SERVICE FTE LTD - -
'I- -l i
{] '
Authorised Signature

Opg=lafl
ARWIN SERVICE PTE LTD, B RAR BUKT AVENUE & - GATE 2, 80748 PREMIER @ CAK) BURTT SINGAPORE 415875

Comparny Neglstration No. 2013 1B8N5E



Receipt Page 1 of |

Land Transport Authority

Land Transpor Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701
GST Registration No. - M4-0008529-2
Print Date/Time : 04 Jan 2018 / 13:38:28

Receipt Date/Time : 04 Jan 2018 / 13:38:28

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. © ITNET-00000-180104-001075

Previous Receipt No.
SI/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S§) (55) (S5)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - SKZ4703L

As at 01 Jan 2018/16:00.00

Insurance Co: AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enqguiry - SKZ4T03L

Enquiry Fee 700 048 748
20180104133707026615
Sub-Total 700 049 749
Total Before Rounding 7.00 048 749
Rounding Difference 0 Da
Total Amount Payable 745
Paid By
3882 Cradit Card 745
VisaMasterCard
Total TAS
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amouni 745
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settied by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.

Print Recaipt | OK | Save as PDF

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/completePayment?FUNCTION_ID=F1301001TT 4/1/2018
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastimne

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING - o

| Case  [Notfied Est Submnifted Adj Assigned | Ad) Rpt | Ad) Sutimirted Tns Auth'ed Status

‘ way |05 a0 2018 JIEINE se265000  5$2,650.00 ey e

| :M Eﬂm“l [-:l!:niml H'H-Iul wcml |

Main Relerence Claim Details

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS __|[Created by adjuster]

[insured: Eurokars Leasing Pte Ltd, Co. Reg. No. 199200636

I,':*.',':m,_ WELLBUILT PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No. 200921271H

Vehicle Reg. . |01/01/2018 16:00 - ;59
Na.: GBEB270) Date of Los: | 3 months and 26 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yrl]

Claim Type: | TP f 0743448565506 Hote H?UH |"I : )

Palicy Mo,
SKZAaTOIL (Ca i | 507866 147T6-01
—— Euxcess:
Abwin Service Pte Ltd (HQ) No. B Kakl Bukit Avenue 4, #07-48 Premier@Kaki Bulit Gate 2, 415875 Kakl Bukit - Tel; 6713 9400
AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express) - Tel: 65-6410.3000 .. [Handied by Kesaval, Jaclyn-M|
Jactyn-M.Kesaval@aig.com

NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case Mai |

There are no mail for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™

view All | Search Tasks | Cronte Mew Task | compiete |

Due Date  Priority Type Task Group  Subject Handler  Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
MO results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp... 25/10/2018



Menimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*GBEB270) (07434465655G)
[SKZ4a703L]
™
WELLBUILT PTE LTD
Jan 1 2018 4:00PM
[Eurokars Leasing Pte Ltd]
Abwin Service Pte Ltd

Page | of 2

Lﬂ:u!mrmm - 1;1!@ |
[No_| Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
{1 |(Dran) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown [ T
Photos/Images o Doerpage  [v] M
[No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail| Print
1 |77/02/18 18:41 Chassis Number | €Y | toacws | BA
(2 |z7yo2/18 38:41 General View o 0 | edws | 4
|:|__ 27/02/18 18:41 | Odometer Reading 0| leirs | A
|4 |27/02/18 18:41 General View i Load 775G | BA
|5 27/02/18 18:41 | General View O | ows | (A
6 (27018 18:41 | General View 0O | lcadwc | A
7 127/02/18 18:41 | General View © | adwc | 4
8 27/02/18 18:41 General View O | e B
9 270218 18:41 | General View 0 | cadec | A
10 |27/02/18 1841 | General View O | e wc | B
;1; 27/02/18 18:41 lﬂ“ﬂ\‘hﬁ B 0O wars | A
12 |27/02/18 18:41 | Genersl View O | iaws | A

' 13 | 77/02/18 18:41 | General View 0D  weawc | A
|u 27/02/18 18:41 | Genersl View O | weerwc | 2
15 | 29/02/18 18:41 | General View 0  weaws | B
16 |27/02/18 18:41 | General View 0 | ediec | A
(17 (27/02/18 18:41 | General View D | tdwes | A
[18 [27/02/18 18:41 | General View © | Laws | BB |
118 [27/02/18 18:41 | General View O | weawrs | A
(20 27/02/18 18:41 | General View O | csawc | M
l21 |27/02/18 18:41 | Ganaral View O wwrs | @
{22 [27/02/18 18:41 Ganeral View © | weawrs | BA
23 (2702718 18:41 | General View | ) | oadiec | A
24 |27/02/18 18:41 General View | @ | eews | A
Doeumentation - 1 I~] BA
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print.
1 O4/03/18 18:16 | TP GIA REPORT @ | Load FOF

2 09/M01/180%:26 | LETTER TO O1 s Load POF

'3_ 2\_&"!!_2." 18 18:52 TP ESTIMATE- HARKED o Load PDF

4 [1B/08/1E 1526  SMS EXCHANGE BETWEEN DRIVERS FROM TP g Load PDF

5 25/10/1812:17  WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF B
6 25/10/1812:17  AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM ! Load FDF

7 125/10/18 12:17 | Release Voucher Load POF

8 |25/10/1812:17 | LTA SEARCH . Lied FOF

[No |Finaized on AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G] Thumbnail| Print

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do... 25/10/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

|l.¢|:_nn.!wm - = iperpage [~1| B
[No_|Finahized On LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid (HQ) Thumbnail| Print|
i |05/01/18 08:32 01 GIA repart - - | LoadPoF |

Documents Checklist

Show Remarks To: L] Handiing Insurer
ot Barmaris are Sreviie uniess o a8 U0 oTher perlies

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_do... 25/10/2018



Preview Page 1 of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|\Fehi¢ln No: SKZ4T03L (Insd veh) Model: ISSAN NV200 1.5 D ABS
GBEB270J (TP veh) RBAG 2WD EDR (M)
[Date of Accident: |01/01/2018
Global Sum Settiement || [X] Yes [ [ ] No
Repair Estimate 5 5,337.91|
Final Repair Cost 5 1.540.00
Loss of Use s 4,00 days at $60.00 per day
Rental (if any) ' 5 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee 5
Cthers! 5
5
Final Settiement Sum (Global Sum) 5 1.540.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ | YES [X ] NO  (Kindly indicate
petow)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 50 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assassad Liability (*). (%)
" Assessed Liabilily ta be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nat apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) | Wellbuill Pte Ltd - 8 1,540.00
2) 5
3 B

25 Oct
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
{Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill {if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 25/10/2018



Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (Co Reg Mo 163607 168R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Page | of 4

Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Emall sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@|kkauto com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCB/AIG1B000278/UHB302
25/10/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer:  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No:
G aimant Vehicle sesz704 Insured Vehicle No:  SKZ4703L
Dale of Loss: 01012018 Mature of Claim: i Claim No: 074344858556
DESCRIFTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: GBES8270J
Make & Mode!: NISSAN NV200, 1.5 D ABS AIRBAG 2WD 60DR (M) Engine No. KIKC400D055416
Reg Date 06/04/2016 (Man. Year. 2015) Chassis No: VSKYBAMZOZD123670
Colour, Grey Odometer: 93071 km
Engine Capacity: 1481 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S%): Market Value/New Car Price
[Tl F VEH T
General Condition: Slearing (Serviceable) Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification Pre-accident Condition;
CONDITION OF TYRES
From Tyre Size: 185/85 R14 Rear Tyre Size: 18565 R14
Front Left Side: Yellowsea & mm Rear Left Side; Yellowsea 6 mm
Front Right Side: Yellowsea & mm Rear Right Side: Yellowsea & mm
The above values epresent the emsining fyre freads deplh
COST OF CLAIMS _ Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference Diff %)
Parts 362328 2,032.16 1.591.12 439
Miscellansous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.300.00 1,300.00 1,000.00 43.48
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total [S§) 5.923.28 3,332.16 259112 43.74
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 2,650.00
(55) 502328 2,650.00 327328 5526
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 414.63 185.50 229.13 5526
Nett Amount (S5) 6,337.91 2,835.50 3,502.41 55.26
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x $560.00/day) (55) 240.00
(S8) 3,075.50
Liable Amount (50.00%) (S§) 1,537.75
+ Doc/Search Fee (55) 7.45
Nett Liability (S$) 1,545.20
Global Sum Sattlement (S§5) 1,540.00
INSPECTION

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 25/10/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Date of Assignment: 271022018

Date Inspected: 270272018 Inspected At Abwin Service Ple Lid (HQ)
No. B Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #0748
Premier@Kaki Bukil Gate 2
Singapore 415875

Estimated Period of Repair. 4.0 days

Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE: This report represents our findings af the time ang place of inapsction sisded hevain Such inspechon has been carmed oulf 1o the best of our
knawiedge and atuity but any other fability under amy offier circumatances i hamby axpressly exciuged.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 25/10/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *TAILGATE RH Mot Necassary 1.053.70FL *-FL
2 1 *RH REAR FENDER Badly Dented / Buckled 1.65080FL *1.650.B0FL
3 1 *RH REAR FENDER ARCH GARNISH Nat Necessary 458 80 FL *-FL
4 1 *RH TAILLAMP Broken A58 BOFM *255.60FN
5 1 *REAR BUMPER Defarmed T40.00FN  *6B3.20FN
B 1 *REAR BUMPER RETAINER RH Bent I520FN *35.20FN
7T 01 *REAR BUMPER RETAINER LH Not Necessary 35.20FN *-FN
B 1 *REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR Not Necessary 360.00FS “-F5

F=Franchise part. S=5Spchetl L=ListitemDisc N=NattliemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 4,688.40 2,624.80

= List Item Discount on L items 30.00/30.00% (S§) 048 42 49524

= Nett Item Discount on N ltems 10,00/10.00% (5%) 116.70 97.40

Total Parts (55) 3,623.28 2,032.16

[ Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. |

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen... 25/10/2018



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous ilems selocted.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO PANEL BEAT REAR FENDER RH ,RH TAILGATE New 1,200.00 800.00

2  TOSPRAY PAINT ON AFFECTED AREAS New 1,100.00 500.00
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 2.300.00 1,300.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseachion=gen... 25/10/2018



