Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July, 2018 2:35 PM

To: Natarajan Kavidha Rajan; Bodyshop; Wong Guo Xiang

Cc: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid; SUR; Taufikh (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto);
Admin A

Subject: RE: Finalise - SLB4660R LKK REF CC4/LPC18000251/T1hs3

Attachments: 20180703123149376.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Kavi,

Noted with thanks.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EIES

i, -

" Save the Larth Print only whern necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Natarajan Kavidha Rajan [mailto:natarajan.k.rajan@simedarby.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July, 2018 12:35 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Bodyshop; Wong Guo Xiang

Cc: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid; SUR; Taufikh (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: Finalise - SLB4660R LKK REF CC4/LPC18000251/T1hs3

Dear Vic,
Please find attached signed copy for your perusal. The original document has been courier to your office today.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,
Ms.Kavidha (kavi)
Assistant Executive
Tel : +65 64777364



Fax : +65 64777398
Email : natarajan.k.rajan @simedarby.com.sg

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, June 20, 2018 4:44 PM

To: Bodyshop; Wong Guo Xiang

Cc: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid; SUR; Taufikh (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Natarajan Kavidha Rajan; BIE ©;
Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalise - SLB4660R LKK REF CC4/LPC18000251/T1hs3

Without Prejudice
Dear Kavi,
We refer further to our below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of liability to our Insured’s
part. We have our principal’s mandate and we confirmed acceptance of your offer of $25,695.07 (all in) to settle
your client’s claim.

Kindly let the owner sign the attached DV and forward to us (LKK) the original signed hard copy for payment
processing.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ETES e
SR RS= i Suve the Larth: Frint only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 20 April, 2018 2:30 PM

To: Bodyshop; Wong Guo Xiang

Cc: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid; SUR; Taufikh (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Natarajan Kavidha Rajan; Admin A;
Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalise - SLB4660R LKK REF CC4/LPC18000251/T1hs3

Without Prejudice



Dear Kavi,
We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ESES

SERER NWTT Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Bodyshop [mailto:bodyshop@simedarby.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 20 April, 2018 10:06 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Wong Guo Xiang

Cc: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid; SUR; Taufikh (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Natarajan Kavidha Rajan
Subject: RE: Finalise - SLB4660R LKK REF CC4/LPC18000251/T1hs3

Dear Vik,
Please find attached documents for your reference.
We will mail the originals to your office.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Kavidha Rajan (Kavi)

Assistant Executive for Accident & Insurance Claims
Tel : +65 64777364

Fax : +65 64777398

Email : natarajan.k.rajan@simedarby.com.sg

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, March 26, 2018 9:14 AM

To: Wong Guo Xiang

Cc: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid; Natarajan Kavidha Rajan; SUR; Taufikh (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng
(LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalise - SLB4660R LKK REF CC4/LPC18000251/T1hs3

Without Prejudice

Dear Guo Xiang,



We refer to your below email.
We confirmed COR @ $23,115.02 with 12 DAYS.
Kindly forward the LOD to us (LKK) for direct settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

B 7d P
SR RSR i Suve the Larth: Frint only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Wong Guo Xiang [mailto:wong.guo.xiang@simedarby.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 15 March, 2018 11:09 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid; Natarajan Kavidha Rajan; SUR; Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: Finalise - SLB4660R

Dear Vic,
Any update regarding the finalise?

Thank you.

Regards,

Wong Guo Xiang

Customer Service Advisor

AutoFrance (PEUGEOT) |/ Regent Motors (FORD)
c/o Vantage Automotive Limited

DID: 6477 7409 HP. 8383 3190

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February, 2018 8:46 AM

To: Wong Guo Xiang <wong.guo.xiang@simedarby.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid <shabir.abdul.hamid@simedarby.com.sg>; Natarajan Kavidha Rajan




<natarajan.k.rajan@simedarby.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Finalise - SLB4660R

Dear Guo Xiang,

Thank you for email case handler is Vic.

Dear Vic,

CC4/LPC18000251/T1hs3

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wong Guo Xiang [mailto:wong.guo.xiang@simedarby.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2018 8:43 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Mohamed Shabir Abdul Hamid <shabir.abdul.hamid@simedarby.com.sg>; Natarajan Kavidha Rajan
<natarajan.k.rajan@simedarby.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Finalise - SLB4660R

Dear Taufikh,
Please find the attached finalise for your reference.

COR:$23,115.02
12 working days

https://www.dropbox.com/sh/syowyagbjrcmy3je/AADNzPC1A3ygK MxzF11jz9wa?dI=0

Regards,

Wong Guo Xiang

Customer Service Advisor

AutoFrance (PEUGEOT) /  Regent Motors (FORD)
c/o Vantage Automotive Limited

DID. 6477 7409 HP. 8383 3190

“This electronic mail content and any accompanying attachments ("the Message") is intended only for the named
addressee ("the Recipient") and may contain information that is confidential, privileged and/or proprietary to the
Sime Darby group of companies ("Sime Darby") and/or protected under applicable laws. If you are not the intended
Recipient, you are strictly prohibited from using, disseminating, forwarding and/or printing the Message. Please
notify the sender immediately by return e-mail and permanently delete all copies of the Message. Sime Darby
disclaims all liability for any error, loss or damage arising from the Message being infected by computer virus or
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other malicious software. Any views and/or opinions expressed in the Message are solely those of the author's and
do not necessarily represent those of Sime Darby's.”



