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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Kelvin Li <kalphine@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 21 March, 2018 9:26 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Michelle Chew

Subject: Re: CC4/AIG18000233/hb3 _ SLS 9916G AND SLK 7337H ON 30.12.17

Dear all, 

 

I wish to enquire if there are any updates to this case? Thank you. 

 

Regards, 

Kelvin 

 

On 7 February 2018 at 21:42, Kelvin <kalphine@gmail.com> wrote: 

To whom it may concern,  

 

I received your letter dated 1st February. Please advise on the claim amount. If possible I wish to settle 

outside of the insurance. Thank you. 

 

Kelvin  

Sent from my iPhone 

 

On 15 Jan 2018, at 8:50 AM, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Kelvin, 

  

We refer to your below email. 

  

If you refer to settle the third party claim privately to protect your NCD, yes. 

  

However, at the time being, we do not have the finalized amount to how much the total claim is. 

  

Kindly lodge an accident report asap to any authorize reporting centre by AIG for record purposes. 

  

We do not suggest any private settlement if there is a potential personal injury claim from the other 

party. 
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You may call us should you have further clarification on this matter. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use 
or distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you 
received this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and 
all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all 
attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

  

  

From: Kelvin Li [mailto:kalphine@gmail.com]  

Sent: Friday, 12 January, 2018 10:37 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: CC4/AIG18000233/hb3 

  

Dear Vic, 

  

May I enquire if it is possible for me to make the above claim (reference subject title) by 

myself instead of going through AIG insurance? Thank you. 

  

Regards, 

Kelvin 
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