Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 15 January, 2018 3:20 PM

To: YINSIEW.KON@MBMWHEELPOWER.COM.SG

Cc: 'danny.ong’; 'Kenneth'; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD - Accident involving SFC6638J and SKT3021J along Jalan Boon Lay on
29.12.2017 ***LKK REF:CC4/AIG18000173/Khb3

Attachments: SFC6638J - LOD.pdf

Dear Yin Siew,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Dear Vi,

For your information and necessary action please.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: yinsiew.kon@mbmwheelpower.com.sg [mailto:yinsiew.kon@mbmwheelpower.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 15 January 2018 2:32 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'danny.ong' <danny.ong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>; 'Kenneth' <kenneth@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>
Subject: RE: LOD - Accident involving SFC6638J and SKT3021J along Jalan Boon Lay on 29.12.2017

Dear all,
Please ignore my previous attachment.
Re-attached the LOD for your necessary action.

Thank you.

Best regards,

Yin Siew | Claim Officer
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Email: yinsiew.kon@mbmwheelpower.com.sg




MBM Wheelpower Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive « #06-02
Sin Ming AutoCity * Singapore 575722

www.mbmwheelpower.com.sg

From: yinsiew.kon@mbmwheelpower.com.sg [mailto:yinsiew.kon@mbmwheelpower.com.sg]

Sent: 13 January 2018 11:33

To: 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'danny.ong' <danny.ong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>; 'Kenneth' <kenneth@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>
Subject: LOD - Accident involving SFC6638J and SKT3021J along Jalan Boon Lay on 29.12.2017

Your Ref: SKT3021J
Our Ref : SFC6638J / WIP 28234

Dear all,

We would like to append our losses from you.

As the insurer of your insured driver’s negligence driving for the above accident.

Enclosed herewith the scan copy of our letter of demand and supporting documents for your perusal.
Kindly look into the matter and revert the claim settlement to us as soon as possible.

To expedite this claim, please reply to us by email.

Best regards,
Yin Siew | Claim Officer
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