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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 20 March 2018 11:13 AM
To: 'hai-chuan.ng@aig.com'
Subject: RE: Claim No: 4504611096SG *LKK REF: CC4/LCR18000147/Kps3 [ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING SLL 7939R(OI - LCR) & SKV 4896J(TP) ON 07/12/2017]
Attachments: 20171207_152014.jpg; 20171207_152027.jpg

Hi Mr Ng, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL 7939R(OI - LCR) & SKV 4896J(TP) ON 07/12/2017 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Third party reported that he was traveling at the 2nd lane along Aljunied road turning right into Geylang 
road. Suddenly, our insured driver who was on his right lighted up her left signal light and went straight 
without checking as resulted the accident. 
 
Our insured driver reported that she was turning right to Geylang road, suddenly third party swiped across 
her left portion and collided onto her car. 
 
Third party had submitted accident scene photos for our consideration. Based on the accident scene 
photos and the position of both vehicles, we are of the opinion that third party version is more probable. 
The position of our insured vehicle seems that she is attempting to travel straight. If our insured driver was 
making a right turn, the position of her car is likely same as the car(pink colour) behind of our insured 
vehicle. 
 
In view of the above, we would like to propose to settle the matter at best. 
 
For your comments/instruction please. 
 
 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
 

From: Ng, Hai-Chuan [mailto:Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com]  
Sent: Monday, 15 January 2018 12:03 PM 
To: Zayyer (LKKAuto) <zayyer@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) 
<vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Claim No:4504611096SG 
 
Dear all, 
 
We refer to the above. 
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Please advise liability before settlement. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Regards, 
 
 
Ng Hai Chuan 
AIG 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
 
78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120 
 
Tel +(65)6419 1994| Fax +68357416  
 
Hai-Chuan.Ng@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE: 
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential.  If you are not the intended 
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information.  If you have received this email in error, 
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies 
or printouts thereof.  Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or 
other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the 
responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for 
any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
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