Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 23 February 2018 9:39 AM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKK6754E (Ol : LPC - TBA) AND

SHD8519C (TP : LKK REF - CC3/LPC18000114/K1jb3 ) on 01.01.2018

Dear Irene,

Kindly proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 22 February, 2018 3:18 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MTC; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKK6754E (OI : LPC - TBA) AND SHD8519C (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/LPC18000114/K1jb3 ) on 01.01.2018

Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020311

Dear Mr. Gerald,

This is moving out from the parking lot scenario where our insured driver was the one who moved out. (Bola
24,100% against our insured).

Liability is not in our favour.

Summary to offer to repairer M/s COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED OUR REVISED
TO OFFER
Cost of Repairs + 7% GST S 3,456.36 (per estimate) S 3,356.50
Loss of Rental $  500.00 ($125 x 4 days) S 500.00
Loss of Income S 320.00 ($80 x 4 days) S 200.00 (S50 x 4 days)
GIA/LTA Search Fee S 7.49 S 7.49
TOTAL $ 4,283.85 $ 4,063.99

Relevant supporting claim documents attached for your perusal and reference.



For your approval.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the: material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 4 January 2018 9:13 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> )

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKK6754E (Ol : LPC - TBA) AND SHD8519C (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/LPC18000114/K1jb3 ) on 01.01.2018

Our Ref :17/18/18/VP05/020311
Dear Shu Pei,

We attached a copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 January, 2018 7:25 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKK6754E (OI : LPC - TBA) AND SHD8519C (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/LPC18000114/K1jb3 ) on 01.01.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHD 8519C at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering
Pte Ltd.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:



- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
< TP’s GIA report

Our case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



COMFORIDELGRO
OurRef : CC18010006 / SHD8519C /KS(st) ENGINEERING

Date j 16-Jan-18 CDGE Taxi Claims Dept _
59 Loyang Drive 4th Fir
Lonpac Insurance Bhd Singapore 508969

300 Beach Road
#17-04 1 07, The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Attn : Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHD8519C YOUR INSURED
SKK6754E AND OTHER ON 01.01.18

We are the authorised repair workshop for Citycab Pte Ltd, the owner of motor Vehicle No :

SHD8519C which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured
vehicle. The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized
us to assist them in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all
applicable matters arising from the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving :  SKK6754E
we are submitting these claims for your consideration on behalf of the claimants.

TAXI OWNER’S CLAIM

1 Cost of Repair $ 3,356.50

2 4 days Loss of Rental @$ 125.00 per day $ 500.00

3 Survey Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK ) $ -

4  LTA Search Fees $ 7.49

5  GIA/Police Report Fees $ 4

6  Towing / Medical / Transporation Fees $ -

SubTotal: $ 3,863.99

HIRER'S CLAIM

7 4 days Loss of Income @3 80.00 perdays $ 320.00
Total Claims: $ 4,183.99

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a) Original repair bill and photostat photographs : - pcs.

b) LTA search slip/s of ; SKK6754E

¢) GIA/ Police report/s of : SHD8519C

d) Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
(. ) Witness statement/s ( ) Driver's Income Tax ( ) Certificate of Insurance
( X ) Photograph/s of Accident Scene ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record ( x ) Rental Rate letter

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settliement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver. This condition shall apply even if medical

Yours faithfully

Kazali Hj Selahudin

Deputy Manager

CDGE Taxi Claims Department

Tel: 6214 8736 Fax: 6214 1843 Email: kazali@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

A member of

COMFORIDELGRO




CDG.VARS.V.LettofAuthorisation ] Page 1 of 1

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(NAF / PAF)
. ACCIDENT INVOLVING i40 SHD8519C , SKK 6754E ON 01-Jan-18 14:15
ALONG OPEN AIR CARPARK IN FRONT EMERGENCY UNIT, TAN TACK SENG HOSPIT...
1/ We KOH GUAN TECK ROY (Hirer) NRIC No.: S1331847F
and/or (Relief) NRIC No.:

Taxi Number SHD8519C
hereby authorise ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd(CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, including loss of income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs.

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settlement or compensation amount in respect of my/our claim
against third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher on my/our behalf.
4. To accept any payment (claim proceeds) in respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque

shall be forward directly to CDGE in accordance with CDGE's instruction and made in favour of
"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd".

Date 02-Jan-2018

Name of Hirer KOH GUAN TECK ROY

Hirer NRIC S1331847F Signature :

\
=,

| —""ﬁ .
| Address 142 LORONG AH SOO #13-247
' 530142

Contact No. 93387479

htp://edeek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/View/CNDG . VARS V.1 ettof 02/01/2018



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO :17/18/18/VP05/020311
DATE : 23 February 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/We, CITYCAB PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of SKK 6754E the sum of Singapore Dollars
Four Thousand & Sixty Only ($4,060.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation
and discharge of property claim competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of property claim sustained by me/us whether now or
hereafter to become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident to
my/our vehicle, SHD 8519C on 01 JANUARY 2018 along TAN TOCK SENG
OPEN AIR CAR PARK

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (NG HOCK KOON/LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any
person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S
COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our

insured’ Sﬁvery action. - e n

Name of vehicle ouﬁﬁléi‘ ate’

e
@ity

Ple Feres i
case for T cheque made payable to:-

GCOM rafiliLJI_L#‘I'iJ‘ ENGINEERING PTE LTD

it and 2opfcation of this [?‘-}‘-?Tﬁmv:af



COMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

A member of COMFORIDELGRO

GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE Sroa b TRy o
8010042
VEHCLE NO INV. NO/DATE
LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD SHD8519C 91351224 12.01.2018
#17-04 / 07 THE CONCOURSE
MAKE JOB NO
300 BEACH ROAD HYUNDATI 305102877
SINGAPORE SG 199555
B MODEL ODOMETER READING
CONTACT NO: 62507388 I1-40 RS,
DATE OF REG DATE/TIME IN
07.04.2016 02.01.2018 10:05
- CHASSIS CODE
. Description : 3P 01.01.2018 KMHLB41UMGUQO87416
S/No Part No. Qty Unit Price %Disc Net
PART REQUISITION
0001 03-01-0103-0099 T40V2 SHOCK ABSORBER ASSY 1 342.20 20.00 2 6
0002 04-01-0103-0658  I40VC CAP ASSY-WHEEL HUB 1 150.70 20.00 €
0003 04-01-0103-0574 I40VC PANEL-FENDER LH# i 619.00 20.00 95. 20
0004 04-01-0103-0593 1I40VC PANEL ASSY-FR DR LH 1 1,403.00 20.00 22.4
0005 28-01-0103-0007 (I40)FRT DOCOR LOGO CCTPL 1 75.00 0.00
SUB-TOTAL : 2,086.92
JOB NATURE
0001 20-05 RENEW ADVERTISMENT STICKER- 200.00 200.00
0002 L PANEL BEATING 400.00 400,00
0003 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA 360.00 360.0

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

A member of COMFORIDELCRO

ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.

Head Office:
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701

8010042

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested.
CUSTOMER’S COPY




COMFORIDELGRO  Engineering |
ENGINEERING
A member of COMFORIDELGRO
COMPANY REG. NO.: 199506048W
GST REG. NO. M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE ?-;1(_‘15—‘-: A
8010042
) - VEHCLE NO INV. NO/DATE
LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD SHD8519C 91351224 12.01.2018
#17-04 / 07 THE CONCOURSE
MAKE JOB NO.
300 BEACH ROAD HYUNDAI 305102877
SINGAPORE SG 199555
MODEL ODOMETER READING
CONTACT NO: 62507388 I-40 o _
DATE OF REG " DATE/TIME IN
07.04.2016 02.01.2018 10;05
CHASSIS CODE
KMHLB41UMGU087416
S/No Part No. Qty Unit Price 3%Di Net
0004 17-01 CHECK ALL LIGHTING 20.00 20.00
0005 20-00 TUFF COAT ON AFFECTED PARTS. 20.00 20.(
0006 20-02 REMOVE/REFIX DOOR PARTS TO ASSIST REP 50.00 50.00
SUB-TOTAL 1,050.00
Items total 13€
Add GST @ 7.000 % 21
Invoice amount 3,356.50
Issued by : CHEWBEELENG 12.01.2018 13:44:56
Repalr tg : CFS0/57/57
Paymﬁnt ype/Term: /Credit 30 days

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
A member of COMFORIDELGRD

Head Office:
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701

Kindly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested.
CUSTOMER’S COPY

ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No.

8010042 91351224

AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.




Our Ref:  CC18010006
\Q o CityCab

Date: 10 January 2018

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 01/01/2018 @ 14:15 hrs

ALONG OPEN AIR CARPARK IN FRONT EMERGENCY UNIT,
TAN TACK SENG HOSPITAL.

INVOLVING SKK 6754E

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that CityCab Pte Ltd is
the registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration number SHD8519C (the
"Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to KOH GUAN TECK ROY IC NO S1331847F a registered
hirer-operator of CityCab Pte Ltd at the time of occurrence of the aforementioned
accident at a rental rate $125.00 per day (inclusive of GST).

Please be advised that the Taxi was insured with First Capital Insurance Ltd on a
third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

settlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Executive, Fleet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +65 6555 1188 Facsimile +65 6453 3183
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1/2/2018  https:/ivrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/hubCurrentTransactionLogs?FUNCTION_ID=F1801001ET&dispatch=logoff&param=110%2706ba70ecab4. .

https://

Goh Cheng Chuan Andrew Cornelius has successfully logged out.

Your last login date and time was 02 Jan 2018, 12:14:40.
Toreturn to ONE.MOTORING, please click here

For security reasons, please CLEAR YOUR CACHE after each session.

Session Transaction History

S/No.Asset Type AssetID  Asset
Owner ID

1 Vehicle

=

2 Vahicle

SKH8240Z -

SKK6754E -

vrl Ita.gov sa/ltalvrl/action/hubCurrentTransactionl ogs?FUNCTION 1D=F1801001ET&dispatch=loqoff&param=110%2706ha70ecaf4lf7 3k

Transaction Type Transaction

Amount(5$)
18.32 Insurance Enquiry (GIRO 7 4902 Jan 2018/
Payment) "712:15:28
18.32 Insurance Enquiry (GIRO 7.4902 Jan 2018/
Payment) 12:14:56

Log Date/Time




