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Zaini (LKK Auto)

From: T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd <tntautoservices@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 12 February 2018 3:05 PM
To: Zaini (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: Your Ref: 1217-1347_ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 3912T & SLN 7803M ON 

28/12/2017

Hi Zaini, 
 
We hereby confirmed acceptance your offer $5,315.45 for settlement of the said claim. 
 
Please forward us the Discharge Voucher as soon as possible. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards. 
 
 
Vincent Tan 
T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd 
Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 6861 
Hp: 9145 9776 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
  
  
  
 
On 12 February 2018 at 15:00, Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Your Ref: 1217-1347                                           

Our Ref: CC6/EQI18000110/Kka3 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 3912T & SLN 7803M ON 28/12/2017 

  



2

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose settlement as follows: - 

  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 4,708.00 
2. Loss of Rental(6days x $100.00) $    600.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        7.45 

TOTAL $ 5,315.45 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability 
on our part or on the part of our insured/driver.  Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) 
in respect of the accident.  Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only.  No reference 
shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters. 

  

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher 
(for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant.  Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have 
made payment on the settlement sum.” 

  

Best Regards, 

Zaini Kusaini | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2132 | email: Zaini@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Zaini (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 6 February 2018 2:47 PM 
To: 'T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd' <tntautoservices@gmail.com> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving XD3912T / SLN7803M on 28/12/2017 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  


