Zaini (LKK Auto)

e
From: T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd <tntautoservices@gmail.com=>
Sent: Monday, 12 February 2018 3:05 PM
To: Zaini (LEK Auto)
Subject: Re: Your Rel: 1217-1347_ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 39127 & SLM 7803M ON
28/12/2017

Hi Zaini,

We hereby confirmed acceptance your offer $5.315.45 for settlement of the said claim.
Please forward us the Discharge Youcher as soon as possible,

Thank you.

Best Regards.

Vincent Tan

T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd

Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 6861
Hp: 9145 9776

On 12 February 2018 at 15:00, Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zainif@lkkauto.com= wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: 1217-1347

Cur Ref: CC6/ECI1B000110/Kka3

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 3912T & SLN 7803M ON 28/12/2017



We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) 5 4,708.00
2. Loss of Rental(6days x 5100.00) 5 600.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee 5 7.45

TOTAL §5,315.45

Please confirm acceptance.

*Please note that our above setilement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability
on our part or on the part of our insuredddriver, Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s)
in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference
shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher
{for settlement sum above S20,000/-) by the PlaintiffClaimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have
made payvment on the seitlement sum,”

Ldini Kusainl | Toze Handles

LEK Aute Consultants Ple Ltd

LD sB41-2132 | email: IginiBlkkowlg.com | fox; §741-4108

Blk 51, Payvalbl industnal Park, Ul Avenue |, #02-25 | S[408923)

From: Zaini (LKK Auta)

Sent: Tuesday, 6 February 2018 2:47 PM

To: 'T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd' <tntautoservices@egmail.com=>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving XD3912T / SLN7803M on 28/12/2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive
#(18-14 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722
Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 686
GST Registration No: 200010712E

Email: tntautoservices/@gmail.com

Date: 12" January 2018
Our Ref: 1217-1347
Your Ref:

Attn: The Motor Claims Department

EQ Insurance Company Ltd

5 Maxwell Road

#17-00 Tower Block, MND Complex

Singapore 069110

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD3912T / SLN7803M ON 28/12/2017

Please refer to the above-mentioned accident,

We are writing on behalf of M/s Yeng Kok Wey, the registered owner of motor vehicle no:
SLNT803M which was involved in the above accident,

We are instructed that the above accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence

of your insured's vehicle no: XD3912T. As a result of which, our client have suffered loss
and expenses.

We are instructed by our client to claim for:-

|. Cost of Repair (inclusive of 7% GST) S54.708.00
2. Loss of Rental (6 Days Inclusive Sunday) S5 720,00
3. LTA Search 5% 7.45

TOTAL (585.43545

We enclosed hereby the following documents for vour consideration:
(a) Original Tax Invoice

(b) GIA Report lodged by our driver

{c) Owner & Driver I/C/Driving Licence

{d) Certificate of Insurance

(e) LTA Search

(f) Rental Agreement

Kindly acknowledge receipt of the above said documents and vour favourable reply is greatly
appreciated.

Yours faithfully,

T & T Auto Services _I‘-'l_a;__L;d

Vincent Tan




¥ W77 Chm

S1UBEAVE 1 #0025 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (063) 62363560 FAN @ (o3 67414

Cur Rel: CCH/EQITISON0T1IWK a3
(19 FEBRUARY 2018

RANG LOGISTICS P/L

20 GUL WAY

VR

SINGAPORE 629196

ATTN: HR / MANAGEMENT

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 39127 AND SLLN 7803M ON 28.12.2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or vour authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (208 for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully.

Zaini
Case Handler
DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108
Email: Zainijlkkauto.com

[t o3 EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
(Maotor Claims Dept)
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Dear Sirs,
eEad 0 o WEY
CLAIMANT: A

ACCIDENT INVOLVING XD 29117  AND Stk 78t ON !.-a"]-'l["f

AT CALTONMENT  Linke Towpesy  lCeprel E=Ph

oo . \nrgd !
I/ We, lepg  lcoe W , am/are the registered owner of motor
car no. sLd 180

Please note that 1 have assigned all compensation monies due to me/us in the above said accident
to M/S T & T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

[/We, hereby authorize you to release all compensation monies pertaining to the above-
mentioned accident to M/S T & T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD and forward your settlement
cheque to M/S T & T AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD whom I had authorized to collect the said

compensation monies.

Thank you.
.III'E \_X \“‘-‘L\“ s - _'f-'_“
Signature of Claimant Witness By . e

Date: l |\ ﬁ ) Date: _ -, |-



T & T Auto Services Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive
#08-14 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722
Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 6861
GST Registration No: 200910712E

TAX INVOICE
EQ Insurance Company Ltd DATE : 12/01/2018
5 Maxwell Road VEHICLE NO : SLN 7803 M
#17-00 Tower Block, MND Complex MAKE/MODEL  : Hyundai Elantra
Singapore 069110 ACC DATE : 280122017
CLAIM NO : 1217-1347
POLICY NO
AMOUNT S%
Lump sum repair inclusive of supplying parts. labour,
panel beating and spray painting
Repair Amount 4.400.00
Add 7% GST 308.00

Total 4,708.00

Singapore Dollars: Four Thousand Seven Hundred And Eight Only.

.'u\.._. Ay
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R B ..........I..1.|_£---.....1".
T & T Auto Services| Pte Ltd



Official Receipt
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=T Registered Address:

- i ‘:‘E}F B Er:_, :Sg Ej Rgvm 21 Woodlands Close, #08-34 Primz Bizhub 5(737854)

ENMNOLESS PERFECTION FOR MALL Dpﬂrﬂﬂﬂ'n Address:
! 160 Sin Ming Drive, #08-14 Sin Ming AutoCity S(575722)

Tel: 6266 6876 Fax: 6266 6861

Rental Agreement
Hirer's Particulars

Name: Yeng Kok Wey Nric/Passport: S7677716J  |Contact No: 9008 4865
Address: Blk 688E Woodlands Drive 75 #04-70 Postal Code: 735688
Vehicle's Details

Make/Model: Honda Civic ‘Uehlcle Reg No: SID 6314 R
Legend Fuel Level
Scratch — (= z
Dent : 0 --:::__
Chip Off . X —
Remarks = =
=
E =

Terms & Conditions

1. This User shall understand and agrees that the Vehicle be loaned for the purpose of test-drive for a usage fee for, but not limited to, administration,
maintenance and markating.

2. This vehicle Is restricted within Singapore use anly, unless the User informs Endless Drive Pte Ltd prior to entering West Malaysia and undertakes applicable
insurance, and the User is subjected to the terms and conditions set forth by Endless Drive Pte Lid.

3. The User is responsible for the Excess of SG052,000 - SG0510,000 of each accident invelving any damages to the vehicle during the period of use and the loss of
rental earning during the repair of the damaged vehicle. Should the vehicle is damaged beyond repair, the User is required to compensate the price of the vehicle
based an market price and any incurred fees, as per determined by Endless Drive Pte Ltd. In the case of stolen vehicle, User will bear the excess amount after
making claims from the insurance company. The User is also responsible for any damages to the interior of the vehicle such as, but not limited to, seats, steering
wheel, audio system, air-conditioning system, compartment and boot space.

4. The User shall be liable for all claims and damages should he or she is found to use the vehicle for illegal activities, driving under the influence of alcohol or
commit an act that is not covered by our insurance policy. y

5. The User shall be liable for any costs incurred in the events such as, but not limited to, breakdown, flat battery, and tyre puncture.

. The User understands and accepts that there may be no replacement vehicle provided in the event of an accident, subjected to availability,

7. Fines includes, but not limited to, ERP, parking and traffic will be claimed against the User which the User has seven [7) working days to settle fully and an
administration charge of 3G60%30 for each fine will be imposed on the User

&, The User is required to provide 1 day notice prier to the extension of the leasing period, and the extension of the leasing period is subjected to availability.

9. The User must know that extension of rental payment must be made before extending the vehicle. In any circumstance where the user fails ta camply and the
payment is delayed for more than 3 days, an extra 5300 penalty will be imposed for administrative charges.

10. Only the hirer is allowed ta drive the rental vehicle, any sub-drivers are not allowed. In any circumstances where this condition is invoked, a penalty of 55,000
will be required, In any event of an accident where the said vehicle is not driven by the authorised user, hirer will have to bear an additional 52,000 on top of the
total repair cost of the vehicle involved in the accident or the excess of the claim insurance if he/she is at fault.

11. 20% of daily fee will be charged on cars returned after the expected return time, on a per hour basis.

12, The User is required to refuel at his or her own cost, and return the vehicle with the same amount of fuel as when rented out, The minimum fuel octane
rating/ROM is 95 and a receipt must be provided for reference. While any excess refuel will not be refunded, the User would require to compensate Endless Drive
Pte Ltd SGDS20 per % tank. Measurement is determined by rounding down. Example: if meter is between 1/4 and 2/4, it will be taken as 1/4,

13. The User confirms that he/she is between twenty-two|22) and sixty-five(65) years of age and holds a valid driving license recognised under Singapore Law with
not less than twol(2) years satisfactory driving experience.

14. The User shall bear all responsibility for any injuries, damages or Ioss of life and shall relief Endless Drive Pte Ltd off any liabilities.

15. In a event that Endless Drive P1e Ltd has to engage a lawyer for any claims against the User, all legal fees will be bourne by the User.

16, Hereinafter, all terms and caonditions shall be gaverned by and canstrued in accordance to the laws of the Republic of Singapore, and Endless Drive Pte Ltd
reserved the rights of all final decisions.

I/IWe hereby agree to the terms & conditions of Endless Drive Pte Ltd (ROC: 201614923W)

Starting Date/Time:  ©2 /s [1-1¢ Efn Total Fees: $Y311e |-
Ending Date/Time: © 3/c [12179 Si Deposit(Refundable):
Vehicle Out Vehicle In
Hirer Signature Rep' Signature ] Hirer Signature Rep' Signature

Car Returned Date/Time: Deposit refund: -




291212017 Receipt
)
A

Land Transport Authority

10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701

GST Registration Mo. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 29 Dec 2017 1 11:09:02
Receipt Date/Time : 29 Dec 2017 / 11:09:02

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-171229-000851

Previous Receipt Mao. -

S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (585) (S%) (5%)

Result of Insurance Enguiry - XD3912T

As at 28 Dec 2017/18:30:00

Insurance Co: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
1 Insurance Enquiry - XD3%12T

Enqguiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.49
= 20171229110754659068
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Faid By
20171228110814670 Direct Debit: &.NETS Debit 7 45
{Internat Banking)
Total 7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 745
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00
THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!
_—
Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider ! financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and rece pt i1s considerad void and |ate fea

hittps:ivrl lta.gov. sgitasvrliaction/completePayment ?FUNCTION _ID=F1301001TT i1



