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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Daniel Lim <daniellim@motorimage.net>

Sent: Monday, 9 July 2018 11:54 AM

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)

Cc: Daniel Jude; Kuan Wei Loong; SUR; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLS9489Y-3RD PARTY CLAIM- TP(SJE9364X) ERGO-Invoice-(DSMPC1703041)

Attachments: 1800_001.pdf

Dear Claim Team 

 

Attached are the invoice and document for your action and closure of this claim 

 

Best Regards 

 

 

Daniel Lim 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: 31 May, 2018 3:50 PM 

To: Sayedinah <sayedinah@motorimage.net> 

Cc: Daniel Lim <daniellim@motorimage.net>; Daniel Jude <danieljude@motorimage.net>; Kuan Wei Loong 

<weiloong@motorimage.net>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SLS9489Y-3RD PARTY CLAIM- TP(SJE9364X) ERGO-FINALZED 

 

Dear Sayed, 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Confirmed amount $1852.48 before GST @ 3 working days. 
 
Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to ERGO INSURANCE 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Sayedinah [mailto:sayedinah@motorimage.net]  

Sent: Thursday, 31 May 2018 3:27 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Daniel Lim <daniellim@motorimage.net>; Daniel Jude <danieljude@motorimage.net>; Kuan Wei Loong 

<weiloong@motorimage.net> 

Subject: SLS9489Y-3RD PARTY CLAIM- TP(SJE9364X) ERGO-FINALZED 

Importance: High 

 

Hi Veron, 

Attached for your reference 
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Regards 

Sayedinah Ali 

Service Executive 

Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 

19 Lorong 8 Toa Payoh Singapore 319255 

HP;92992693  DID:67038109 FAX:+65-62535535 

Email:sayedinah@motorimage.net 

Website:www.tanchong.com :: www.motorimage.net 

 

 

 

 
 

 
Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or 
use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The 
sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.  


