Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Dear Li Li,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Friday, 29 December, 2017 10:19 AM

'ONG LI LI'; assignments

'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A

RE: SLF7224B Claim against SKP5029X Our Ref

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 5:15 PM
To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assighments@Ilkkauto.com
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: SLF7224B Claim against SKP5029X Our Ref : 15/16/16/VP05/019348

Dear Catherine
fya

Regards,
Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Mandy Neo [mailto:mandy.neo@wearnes.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 3:12 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: FW:SLF7224B Claim against SKP5029X

Hi Gerald,

Attached for TP Claim,

Kindly advise if direct settlement is possible

Best regards,

Mandy Neo
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

:15/16/16/VP05/019348



Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.

N 49 Alexandra Road 159935
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This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Your Scan Copy

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 10:22 AM
To: Mandy Neo

Subject: Attached Image



