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Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 8 March 2018 12:02 PM
To: 'Admin nht'
Cc: Chloe; Admin A
Subject: RE: SJK7787R CLAIMING ER5656X DOA 28.12.17 ***LKK REF:CC4/AXA17024687/Ayb3
Attachments: ER 5656X VIDEO FROM OI WITNESS.mp4

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Hi Sukyi, 
 
Further to the below matter. 
 
As per video evidence provided by our insured witness, your client cut into our insured’s lane to make a left turn 
resulted the collision.  (please see the attached) 
 
Therefore, we regret to inform you that we have our Principal instruction to deny the liability and unable to look into 
your client’s claim. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Jas Khine | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
From: Admin nht [mailto:admin@nhtmotor.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 7 March 2018 1:10 PM 
To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SJK7787R CLAIMING ER5656X DOA 28.12.17 ***LKK REF:CC4/AXA17024687/Ayb3 
 
Without Prejudice 

Hi Jas 

Please advice your offer and revert for close case,thanks. 
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The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 
 
On Wed, Feb 28, 2018 at 12:09 PM, Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote: 

Hi Jas 

Contents noted with thanks. 

Hope to receive your offer soon for close case,thanks. 
 
 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 
 
On Wed, Feb 28, 2018 at 11:25 AM, Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Sykyi, 
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Below matter is still have yet get direct settlement instruction from our Principal AXA. 

  

We will follow up the matter and will revert to you soon. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Jas Khine | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Admin nht [mailto:admin@nhtmotor.com]  
Sent: Monday, 26 February 2018 3:09 PM 
To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SJK7787R CLAIMING ER5656X DOA 28.12.17 ***LKK REF:CC4/AXA17024687/Ayb3 

  

Without Prejudice 

Hi Jas 

Please advice your offer and revert for close case,thanks. 
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The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

  

On Thu, Feb 8, 2018 at 2:33 PM, Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote: 

Hi Jas 

Contents noted with thanks. 

Hope to receive your offer soon for close case,thanks. 

 
 

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.
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On Thu, Feb 8, 2018 at 1:59 PM, Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Sukyi, 

  

Below matter is pending direct settlement instruction from AXA. 

  

We will follow up the matter and will revert to you soon. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Jas Khine | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Admin nht [mailto:admin@nhtmotor.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 8 February 2018 1:40 PM 
To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) 
<thinthin@lkkauto.com>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SJK7787R CLAIMING ER5656X DOA 28.12.17 ***LKK REF:CC4/AXA17024687/Ayb3 

  

Hi Jas 

Please advice your offer and revert for close case. 

Your reply much appreciated. 
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The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct file and location.

 

  

On Mon, Jan 22, 2018 at 9:23 AM, Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Thank you for your email. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

Dear Jas, 

  

For your information and necessary action please. 

  

Thank you 

  

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned. 
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Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Chloe [mailto:chloe@nhtmotor.com]  
Sent: Saturday, 20 January 2018 10:40 AM 
To: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SJK7787R CLAIMING ER5656X DOA 28.12.17 

  

Dear Motor Claims Department, 
 
Enclosed LOD and supporting documents for your reference. 
Please kindly advise officer in charge and hope to receive offer soon.  
Thank you. 

 
 

 

  

  

  

 

 


