Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 10:40 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); 'mt_claim@lonpac.com'

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: 2 Days Notice: EW 3363C (Our Ref) and SLP 6856G (Your Ref) Dated 8
November 2017

Attachments: SLP6856G 081117.PDF

Dear Shirley

Please see our Insured’s GIA report attached.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 15 January, 2018 2:32 PM

To: 'mt_claim@lonpac.com’

Cc: 'ericwoo@lonpac.com’; 'llong@lonpac.com'; GERALD POH WEE BIN; Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Admin
A

Subject: RE: 2 Days Notice: EW 3363C (Our Ref) and SLP 6856G (Your Ref) Dated 8 November 2017

Your ref: 17/17/17/VP05/020210
LKK ref : CC4/LPC17024640/Aes3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Meanwhile, Kindly assist to verify validity of our insured’s policy, and let us have a copy of insured’s
accident report for our necessary action..

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 5 January 2018 1:41 PM

To: 'mt_claim@lonpac.com'

Cc: 'ericwoo@lonpac.com’; 'llong@lonpac.com'; 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Asher Sng
(LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 2 Days Notice: EW 3363C (Our Ref) and SLP 6856G (Your Ref) Dated 8 November 2017
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Your ref: 17/17/17/VP05/020210
LKK ref : CC4/LPC17024640/Aes3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a third party direct settlement case.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: EW 3363C
Date of survey: 28/12/2017
Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP’s GIA report
We will revert preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, Kindly assist to verify validity of our insured’s policy, and let us have a copy of insured’s
accident report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 December 2017 11:16 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 2 Days Notice: EW 3363C (Our Ref) and SLP 6856G (Your Ref) Dated 8 November 2017

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd



Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 5:08 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: mscarautopl@gmail.com; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: FW: 2 Days Notice: EW 3363C (Our Ref) and SLP 6856G (Your Ref) Dated 8 November 2017

Dear Catherine,

For your necessary action.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: MS Group Office [mailto:msgroupoffice@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 5:04 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; mscarautopl@gmail.com

Subject: Re: 2 Days Notice: EW 3363C (Our Ref) and SLP 6856G (Your Ref) Dated 8 November 2017

Dear Gerald,

With reference to your list of surveyors, we are agreeable with the appointment of Adrian Ling of LKK as
the SJE for subject claim.

Kindly note our personnel in charge for the survey as follows:-
Contact Person: Mr. Desmond Ng (9725-4442)
Contact Email: mscarautopl @ gmail.com

Thank you for your kind attention to our request.

On Wed, Dec 27, 2017 at 3:24 PM, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh @lonpac.com> wrote:

Our Ref : 17/17/17/VP05/020210

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Desmond,

Please see attached letter and revert to us.



Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: MS Group Office [mailto:msgroupoffice@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 2:46 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: mscarautopl@gmail.com

Subject: 2 Days Notice: EW 3363C (Our Ref) and SLP 6856G (Your Ref) Dated 8 November 2017

Dear Gerald,

I understand that Eric is not around today, kindly refer to our 2 Days Notice and assist with necessary.

Thank you.

Road Traffic Accident Involving EW 3363C (Our Ref) and SLP 6856G (Your Ref)
Dated 8 November 2017, Time around 16:00
@ Jalan Ahmad Ibrahim before Roundabout

We represent our client; Wong Wun Tiew, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving our client‘s vehicle registration
number: EW 3363C and your insured’s vehicle registration number: SLP 6856G. Enclosed herewith a copy of the Singapore Accident
Statement / Traffic Police Report filed for your reference.

Enclosed herewith a copy of our 2 Days Notice Letter and the relevant Singapore Accident Statement filed for your reference.

Please let us know within 2 working days from today, your list of at least ten (10) motor surveyors, via email to the following
personnel:-

Contact Person: Mr. Desmond Ng (9725-4442)
Contact Email: mscarautopl @ gmail.com
CC Email: msgroupoffice @ gmail.com




Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,

Adel
MS Car Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07

Premier @ Kaki Bukit

Singapore 415875

Telephone: 6385-1838

Fax : 6386-1838

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,

Adel

MS Car Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07

Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Telephone: 6385-1838
Fax : 6386-1838



