Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SHB4345Z (C0464430)
[SHD343U]
TP
COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
Dec 24 2017 12:00AM
[TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

From AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (AXA_SG), sent on 15/02/2019 11:36 AM.

To LKK_HQ

(oo ashersng@lkkauto.com

Subject Re: [URGENT] Re: Fw: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SHD343U (Ol : AXA - C0464430) and SHB4345Z (TP :

LKK REF - CC4/AXA17024634/K1es3) on 24/12/2017

HI,

WE HAVE SINCE EXERCISED REPUDIATION.
PLEASE FOLLOW UP WITH THE NECCESSARY.

THANK YOU.

v [ —

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: Kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg
CC: AXA_SG; ashersng@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 12/02/2019 11:57 AM

SHB4345Z (TP : LKK REF - CC4/AXA17024634/K1les3) on 24/12/2017
Hi Kian Chuan,

We refer to email dated 05/11/2018 and 28/012/2018.

PLEASE KINDLY ADVISE IF THIS CASE REPUDIAED?

Third party chasing for settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com; ashersng@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 01/03/2018 05:27 PM

CC4/AXA17024634/K1les3) on 24/12/2017

Dear Cynthia,

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD
8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower
Singapore 068811

Customer Centre #B1.01

'R (65) 6880 4888

& (65) 6338 2522

B wwwaxa.com.sg

GST Reg No.: 199903512M

Co. Reg No.: 199903512M

Subject: Re: [URGENT] Re: Fw: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SHD343U (OI : AXA - C0464430) and

Subject: Fw: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SHD343U (OI : AXA - C0464430) and SHB4345Z (TP : LKK REF -




Thanks and noted.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Do-Not-Reply [mailto:do-not-reply@merimen.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 28 February 2018 5:40 PM

To: kweemay.tan@axa.com.sg

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SHD343U (OI : AXA - C0464430) and SHB4345Z (TP : LKK REF -
CC4/AXA17024634/K1les3) on 24/12/2017

Dear LKK,
ID not yet reported. 1st reminder sent.

Regards,
Cynthia Loh

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: kweemay.tan@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com; ashersng@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 04/01/2018 10:10 AM

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SHD343U (OI : AXA - C0464430) and SHB4345Z (TP : LKK REF -
CC4/AXA17024634/K1es3) on 24/12/2017

Dear Kwee May,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Please advise also whether we can proceed for direct settlement for this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




