Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 February, 2018 10:56 AM

To: Boo seng yak

Cc: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); Carrine Leong; Nora Khai; Vic (LKKAuto); Asher Sng
(LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINAL REVISION - SLU1638B - TP AIG - SURVEYED 9 JAN 18

Attachments: PA12682017 - SLU 1638 B - Audi Q2 1.0 TFSI S-tronic - Rear (AIG).xls

Without Prejudice
Dear Johnny,
We confirmed COR @ $1,940.00 with 3 Days.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

" Save the Larth Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Boo seng yak [mailto:boojohnny@gmail.com]

Sent: Saturday, 3 February, 2018 5:35 PM

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A; Carrine Leong; Nora Khai
Subject: FINAL REVISION - SLU1638B - TP AIG - SURVEYED 9 JAN 18

Hi Adrian and all,

Revised estimate is attached.

Please confirm repair cost of $1940.00 @ 3 days of repairs.

Your early closure is well appreciated.

Best regards - jb



