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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 December, 2017 10:45 AM

To: 'Ong Chin Kiat'

Cc: Ai Phing (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: RE: Market Value for YN8818K - Date of Accident: 20.12.2017

Dear Chin Kiat,

The market value for YN 8818K is $19K-$20K (EST) as at Dec 2017.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933v)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 10:38 AM

To: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat_ong@sg.msig-asia.com>

Cc: Ai Phing (LKKAuto) <aiphing@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Market Value for YN8818K - Date of Accident: 20.12.2017

Dear Chin Kiat,

Our surveyor is still checking,will revert shortly.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${(408933)



From: Ong Chin Kiat [mailto:chinkiat ong@sg.msig-asia.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 10:35 AM

To: Veron Chen {LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ai Phing (LKKAuto) <aiphing@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Market Value for YN8818K - Date of Accident: 20.12.2017

Dear Veron,
Any updates on the market value?

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Ong Chin Kiat

Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | chinkiat ong@sg.msig-asia.com

‘ MSIG *%@fx@&f“%ﬁi

2016 nsurer Clalras Teann of the Year

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | Tel +65 6220 9644 1 Fax
+65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 2004122126 | http://www.msig.com.sg/ | Follow us on n u m

Amember of TRETNN] INSURANCE GROUP

From: Ai Phing (LKKAuto) [mailto:aiphing@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 December 2017 3:05 PM

To: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat_ong@sg.msig-asia.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Market Value for YN8818K - Date of Accident: 20.12.2017

Dear Chin Kiat,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Veron,

FYNA.

"Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2018"

Best Regards,

Ai Phing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd '
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | 5(408933)



From: Ong Chin Kiat [mailto:chinkiat ong@sg.msig-asia.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 26 December, 2017 2:59 PM

To: Ai Phing (LKKAuto) <aiphing@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Market Value for YN8818K - Date of Accident: 20.12.2017

Hi Ai Phing,
Can assist to check market valué? -

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ong Chin Kiat
Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | chinkiat ong@sg.msig-asia.com

‘ MSIG ASIA-PACIFIC

2016 insurer Clalms Team of the Year
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | Tel +65 62209644 | Fax
+65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | http://www.msig.com.sg/ | Follow us on n

amember of IEEENS) INSURANCE GROUP

From: Ong Chin Kiat

Sent: Thursday, 21 December 2017 5:18 PM ,

To: 'Wendy Tan' <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)' <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Market Value for YN8818K - Date of Accident: 20.12.2017

Hi all,
Can assist to check market value for YN8818K?
Date of Accident: 20.12.2017

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ong Chin Kiat
Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2558 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | chinkiat ong@sg.msig-asia.com

i

MSIG * ASIA-PACIFIC

2016 nsawer Clakms Yeam of the Year

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 1 Tel +65 6220 9644 | Fax
+65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | http://www.msig.com.sg/ 1 Follow us on “ a E m

A member of JRTAAM INSURANCE GROUP



12/21/2017

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

PARF/COE Rehate Enquiry

Zrm\rlréltlicle 6wner Partic_:uwlémr;iw o
| Owner ID Type: ' - Company ﬁ
WOﬂw‘r;er Ib: | 1457D
Vehicle Details
VehicleNo.: YN8B18K
Véhic;le to ber Ex}mréd: No
|nte;déd De-registration Date: 7 21 Dec 2017
Vehiclre Méke: | | HINO
Vehicle Model: ” 7 XZU710R 40 MANUAL ABS TVlVJRB(V)V
Prirﬁary ’Colourr:r | Whitéw | |
Manufa”ctufiﬁrg’Yveiarr: | 2071573"
Engine No.:  NO4CUV16244
Chassris No.: JHI;IUCP3IlI4OKOO7179 |
Maximum Power Outpuf: | - -
| bpén MarrkertValrue:r ‘ $28,283.00
Oriéinal Regi:;:&arzrtior"\rbna-tezr - 30Sep 2013
”First Rregiétrr;atiiorn Date: 30 Sep 2013
T;ansfe; Count 0
AActu‘al‘ARVI; Pald - W$71,415.00

" Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

No

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

$0.00

29 Sep 2023

https:l/vﬂ.lta.gov.sglltalvrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_|D=F0304009TT

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
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12/21/2017 PARF/COE Rehate Enquiry

COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: | $73,999.00

COE Rebafe Amount: - $42,7 13.00
| ﬁ)t#l Rebate Amodhti: $42,713.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Dec 2017

0K

https:/lvd.lta.gov.sglltalvrl/actionlenquireRebateByPuincBeforeDereglnput?FUNCTlON__ID=F0304009TT
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