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Jy L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

& -8 51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusinal Park, Singapore 408833

oy Ve |
TEL: 8256 3581 FAX: G256 4215

Reg. Ma: 199607188R GST Reg. No 18-5607198-R

Affiliated o Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaoblle

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PL Ref - CCa&/llI17024544/hb3
505-62 108 BULDING SINGAPORE 048711 Daes 2720 I”mmn"m“ll
Code : |2
L5 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH9111L Veh. Inspected 8JG 397A
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 27N 22017
z Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis Ne. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre | mm
4. Description of Damag s
5. General Information
Accident Date 181272017 Inspection Date
Survey held at DING AUTO PTELTD
BLK 10 #01-20 SIN MING IND EST SEC C SINGAPORE 575645
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON ATWITHOUT PREJUDICE™ BASIS
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS
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DING AUTO PTE LTD
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10 |CHECK & REFAIR WIRINT SYSTEM o B o 5 50.00 =&f
11 |RESPRAY FRONT DOOR RH. REAR DOOR FH. HEER FEMNDER RH, ROCKER PAMEL RH & REER BLIMPER s 1,000.00 —H—r—
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Catherine Cho (LKK Auto)

Adeline Tham <adelinetham@iii.comsg> on pehalf of Motor Claim -1

From: :

«maotorclaim@iii com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 26 December, 2017 5:30 PM _
To: Ding Auto Admin; 'SUR’ 'LKK - Assignments’; Admin A
Ce: ding@dingauto.sg. sales@dingauto.sg
Subject: RE: Accident involving SIG397A B SHo111L ON 18/12/2017 Along Bernam Street
Attachments: SJG397A_18122017.pdf
Dear 5ir,
This Pre-Repair Survey is on Without Prejudice Basis. - 1']_']!:!'-1 @ g.m%m
THIRD PARTY VEHICLE NO ' SIG39TA

o\

Il INSURED VEHICLE NO, : SH9111L T win
DATE OF LOSS :18/12/2017

We acknowledge receipt of your letter dated 26.12.2017.
Our insured has reported the above accident to us.

in compliance to Pre-Action Protocol for NIMA cases, we note that

You have agreed to the appointment of our surveyor

Therefore, we have appointed our surveyor LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct the pre-repair survey.
This claim is handled by Ms Aida

Please let us have your client’s accident report and repair estimate for our appointed surveyor to conclude his
report

«=\we would like to conduct a re-survey after spray painting. Please contact our surveyor to arrange.
**syurveyor kindly upload this assignment to Merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards.

Adeline Thum

Motor Claims Department

India International Insurance Pre Lid
64 Cecil Street #05 10B Building
Singupore 049711

From: Ding Auto Admin [malltn:admin@dingautn.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 December, 2017 5:21 PM

To: Motor Claim - 111

Cc: ding@dingauto.sg; sales@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SJG397A & SH9111L ON 18/12/2017 Along Bernam Street

Dear adeline,




Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 December, 2018 5:15 PM

Teo: Zuhaidah Samsuri

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: MCT17120615 - Status of D/S LKK REF CC4/MI17024544/Khb3
Dﬂir ﬁtldﬂ-

We refer to your below emall.

Please be informed that till date, we are pending for TP feedback if their client would still pursue to settle privately
with our Insured Driver,

Meanwhile, we are also pending for TP LOD if they will pursue to do settlement with us.
Thank you

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4o8033)

LKK = Save the Farth  Print only when necessary:

This e-mill contain confidential and prvileged matenal, and ane for the sole use of the inlended recipient. Lise or distnbuticn by an
umntended recipient is prohibied, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you recelved this e-mail In eror, plesss do not
read this s-mall ar any attached lems. Please deleta the e-mall and all attachments, Including any coples thereol, and inform the
sandar that you have delatad tha e-mail, all atachments and any capies fhereol, Thank you.

From: Zuhaidah Samsuri [mailto:aida@iii.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 28 December, 2018 5:07 FM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: MCT17120615 - Status of D/S
Hi Vig,
TP claim has not been resolved?

Best Regards

Alda Samsuri

Motor Claims Dept

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street #04/#05 108 Bullding
Singapore 045711

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 257 Fan: 6224 4174

Email: aidad@iil.com g

Co. Rey Nurmber 198705792K




Kindly note that by submitting this claim 1o us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance indusiry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER.:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistuke. please delete 1t immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful,
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, cormupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K




Hsiao 'I‘nnE (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 August 2019 12:16 PM

To: Ding Auto Admin; kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJG397A & SHI111L ON 18/12/2017 Along Bernam Street

LKK ERF CC4/I1117024544/Kpb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Kinclly advise if your client is still pursuing third party claim against our insured / M/s India International
Insurance Pte Ltd on this matter. If so, Kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents fo us if
available for our further action.

Thank you.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsinoe Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ding Auto Admin [mailto;admin@dingauto.s
Sent: Friday, 28 December, 2018 5:31 PM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: assignments; Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJG397A & SH9111L ON 18/12/2017 Along Bernam Street LKK ERF
CC4/11117024544/Khb3

Dear Vic,

thank you for your reply.

We will check with our client and let you know .

Thank you.

Best regards,




Alex Loh
Claim Executive

Tel: (+65) 6452 1208 | Fax: 6452 0614 | HP: (+65) 9181 6257
Email: admin@dingauto.sg

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 28 December 2018 5:12 PM

To: DingAuto Admin <admin@dingauto.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving SIG397A & SH9111L ON 18/12/2017 Along Bernam Street LKK ERF
CCA4/11117024544/Khb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Alex,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that the claim from our Insured against you client was already settled by NTUC at 50%.
Kindly advise if your client is still willing to settle the claim privately.

Otherwise, we will proceed to do DS for this matter.

Thank you.

Best Regurds,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultunts Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: viealpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ el
LK = Save the Earth Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and prvileged maternal, and are for the sole use of the intended reciplent. Use or distribulion by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in emmor, please do not
read this e-mail or any attachad Items. Please delate the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereol, and inform the

saender that you have deleted the e-mall, all atachments and any copies thereol. Thank you.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February, 2018 5:41 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: assignments; Admin A

Subject: FW: Accident involving SIG397A & SH9111L ON 18/12/2017 Along Bernam Street

Hi Vic,
Fyi. Thank you

Best Regards,




Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto com | fax; 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Ding Auto Admin [mailto:admin@dingauto.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 5:01 PM

To: 'Motor Claim - III' <motorclaim@lii.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Ce: ding@dingauto.sg; sales@dingauto.sg
Subject: RE: Accident involving SJG397A & SH9111L ON 18/12/2017 Along Bernam Street

Dear Adeline,

Our client wish to privately settle with your insured as the liability was 50/50
Kindly inform your insured if possible he wish to contact him directly.

His contact is 96659531 Mr Brandon.

Best regards,

Alex Loh

Claim Executive
DingAulo Pte Ltd
10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate | #01-20 | Singapore 575645

Tel: (+65) 6452 1208 | Fax: 6452 0614 | HP: (+65) 9181 6257
Email: admin@dingauto.sq

From: Adeline Tham [mailto:adelinetham @iii.com.sg| On Behalf Of Motor Claim - Il
Sent: Tuesday, 26 December 2017 5:30 PM

To: Ding Auto Admin <admin@dingauto.sg>; 'SUR' <sur@|kkauto.com>; 'LKK - Assignments'
<assignments@|kkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Cc: ding@dingauto.sg; sales@dingauto.sg
Subject: RE: Accident involving 5JG397A & SH9111L ON 18/12/2017 Along Bernam Street

Dear Sir,
This Pre-Repair Survey is on Without Prejudice Basis.

THIRD PARTY VEHICLE NO : SIG397A
Il INSURED VEHICLE NO. :5H9111L
DATE OF LOSS 118/12/2017

We acknowledge receipt of your letter dated 26.12.2017.
Our insured has reported the above accident to us,

In compliance to Pre-Action Protocol for NIMA cases, we note that

-You have agreed to the appointment of our surveyor,

Theretore, we have appointed our surveyor LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct the pre-repair survey.

This claim is handled by Ms Aida




Please let us have your client’s accident report and repair estimate for our appointed surveyor to conclude his
report,

**We would like to conduct a re-survey after spray painting. Please contact our surveyor to arrange.
**surveyor kindly upload this assignment to Merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Adeline Tham

Motor Claims Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street #05 IOB Building
Singapore 049711

From: Ding Auto Admin : i

Sent: Tuesday, 26 December, 2017 5:21 PM

To: Motor Claim - 111

Cc: ding@dingauto.sq; sales@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: Accident involving SIG397A & SH9111L ON 18/12/2017 Along Bernam Street

Dear adeline,

We wish to appoint LKK — Kenneth for survey.

Best ragards,

Alex Loh

Claim Executive
DingAuto Pte Ltd
10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate | #01-20 | Singapore 575645

Tel: (+65) 6452 1208 | Fax: 6452 D614 | HP: (+65) 9181 6257
Emall: admin@dingauto.sg

From: Adeline Tham [mallto:adelinetham@iii.com.sg] On Behalf Of Motor Claim - 11l
Sent; Tuesday, 26 December 2017 4:12 PM
To: Ding Auto Admin min@dingau >

Ce: ding@dingauto.sg; sales@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: Accident involving SJG397A & SH9111L ON 18/12/2017 Along Bernam Street

Dear Sir,

We acknowledge receipt of your letter dated [26.12.2017] and the enclosures on [26.12.2017].

We propose using one of the following motor surveyors:

» LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
s Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd




Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or Iif you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,

Adeline Tham

Motor Claims Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street #05 IOB Building
Singapore 049711

From: Ding Auto Admin [mallto:admin@dingauto.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 December, 2017 2:06 PM

To: Motor Claim - 111

Cc: ; sales@dingauto.sg

Subject: Accident involving SIG397A & SHI111L ON 18/12/2017 Along Bernam Street

Dear Claim Officers,
kindly advise liabllity for direct settlement,

If possible do arrange surveyor .

Best regards,

Alex Loh

Claim Executive
DingAuto Pte Ltd
10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate | #01-20 | Singapore 575645

Tel: (+65) 6452 1208 | Fax: 6452 0614 | HP: (+65) 9181 6257
Email: admin{@dingauto.sg

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email Is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the errar and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner Is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K




Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using, disclosing and
processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located both inside and
outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including the General Insurance
Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling and/or dealing with your claim,
which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same,
kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information,

if you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K




Hsiao Tuna !I.I{KAutu! I

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 March 2020 7:19 AM

To: ‘alda@jii.com.sg’

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Your Ref: MCT17120615 // LKK Ref: CC4/11117024544/Kpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SHO111L(IIT) AND SIG397A ON 18/12/2017]

Attachments: EMAIL TO THIRD PARTY DD 080819 pdf

Your Ref: MCT17120615
LKK Ref: CC4/11117024544/Kpb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH9111L{IIl) AND SJG397A ON 18/12/2017
We refer to the above matter.

We have offered 50% to third party on 28/12/2018. Up-to-date, we did not receive any follow-up made from Third
Party for their claim.

In view of non-development from the third-party, we will proceed to temporarily close this outstanding claim file
and submit our report to your good-office.

In future, if there are any new developments from the claimant, we will inform you for our further handling.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Hundler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@]kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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Main

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]

Insursd: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No: 1593038218

Main
Claimanti KYRD , Co. Reg, No.: 53156832]

Vahicia Rleg. Ti8/12/2017 10:00 - :59
No.: SIG397A Date of Loss: |4y 3y wonths and 29 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥ri]
Claim Type: | TP / MCT17120615 MaeHEover | mcomoo1s
Wehicie Aeg
Palicy Na.
No SHE111L ; | soB909ESEY
(neured) [Claimant)
Excess:

Repairer:
Handling
Insurer:

Ding Auto Pte Ltd (HQ) Blk 10, #01-20, Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C, S75545 Sin Ming - Tel: 64521208
India International Tnsurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel; 63476100 ... [Handied by Zuhaidah Bte Samsuri - 5347 6070)

NTUC Income Insurance Co-aparative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:
LKK Auto Consuitants Pte Ltd {HQ) - Tel: 6I56-3561 .. [Handled ty KENNETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt due 08/01/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED Wiew A I Compase Case Mail I

e I1_SG (04/01/2018): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - S)G397A - Claim Handler: Zuhaidah Bie Sa...
s I1_SG (04/00/2018) Alert - Ad] Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - S)GISTA - Clalm Handler: Zuhsldah Bte Sa...

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKSE

Due Dats  Priority  Type
No resalts

wiew Ml | Search Tasis | Create New Task | Complete |
Subject  Hamdler Assigned By Completed On Created On ~ Oone?

Task Group
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Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SIG397A (MCT17120615)
[SH9111L]
™
KYRO AUTOMOBILE
Dec 18 2017 10:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]

Page 1 of 1

Ding Auto Pte Ltd
Photes/1imeges I e |
he | Reisbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consulitants Pie Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |17/01/1814:25 | Odometer Reading 0| waars | ¥
2 |17/03/18 14:25 Chassis Numbar ! Losd 7G| B
1 |17/01/18 14:35 | Genersl View 0| wuws | B
4 |17/01/18 14:25 | General View Q| adwc | A
£ |17/01/18 14:25 General View g_ Lo 3G | B
B [17/01/18 1435 | Genersl View 0| tedws | A
7 |17/01/18 14:25 General View 0| eews | B4
|8 |17/01/18 14:25 Gonaral View ! waa G | A
@ |17/01/18 1425 | General View @ | wedwc |
10 |17/01/18 14:25 | Genersl View 0| vedrws | A
11 |17/01/18 14:25 | General View Q| tosarwc | A
11 |17/01/18 14:35 General View Q| oows | A
Documantation = -lPl'FPiﬂ* <] &
[0 |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid {HG) Thumbnall | Print
1 |FnnT e EMAIL FROM I11 DD 37122017 Load POE
2 |27/12/1719:33  |TP GIA REPORT Laad PDF
3 | 02/01/18 1744 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Loag PDOF
4 1803720 07:19 EMAIL TO THIRD PARTY DD OAOB19 Load PDF
£ |00 0709 EMAIL TO 111 DD 180320 Load POF
|Me | Finahzed On Indla International Insurance Pe Lid (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
11 |05/01/1811:25 | E-flled GIA report - SH9111L (IV) @ | LoaspoF |
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST feset | save | et |
Thern are no document checkiists configured.
Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG)
"
L4
Show Remarks To: L] Handiing Insurer
Mot REmeis Bre Oroe@ls e e ahos 11D ethes parties

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_...
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreq no 1sss071sem
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industnal Park
Singapore 408833
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844.8805 Email sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/IINTO24544/KPS302

Date: 20/03/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International insurance Ple Lid  Policy No: MCOMDO15
Claimant .,
Vehicle No : SJG38TA Insured Vehicle No: SH8111L
Date of Loss: 181272017 MNaiure of Claim: TP Claim No: MCT17120615
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No. SJG397A
Make & Modal: TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS, 1.6 (A) Engine No: 3ZZ4T77B404
Reg. Date 18/068/2008 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No: MROS3ZEE106111818
Colour: Metallic Blue Odamater: 141425 km
Engine Capacity: 1598 cc
Markel Value/New Car NJA
Prics:
Sum Insured (S§). Market Value/New Car Prica
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Stearing (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/85 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/85 R15
Front Left Side Michelin B mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 8 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin 8 mm Rear Righ! Side: Michelin 8 mm
The above vaivas represent the remaining fyre treads depift
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 2221.02 852.35 1,268 67 57.12
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,880.00 1,230.00 850.00 34 57
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 4,101.02 2,182.35 1,918.67 46.79
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 1,650.00
(S5) 4,101.02 1,650.00 245102 59,77
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (SS$) 287.07 11550 171.57 50.77
Nett Amount (S5} 4,388.00 1,765.50 2,622.59 59.T7
Global Sum Settlement (55) 0.00
INSP |
Date of Assignment: 2722017
Data Inspected. 281272017 Inspected At: Ding Auto Pte Lid (HQ)
Blk 10, #01-20. Sin Ming Indusinal
Estate Sector C
Singapore 575645
Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 20/3/2020
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NOTE: Thrs report represents our findings ar (he fime and place of inspection stated herein, Such mapection has been carmed ouf fo ihe best of our
knpwisgige and abifily but any other lsbiily under any other circumatances s hereby expressly exchidsd
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 19 Mar 2020)

Parts: 143 TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)

IPﬂI'I-'I Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SJG3GTA)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

[Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 ‘REAR DOOR RH Dented / Warped 1,13550FL *1,13550FL
2 1 *REAR FENDER RH Repair 1,084 96 FL *-FL
3 1 ‘REAR BUMPER ASSY Repair 534 00FL “~FL
4 1 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH Serviceable T260FL *~FL
5 1 *REAR DOOR MOULDING RH Necessary 101.80FL  *101.80FL
B i ‘REAR DOOR CHROME RH Necassary 3240FL *3240FL

FeFranchise pan. L=LisiNemDisc
Sub Total (S%) 2,961.36 1,269.80
- List Item Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S%) T40.34 317.45

Total Parts (S§)  2,221.02 952.35

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out |
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Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
Thare are no new miscellaneous items selectad,
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 STRAIGHTEN & PANEL BEAT ACCIDENT AREAS New 600,00 500.00
2  R&R R/H/R DOOR COMPONENTS New 120.00 60.00
3 RAR R/H/R QUARTER GLASS New 100.00 0.00
4  CHECK & REPAIR WIRING SYSTEM New 50.00 20.00
5  RESPRAY FRONT DOOR RH ,REAR DOOR RH ,REAR New 1,000.00 650,00
FENDER RH ,ROCKER PANEL RH & REAR BUMPER
Gross Labour Cost (55) 1,680.00 1,230.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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