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CITY AUTO PTELTD

TEL: 6453 1235, 6452 0850 FAX: 8453 7844
24hrs Towing Servicas Tel, 9823 95098
Co. Reg. No.: 199503435C GST Reg. No.: M2-8520978-4

BLK B, SIN MING IND. ESTATE, #01-80/62, SIN MING ROAD, SINGAPORE 575643

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. : ;
ot e Bl Estimate : ES004956
78 Shenton Way §07-16 239058 Date : 26(12/2017
Singapore 079120 vVehicle Num. .-51::1-: 44680
Attention : Motor Claim Department gf;';fggf:;f ﬁ'ﬁ?ﬁ‘é’ailﬁﬁ?mm
Contact : 18004193000 Fax No.: 68357416 Accident Date : 25/12/2017
A, Claim No. : TP AIG
: Reference : -
,%, . Policy No. : 5092405649
y A rt /f;*:;.f
S/N Quantity Particular J"c?/c:k7 Unit Price Amount 55
LABOUR : Fey
*To repalir and respray front bumper 350.00
Labour Total 5 : 350.00
TS e
1l ¢
Acknoy by R
E. & QE. Total S5 : 350.00

/ém_-

for CITY AUTO PTE LTD




51 UIEAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL = (#65) 62563561 FAX LG5 6T4I4108

Our Ref: CC4/AIG17024535/Kjb3

09 JANUARY 2018

LOK HORNG GEE
1 St. Michael’s Road
#23-01

SINGAPORE 328006

Dear Sir,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDES397D AND SKK 4468U ON 25/12/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or
your authorized driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 20/01/2018, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faiW

FAX: 6741 4108
Email: jovirene@lkkauto.com

c.e. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
fMotor Claims Dept)



Joz Irene !LI(KAutu}

From: city auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June 2018 12:52 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Liability for SKK4468U Your ref: SDEB397D Our ref: SKK4468U D.OA:

25/12/2017 ****LKK REF:CC4/AIG17024535/K]b3

Dear Irene,

As spoken, since 50/50 case, shall we withdraw the claim and repair by theirown.
Kindly revert.

Best Regards,

Mrs. Quak

City Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate
#01-58/60/62 Singapore 575643
Tel: +65-6453 1235 ( 6 Line)

Fax: +65-6453 7544

Email: cityauto@singnet.com.sg

From: loy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 26, 2018 11:46 AM

To: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cec: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Liability for SKK4468U Your ref: SDE8397D Our ref: SKK4468U D.O.A: 25/12/2017 ****LKK
REF:CC4/AIG17024535/Kjb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Mrs, Quak,

As spoken earlier, re —sending our insured’s statement.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKk Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene @I|kkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this emall
is strictly forbidden.

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 January 2018 10:59 AM
To: 'City Auto' <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>




Jux Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 July 2018 1:23 PM

To: Lee, Ming-Yao

Cc Admin A; CS A Team

Subject: RE: Our Ref : 26681366435G-003 | Accident Involving SDEB3STD & SKK4458U on 25

December 2017 ****LKK REF.CC4/AIGT17024535/KJB3

Hi George,

We would like to update you that TP repairer has withdrawn TP claim and informed us that their client would repair
on his own.

In view of this, we will close file and submit our report to your good-office.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email; joyirene @|kkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Lee, Ming-Yao [mailto:MingYao.Lee@aig.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 31 January 2018 3:07 PM

To: Joy Irene [LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref : 26681366435G-003 | Accident Involving SDEB397D & SKK4458U on 25 December 2017
*#%%| KK REF:CCA/AIG17024535/KIB3

Hi oy,
Noted on this. Please let us know if there are any update,

Regards,

George Lee

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Ciaims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6418 1769 | Fax +(6b) 6835 7416

Ming-Yao Lee@alg.com | www.aig.com.sg




From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: 31 January 2018 09:09

To: Lee, Ming-Yao

Cc: Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref : 26681366435G-003 | Accident Involving SDE8397D & SKK4458U on 25 December 2017
**=*| KK REF:CC4/AIG17024535/KJB3

Dear George,

Status Is pending finalisation of COR and update from Ms. Mandy of Volvo with regards to Ol's TP claim.
The scene photos we had are those attached to O1's GIA only.

Liability is on hold as we note of Ol's dispute even at 50:50.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6749-5722 | email: joyirene @lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.|f you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: 5hu Pei (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 31 January 2018 8:44 AM
To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.lee@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@Ikkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

<vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our Ref : 26681366435G-003 | Accident Involving SDE8397D & SKK4458U on 25 December 2017

**4% KK REF:CCA/AIG17024535/KIB3

Dear George,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Dear Joy,

For your information and necessary action please.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupsi®@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408533)



From: Lee, Ming-Yao |mailto:MingYao.Lee@aig.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 6:07 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkk »

Subject: Our Ref : 26681366435G-003 | Accident Involving SDE8397D & SKK4458U on 25 December 2017

Hi LKK,

Insured is filing TP claim against third party but Insured wrote in to express unwillingness to accept 50% for this case.
May | check with you latest status of TP Claim,

Besides that, please let us have any video footages or accident scene photo if any to us.

Regards,
George Lee
AlG

Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid
7B Shenton Way #08-16 Singapare(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1769 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Ming-Yao Lee{@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg
IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
respansibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information, If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.
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ER DETAILS - - [Created by adjuster]
LOK HORNG GEE, 10 -

_:lul-l KAM HONG @ NG KAM HONG, [D: S02694457

25/12/2017 14:00 - :59
[53 Months and 8 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]

Claim Type: [TP / 2668136643556 |:‘;':";E’f"" 2100369213 [Comprahensive)
vehicle Reg, B ' ' I

Date of Loss:

Palicy M.
SDEB397D - {Claimant): 5092405649

AIG Asia Paciflc Insurance Ple. Lid. (Express) - Tel: £5-6419-3000 ... [Handled by Lee, Ming-Yao] MingYao.Lee@aig.com

NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Te|:

| LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ..:iuar:EJud_ E;kiﬁﬂéiﬂ :ﬁﬁi:fﬁﬁ]ﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁiﬁﬁ?ﬁ B]
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o AIG_SG (28/12/2017): Confirmation of O vehicle number

view a1 | Compose Case mail |

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS® View Al | Search Tasks | Creote New Task | Comptete |
Due Date Priority  Type Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
Ho results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_c... 6/7/2018
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*SKK4468U (26681366435G)
[SDEB397D]
™"
LAM KAM HONG @ NG KAM HONG
Dec 25 2017 2:00PM
[LOK HORNG GEE]
City Auto Pte Ltd ( Sin Ming)

Upload Documents |  Upload Photos | Compass tew Letter | Upioad vises | Upioas Audio | View [View in Browser| =
‘Assessment Reports ) - 1 per page vl & |
Mo Finalized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (56) N B | Thumbnail | Print
[ 1 : Accident Statement
(!} [DUOMIBINIS | prpmesc - Reg. s SDES397O, Clammant: LOK HOWNG e © [oaarme |
|Photos/Images - 3 per pagt &
No_|Retabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 D5/07/1811:43 | General View O | saws | A
2 05/07/1811:43 | General View 0 | adws | A
3 0S/07/18 11543 General View O | loauirs | A
4 |D5/07/18 11:43 | General View B 0 | wads | B
|5 |05/07/1811:43 | General View € | Load G
6 (D5/07/1811:43 | General View - 0 | acws | 4
17 los/o7n8 1143 | General View | @ | aowc | @

— p— - m—— — e, I 1 1
|8 |05/07/1811:43 | Odometer Reading 0 | wews | 4|
"_1 _§?§fn?ﬁls 11:43 | Chassis Number o 0 | Loscwe I'_Q
Documentatian [iperpove V]| &
o |Retabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print

1 |27/12/17 19:17 | EMAIL FROM AIG DD 27122017 0 | Load PoF
2 [27/12/1719:12 | TP ESTIMATE © | Loaaror
{3 [02/01/18 08:37 | TP GIA REPORY ) | LoadFoF
4 |02/01/18 17-55 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED - € | Load FOF
rg_ (03/07/18 13:47 | EMAIL TO WP - WSF WITHDRAW CLAIM 0 | Load FOF
& 03/07/18 13:48 | EMAIL WITHDRAWAL FROM WSP - | @ | oadFoF
7 03/07/18 13:49  |EMAIL FROM OI 0 | ioad FoF
Documents Checklist
| DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | print |

I'I'hurt are no docurment checklists configured.

- Pie Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: O Handlirg Insurer
Feigie: Bamarks afe oriviebe unless you show @ tn obthar parties.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 6/7/2018



Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreq e tsesoriser
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Page | of 4

Our File No: CC4/AIG17024535K.JB302
Date: 08/07/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer:  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No: 2100389213
Claimant Vehicle sykassu Insured Vehicle No :  SDE8397D
Date of Loss: 251122017 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 266813664356
DESCRIFTICN & IDENTIFICATION QOF I
Reg No: SKK4468U
Make & Maodeal: NISSAN ALMERA, 1.5 (A) Engine No: HR15320234B
Reg. Date: 17/07/2013 (Man. Year: 2012) Chassis No: MNTBBAN1TZ0000515
Colour: Metallic Grey Odometer: 25138 km
Engine Capacily 1458 cc

Markel Value/New Car Prica: N/A
Sum Insured (S$):

Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condilion:
OMNDITI R
Frant Tyre Size: 185/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 195/55 R16
Front Left Side: Falken 3 mm Rear Left Side; Falken 5 mm
Front Right Side: Falken 3 mm Rear Right Side: Falken 5 mm
The above values reprasent the remaining lyre ireads depth
COST OF CLAIMS = Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Paris 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscelianeous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 350.00 320.00 30.00 B.57
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 350,00 320.00 30.00 B.57
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 2450 22 .40 2.10 8.57
Nett Amount (S§) araso 342.40 32.10 8.57
Global Sum Settlement (S5) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 2rnizroy
Date Inspected: 28/12/2017 Inspected At City Auto Pte Lid ( Sin Ming) (HQ)
Block 8 Sin Ming Road #01-58/60/62 Sin
Ming Est
Singapare 575643
Estimated Period of Repair: 1.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 6/7/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Joy lrene Bascao

NOTE: This raport represents our findings af the tima and place of inspection stated hersin. Such inspection has been carmad out fo the Desf of pur
knowledge and abilily but any other faodily under any other ciroumstances is hersby axprossly axcluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 6/7/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

There are no now parts selected.
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

hitps://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 6/7/2018



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selectad.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO REPAIR AND RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER Mew 350.00 320.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 350.00 320.00

Repor was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_p... 6/7/2018



