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y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

) - &1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

gy
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref : COC3/CTI17024528/K1wb3
%;Eﬁl?sTngﬁ%ﬂgggmmmRE 079909 Dato:: . 27124038 NM“WN“M“W
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  SJAT241B Veh. Inspected SHA 9128G
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 271212017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer “ Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
B 1 General Information
Accident Date  23/12/2017 |Inspection Date 271212017

Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD

59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969

Ba. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




i,

Auto

- - Consultanis
B =2 W Pre Lrd Company Registration No. 19960T198R
51 LRI AVE 1, #12-25 PAYA UBI WD STRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 8933 TEL : (065) G2s63361 FAN: (65) 62564315

Your ref: To Be Advised
Our ref: CC3/CTIIT024528/K1wb3

The Motor Claims Department
M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.

We refer to the ab ove matter.

Date: 27.12.2017

SHA9128G

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 27.12.2017

at the premises of M/s C mfortDelGro Engineerin

Pte Ltd and have the following to report:-

2,010.43

1,116.93

673.50

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5%
Revised Estimate Amount 8%
"Check” ltems Amount 1 Sh
Market Value : 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value : §%
Nett Value S5

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Front Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 days

Yours faithfully,

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser




Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

e —
From: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.lay@sg.c ntaiping.com:
Sent: Thursday, 28 December, 2017 2:52 PM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuUtD)
Cc: Alfred Toh: Zayyer (LKKAuto); Admin A; Jowyn Tay
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJA7241B (Ol : CT1- TBA) and SHA9128G (TP :
LKK REF - CC3/CTI17024528/K1wb3) on 23.12.2017
Attachments: MCHM17168011-SJA7241B.pdf
Imporiance: High

Dear Shu Pei & Vivian,
Refer to your email on 27 Dec 2017.

We attached our insured's accident report for your attention. Once our letter is ready, we shall forward the same to
you.

Thank you.

Regards,

Jowyn Tay

Deputy Claims Executive

Motor Division

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6174

Fax: 6224 7175 / 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
'oﬂn.Iaxgsg,gntaiging.mm

Wehbsite: www sg.cniaiping.com

***lt*t-lt***#***iti1!##*!l-**t***i!'*****t**!i!i*******itili*******ll***#i*l****#t#i**l!‘***n****

1:tnﬂ***ﬂ-***iuti--#***ittt

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (singapore) Pte. Ltd.
except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

i!ttﬂ***m**tilI***h****i******i!i****!ﬂiilﬁli******lii#!+*¢*****ilF**!*i#**#*tli*******#***i*i*.!‘

**t*iiitiﬂ**l****t'!iiﬂ**

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 7:50 FM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.c ntaiping.com>; Jowyn Tay clawyn,ta',r@sg.cntaiping.r.u m=; Joel Goh
<joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Zayyer (LKKAuto) <zayyer@Ikkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
<vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

1




Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SJA72418B (01 : CT1 - TBA) and SHA9128G (TP : LKK REF -
CC3IET|1?0245281FK1W|:|3} on 23.12.2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Jowyn,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHA 9128G at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte
Ltd (Loyang).

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Our case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 B625.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
8lk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www symanteccloud.com




COMFORIDELCRO

~ ENGINEERING
COMPORILELCRL
Team: ARC Repair TP(CFSO}1
e A e

CITYCAB PTE LTD
7010070

STONSR'S83 SIN MING DRIVE
singapore SINGAPORE R75T717

AMS

Date/Time: 76 12,2017 14:03 FPags : 1
JOB CARD sales Order: JC NO305100825
: ' REGNNQI: 01 0 \ MILEAGE
MAKE S oA | FUEL

F

MODELL- 1US HYBRID(G4)23)

i

5551188
L. (A e]] ¥R OF TARGET DATE
# M5, 2017
CHASSE COMPLETION DATETIME:
SCOUNT GARD NO. B - - - E;fﬁﬁ:’-FUEG%S?{}Sé 3
B D RIFT

Accident Date! 23.12.2017

NATURE: 3F 23.12.2017

3/NC LABOR CODE DESCRIPTICN
JECKED & PASSED OUT BY:

SERVICE ADVISOR CUSTOMER'S SIGNATURE
qh

wwhedgament Slip Exlt Pass

Bl
o Vahicle MNa.:
ala No.t SHAS128G CHIANG @ SHAS128G
18 of Sendos Advisor Signature/Date Nams of Service Advisor Date

& returned to Sarvice Reception upon eoltection

'| To bie Hept by Security Guard
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CITY.CAB PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE 26/12/2017 15:01
VEHICLE NO : SHA 9128G _ ( \ ﬂv\@{
MAKE : A \L'-L k\ J
MODEL . TOYOTA PRIUS
I PARTS DESCRIPTION QTY |UNITPRICE| AMOUNT
T FRONT BUMPER COVER —~ e/ $ 490,50 | °
FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMNENT & $ 691.50
FRONT BUMPER SPONGE J A $ 78.80
FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE Pkl $ 148.60
FRONT BUMPER CLIPS ~ a* 3 22.00
ABSORBER, FRONT BUMPER, LOWER (SPONGE LOWER) S#:f“‘ $ 127.70
fFrt Hpdlnp (LH) 7~ o™ f 257219
SUB TOTAL $ 1,559.10
LESS 25% $ 389.78
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 1,169.33
FRONT NO. PLATE . —  #+ $ 25.00 |[NETT
FRONT NO PLATE TRIM COVER i $ 30.00 |NETT
ERONT NO.PLATE GARNISH - o s 2% 99.00 |NEIA-
FRONT BUMPER LOGO o~ ( 7orde) s 110 87.10 |NeAT -
$ 241.10
;&( /[(:':, (LS
L) f(bé
LABOUR CHARGE % X ?/ fa |/ |_ 20
Panel Beating .2 ﬂ? 2 5 $ :ym'ﬂf
Spray Painting Charge fy/' i :’ ,r' 1% ——Wf"
4—34 F#ti—{ F f{-
TOTAL LABOUR E 600.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $ 2,040.43
'ﬁ»ﬁ
This is an initial estimate hased on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair guantum will
|be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.

Page 1 of 1



CITY CAB PTELTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE 26/12/2017 15:01

VEHICLENNO : SHA 9128G T
( “ R YL 's

MAKE . ’ Il. I\_-\. L .\ \ Y

MODEL : TOYQTA PRIUS : \

[ PARTS DESCRIPTION QTY |UNITPRICE|  AMOUNT

FRONT BUMPER COVER -~ 490.50

|

$
FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMNENT - s 691.50
ERONT BUMPER SPONGE - $ 78.80
FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE =g $ 148.60
FRONT BUMPER CLIPS -~ 5 22.00
ABSOREBER, FRONT BUMPER, LOWER (SPONGE LOWER) % 127.70
SUB TOTAL $ 1,559.10
LESS 25% $ 389.78
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 1,169.33
FRONT NO. PLATE — $ 25.00 [NETT
ERONT NO PLATE TRIM COVER “ i $ 30.00 |NETT
FRONT NO.PLATE GARNISH — I s 99.00 |NETT
FRONT BUMPER LOGO ( Zerde) v 87.10 |NETT
$ | 241.10

ot 2 5 B [ :4
LABOUR CHARGE % 2 ?’/ fa | 1ee 20
Panel Beating 2 ﬂ-—; z $ M
Spray Painting Charge ¥, $ },0-31011"
-}L-’-f Fﬂi{ f?g £ -
TOTAL LABOUR g 600.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL $ 2,010.43

—— —— ————

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will
be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.

Page 1 of 1



COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD Date: 09.01.2018

Time: 14:39:58
REPAIR ESTIMATE Page: |
COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) 0B NO - 305100825
CUSTOMER: 7010070 REGN NO . SHAS128G
ADDRESS : CITYCAB PTE LTD MILEAGE - 0000000000
1%3 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE . TOYOTA
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL - PRIUS HYBRID{G4)
A3551188 DATE OF REGN . 31.05.2017
DATETIME IN . 23122017 12:30
ACCIDENT DATE © 23122017
JOB / PARTS DESCRIPTION OTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

E“‘EQT REQUISITION

0001 04-01-0302-2292-G  PRIG4 COVER FRONT BUMPER | 490.50 25.00 367.87
00072 04-01-0302-2267-G PRIVC BUMPER PIECE 10 22,00 25.00 16.50

0003 04-01-0302-2062-G  PRIG4 GRILLE RADIATOR LOW 1 14860 25.00 L11.45

0004 04-01-0302-0988-G  PRIG4 EMBLEM ASSY RADIATO 1 87.10 25.00 63.32°
0005 04-01-0302-2170-G  PRIG4 BRACKET FRT BUMPER |  99.00 25.00 7425 °

0006 FNPS NO PLATE(S) 1L 5500 2.50- 55.00

0007 04-01-0302-2815-G  PRIG4 UNIT ASSY HEADLAMP 1 2.530.10 25.00 1.897.57
0008 04-01-0302-0635-G  PRIG4 ABSORBER FRONT BUMP 1 78.80 25.00 59,10

~ SUB-TOTAL : 2.647.06

JOB NATURE
0000 L PANEL BEATING 200.00
nO01 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA 180.00

SUB-TOTAL : 380.00




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD Date: 09.01.2018

Time: 14:39:58
REPAIR ESTIMATE Page: 2
COMPANY ; THIRD PARTY'S C LAIMS (CAS) OB NO 305100825
CUSTOMER: 7010070 REGN NO SHAS12RG
ADDRESS : CITYCAB PTELTD MILEAGE 000000000
383 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE TOYOTA
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL PRILS HYBRID{C
65551188 DATE OF REGN 31.05.2017
DATETIME IN 23.12.2017 12:30
ACCIDENT DATE 23.12.2017

JOB /| PARTS DESCRIPTION

OTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

MVA NAME & SIGNATURE
DATE :

TOTAL @ 3,027.06

AUTHORISED : YES / NO
SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE
DATE:




COMFORIDELCRO

ENGINEERING
Our Job Ref Mo @ 305100825
: CamionDelEn Enginesring Ple Ltd
Date o7/01M18 59 Loyang Drive sgingamre 508368
i == 33 = o Fax: G546 8156
FINALIZATION FORM
To LKK Fax:
Altn KALVIN
Vehicle RegNo. @ SHAZ1 286G 2311212017
The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned vehicle are as follows:-
T, The repair job shall bill o CHINA SJAT241B
2 The finalized amount shall be:
{a) Spare Paris after List discount sz_sdT.ug
()  Labour Charges $380.00
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost sa.uzmg
{c.)  Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Tatal for Lumpsum repair cost afler Less: 20%
Final Lumpsum Repair cost
3 Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 working days.
4. We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if there is no reply from you within 7
waorking days =
5. Thark you for your assistarice. We confirm the estimates and
finalized amount
II
Signature ) 'k Signature
Name - CHIANG Name : JCa b
Tel 62148314 Date ))&
Fax 65468156

For Official Use Only

Document

Confirm By
Item Amount Attached : Ramarks
Y¥es or No (Signature)
1. Rental Rate P/Day YES
Loss of Income Paid M

Survey Fees

LTA Search Fes

G[E [ [

Medical Fees (on behalf
of driver, if applicable)

Owearrun

Remarks:




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

. m —— 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
T TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 5256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9807198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD Ref © CC3/CTI17024528/K1wb3n2
Féﬁﬁ’iﬂgﬂhﬁoﬂ%@g.mwm 079909 Dafe: 22032010 mm‘mmmmm
Code : CTI
1z Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJA 7241B Veh. Inspected SHA 91286
Policy No. DMHCSN3067211700 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM17D07285C0211 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 27122017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAPRIUS c.c 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 207
Chassis No. JTDKB3FU203557084 Colour YELLOW
Odometer 73895 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre 185/65 R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [195/85R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 BRIDGESTONE 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/12/2017 |Inspection Date 2711212017
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTELTD
50 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




' ’d V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-, - ; ) 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-26 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
g, TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No; 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo..1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHA 9128G
Estimate r Adjus
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo ﬁ;';ﬂ P?gﬂ Qu ﬁl} ted
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER COVER DEFORMED 490.50 490.50
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT SERVICEABLE 691.50 .
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE TORN 78.80 78.80
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE CRACKED 148.60 148.60
10| FRONT BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 22 00 22.00
1| ABSORBER ,FRONT BUMPER LOWER (SPONGE LOWER) SERVICEABLE 127.70 "
1|FRONT HEADLAMP (LH) CRACKED 2,530.10 2.530.10
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,022.30 B17.49
3,066.90 2.452.51
1|FRONT NO.PLATE GARNISH CRACKED 99.00 99.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOGO (TOYOTA) NECESSARY 87.10 87.10
LESS 25% DISCOUNT . -46.53
186.10 130.57
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT NO.PLATE (SN) DENTED 25.00 25.00
1|FRONT NO PLATE TRIM COVER (SN) CRACKED 30.00 30.00
55.00 55.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING . 400.00 200.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 200.00 180,00
600.00 380.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,908.00 3,027.08
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS [ | 3,027.08|

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI1 7024528/K1wb3n2

!"I !

KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessor




