Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 20 July, 2018 4:05 PM

To: 'Accord Claims(AV)'; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving Vehicle SFD8376X & SLS6691Z on 24.12.2017
Dear Celia,

Thank you for the email.
Dear Vic,
Kindly assist.

FYNA Our Ref : CC4/AIG17024503/Khb3

BEST REGARDS,
G.Nivitha | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Accord Claims(AV) [mailto:avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 20 July 2018 4:00 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Accident Involving Vehicle SFD8376X & SLS6691Z on 24.12.2017

Dear Officer In Charge,

Kindly assist advise any update/outcome of the claim as above mention.
Our LOD and invoices is post to your on Apr.

Please revert.

Thank you.

Kind regards,
Celia Lai

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 1009 Bukit Merah Lane 3
#01-80

Singapore 159723

Mobile: (65) 9274 0999
Tel :(65) 6271 7433
Fax :(65) 6274 5715
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