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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Vimmala D/O Raja Singam <vimmala_rajasingam@sg.msig-asia.com>
Sent: Friday, 12 January, 2018 10:20 AM

Subject: RE: Enquire on market value - SKR6616J - Urgent Request
Attachments: enquireRebateByPublicBefo.pdf

Hi,

Please advice on the market value for vehicle number SKR6616J urgently.

Date of accident: 21/12/2017

Attached the rebate details. C? LP___ ? g/

Thank you.

Mala (Ms)
Senior Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2471 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | vimmala_rajasingam@sg.msig-asia.com

b insurer Claims
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:
Owner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

Singapore NRIC

92659B

SKR6616)
Yes
12 Jan 2018

B.MW.

2181 ACTIVE TOURER D/AB LED DSC ABS

NAV

Blue

2014

F8490985B38A15A
WBA2A32090VZ50863
100.0 kW (134 bhp)
$27,047.00  Dp /'. [
27 Feb 2015

27 Feb 2015

0

$19,866.00 9 3 ‘3 3

Yes
26 Feb 2025

$14,899.00



COE Expiry Date: 26 Feb 2025

COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $67,901.00

COE Rebate Amount: $47,560.00

Total Rebate Amount: $62,459.00

The information contained hereinis correct as at 12 Jan 2018

OK



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January 2018 9:11 AM

To: 'Vimmala D/O Raja Singam'

Cc SUR

Subject: RE: Enquire on market value - SKR6616) - Urgent Request
Dear Mala,

The market value for SKR 6616J is $94K - $98K(Est) as at December 2017

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Vimmala D/O Raja Singam [mailto:vimmaIa_rajasingam@sg.msig—asia.com]
Sent: Friday, 12 January 2018 10:20 AM
Subject: RE: Enquire on market value - SKR6616J - Urgent Request

Hi,
Please advice on the market value for vehicle number SKR6616J urgently.

Date of accident: 21/12/2017
Attached the rebate details.

Thank you.
Mala (Ms)

Senior Admin Officer, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2471 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | vimmala rajasingam@sg.msig-asia.com

Insurer Claims
Team of the Year
2016
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