Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 March 2018 4:53 PM

To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Jowyn Tay; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL.... Accident Involving SKU7245Z (01
SNM17D07311C02/5) and SHBS759G (TP : LKK REF -CC3/CTI17024488/5yb3) on
22122017

LKK REF -CC3/CTI17024488/5yb3
CTI REF - SNM17D07311€02/5 (SKU72452)

Dear Jas

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $7,560.14.
We await your payment advice to enable Jowyn to act accordingly.
Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd

3 Anson Road

#15-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID:  +B656389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 T175/6224 TAT8

Email: claimsdept{@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; ity contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except where provided for
i @ written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid, Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in
whale ar partial, is prohibited. If vou are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) [mailto:jaskhine @lkkauto.com)]

Sent: Tuesday, March 13, 2018 1:07 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Sharon Han <sharon.han@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay
<jrene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: PENDING MANDATE APPROVAL.....Accident Involving SKU7245Z (01 : SNM17D07311C02/5) and SHB5759G (TP :
LKK REF -CC3/CT117024488/Syb3) on 22.12.2017

Dear Sir,



Further to the below matter.

Kindly advise your mandate approval for our further negotiating and settlement as TP repairer is chasing us.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 March 2018 4:36 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: 'alfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com’' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU7245Z (O : CAl - SKU7245Z) and SHB5759G (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI117024488/Syb3) on 22,12.2017

Dear Sir,

Further to the below matter.

This is a case of 3 vehicles chain collision. As per video, TP vehicle was driving within his own lane and being hit by
insured from the right. Due to the impact force TP swerved to the left and collided with another oncoming vehicle. BOLA

28 ( ¢ ) applies and Ol is liable to TP vehicle losses. (Please see the attached)

We proposed to offer to repairer "SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD" as follows:

Cost of Repair 5 17,004.30 5 6,153.62
Loss of rental ($125.19 x 8 days) 5 1,001.52 S 1,001.52
Loss of income (560 x 8 days) 5 480.00 5 400.00
LTA Search Fee 5 5.00 5 5.00

Total s 18,490.82 s 7,560.14

Our surveyor recommended 6 working days + 1 weekend + 1 Public Holiday.
The above is for your kind approval please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Thursday, 28 December 2017 11:15 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>



Cc: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com=; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU7245Z (Ol : CAl - SKU72452) and SHB5759G (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI17024488/Syb3) on 22.12.2017

Dear Shu Pe|
Attached our insured’s accident report for your attention.
Best Regards

Joel Goh
Claims Executive (Motor Division)
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-02

Springleaf Tower Singapore 079903

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6385 6184

Fax: 6224 7175/ 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer : This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte.
Ltd. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore} Pre. Ltd. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the
message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 5:46 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred toh@sg.cntaiping. com>; Joel Goh <joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com=>; Jowyn Tay
<jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com=; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com=; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@Ilkkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU7245Z (OI : CAI - TBA) and SHB5759G (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT117024488/Syb3) on 22.12.2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHB 5759G at M/s SMRT Automotive Services Pte
Ltd - Woodlands.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
TP estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured'’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jas and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2928,

3



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.

For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




@Smm AR REGISTERED

SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4

Singapore 757705
. - Tel - 65 6866 2650
[ China Taiping Insurance (5) Ptd Ltd Fax 65 G368 7421
whww . Smirt. Corm. 59
cfo LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date : 18/01/2018

Our Ref.: TAX/12/17/2129/EB

Your Ref. : TBA
Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB5759G AND SKU7245Z & SLCA4665Y ON 22/12/2017
ALONG TPE TOWARDS UPPER CHANGI RD EAST ==

LETTER OF CLAIM

We claim on behalf of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD, owner/hirer of the vehicle Reg. No.: SHB5759G.
Your driver's negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has
suffered the following losses:-

1. Cost of Repair j $6.153.62
2. Loss of Use for days @ 53 /day
3. Lossof Rentalfor _8 days @ S5 _125.19 /day : $1.001.52
4. Lossof Income for _8 days @ 5% _60.00 /day $480.00
5. Puolice Report/ SAS Report! LTA Search Fee ; $5.00
6. Survey Fee
7. Others :

Total Claims $7,640.14

We enclose the following documents :

Repair Invoice Letter of Authorisation
[[] survey Report LTA Search result
[ Protographs pcs Others :

[] investigation resuits 1. [T '

Procichmobee‘Raﬁ!lm 2
Police / SAS report of __ SHB5750G 3.

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this
letter. Payment by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to __ SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD

Yours sincerely,
SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTELTD
™ c.c

Eileen Bay
For Manager, Claims
Claims Department
DID: 6866 2797
E: eileenbay@smrt.com.sg

FR-AS-CLM-02 REV 2



Jas Khine (LKKAuto)

.—_——_——

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuta)

Sent: Monday, 5 March 2018 428 PM

To: JUCALUJO@GMAIL.COM'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU 7245Z, SHB 5759G & OTHER VEHICLE ALONG/AT CHANGI

ROAD OM 22/12/2017

Our Ref: CC3/CTI17024488/5yb3

05 MARCH 2018
TAN SIEW ENG
Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU 72452, SHB 5759G & OTHER VEHICLE ALONG/AT CHANGI ROAD ON 22/12/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given us
your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for
an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter/email.

Please call us if you have further gueries.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I'We. SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD (“the third party claimant™) of 60 WOODLANDS
INDUSTRIAL PARK E4. SINGAPORE 757705 (address), owner of SHB 5759G (vehicle
no.) hereby authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD _ (“the workshop™) to

act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™)
for my vehicle no. _SHB 57596 was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on
22/12/2017 (date) along CHANGI ROAD (location) involving vehicle no/s SKU 72457 (“the

accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they

deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of

my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the SMRT TAXIS PTE L1D.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers

of the other vehicle/s is concerned.
Dated this !g; (day) of M&cle  (month) 2018 (year)

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop™
(with chop if applicable) (with chop)



@ SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE

Date: & ?7\ i ) :'Zs:‘lll-,{.

Our Ref, No.:

Letter of Authorisation

L XU HAgand (NRIC No.: ~SO¥S7438 ) the
registered hirer / relief-driver / contract hirer of SMRT taxi registration number
(UE "-HLEELQ_ hereby authorise SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

(“AutoSvs”) to deal with all matters arising out of the accident between my taxi

and kU Awmgy happened on 22855 D.')l'.)*?
a|0ng LHM‘ F"E

(the "Accident”) on my behalf, including but not limited to instituting and any claims or
proceedings against such party or parties (as AutoSvs deems fit in its absolute
discretion) in respect of any claim, demand, loss, cost, expense, liability, damages or

action made against us or incurred or suffered by us.

Without prejudice to the foregoing, | further authorise AutoSvs to negotiate, resolve
and settle any proceeding or claim arising out of the accidents, including but not limited
to doing any act or executing any document or signing the Discharge Voucher on my

behalf as may be required.

Name Xb‘-l'\ﬁlﬁ“\} ............... Signature: "‘}(3311‘1

NRICNo. :..S0.887428/T............

TelNo.  :...835733122. ..

address - BUS 13T #133-06 BeDek NoRDH AVE. 3
SPoke HEORT e

FR-AS-CLM-03 REV 3



MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Polisy Mo ¢ DHMPCEN3ILZ3501600 Claim Mo © SKEM1TDOT3ILICOH2/5
Claimant : SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD
amount :  BET,.560.00

Singapore Dollars Sewven Thousand Five Hundred And Sixty Only

1/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid te mefus in full &
final sertlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by mefus throogh an accident invelwving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SHB 5759G
Insured Venicle No. @ SKO 7245%
Date of Loss 3 ZRYLEEALT
Flace of Accident v CHANGI ROAD

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aferementicned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE)} PTE. LTD., I/We agrse absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURAMCE (SINGAPOEE] PTE. LTD. and/or

Inzured HName : TAN SIEW ENG
Driver: Hame : TAN WEI REN TERENCE

frem all claims, present or future in respect of -all less; 4injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising sut of the said aceident.

! acknowledge that this payment 1s made without admission of liakility on the
part of CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE} PTE. LTD.

Global Sum : 557,3560.00
Total + $57,580.00

I.I
Claimant: Mame: e - ) ; HRIC Mo 1 qlLF}MF

14 MAR 2018

Signatura : quil Date :



SITNIRT

ALUTOMOTIVE

Customer Code: 3000063

EMRET TAXIS PTE LTD
lock

Onit

a0 WODDLANDS IHDUSTRIAL
SINGAPORE 757705

PARKE Ed

SHMRT Rutomotive Services Pte Ltd
251 Morth Bridge Road Singapore 179102

Tal: 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247

Tax Invoice

3T Reg Mo. @ MR-8500001-7
CEN : 199004280Z
Invoice No. ._IUlSUlDDZDE
Date 10.01.2018
Vehicle HNo. SHBESTS9G

Your BRef No. TAX/12/17/2129
Jur Eaf 24083787

Terms 30 Days

Mo,

Degzcription

Add

S (Discount) Amount

Amount

Parts

FENDER SUB-RS5Y¥, FR , RH
EMBLEM, SIDE PANEL { HYBRID)
LINEER, FR FENDER, RH

WHEEL, DISC

MOULDING ASSY,
EH

BODY ROCKER FPAMNEL
FANEL ASSY, FE DCOR BRH
ETICEER DBECAL 3SMET (DIOR)
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HINGE FLROWT DOGR

DOOR
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(L
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BUMPER
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B
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FRONT RH
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RButhorised Signature
for SMRT Rutomotiwve Services Pte Ltd
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SINRT

SHMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd
251 Horth Bridge Road Singapore 1739102
Tal: 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247

AUTOMOTIVE Tax Ir.l.VGl ce
Customer Code: 3000063 5T Beg No. MR-8500001-7
RN 1990042802
SMRT TAMIS PTE LTD Invoice Mo. IV1IBO1002089
Date ¢ 10.01.2018
Block Unit Yehicle No. SHBS759G
Your Ref NWo. TAX/12/17/2123
60 WOODLAMDS IWDUSTRIAL PABK E4 our Hef Ho., 24093787
SINGAPORE 757745 Terms : 30 Days
Description - Qty Unit ff?; / (Discount} Amcount
o Cost % Amount
LH
HUR & BEARING RSSY, EH & LH 100 % 558D (25,00 ) £ 138.55 & 415,65
Sub-Total § 361364
Labouzr
TO REPAIR RH FORTIOGH 100 & 300.90 0.00 = .00 L] 30000
T BEPAIR TLH FORTION 1.00 5 400.00 0.00 3 0,00 & 400, a0
Cthers
TO CHECE WIRIHG AWND 3% EM FUMCTION 0.90 5 80.00 n.oo 3 Q.40 3 r, a0
TD APPLY RUST=-BROOEING ON AFFECTED 1.00 & 32000 0,00 & 0.00 ] 36,00
ARER
1 REM AND REFIT TYRE RIM 1.00 & 30,00 D080 S .00 3 30,00
(SPRA PURFPUSE)
TC TRAMNSFER DEOR MECHANISM 2.00 5 360.00 .00 3 (5]¥] = 0.0
T REPLACE SUNDRY PARTS .00 1O .00 0.00 5 .00 o Q. O
T2 WASH RND VACUUM 0,00 % B0.00 Q=00 5 0.00 ] Q.00
TS BEMOVE AND REFIX UNDERCARRIAGE Lot 5 240,060 Q.00 3 2..00 5 ) O
TO DD WHEEL ALIGHMENT / TYRE 1.00 & 60.00 0.0 5 0.00 % 60.00
BALANCING
YO CHECK & RESET SYSTEM FUNCTION 1,00 8§ 120.00 0.0 §  0.00 5 120,00
TQ RESFBAY FROHT FENDER BH 1.00 5 200.00 0,00 5 .00 5 200,00
TO RESPRAY ROCKER PANEL HMOULDING 1:.00 5 Z200.00 .00 g 0.00 2 200.00
TO RESPRAY FRONT DOOR RH 1.00 & 200.00 0.00 & Q.00 & 200.00
TO REPSRAY REAR BIUMPER 1.00 % 200.00 .00 ] .00 5 200,040
TO REESPRAY BREAR FENDER LH 1.00 % 200.90 .00 = 0. 00 5 20004
TO RESPRAY RERR DOOR LY 1.00 § 200.00 6.00 8§  0.00 5 200.00
TO BESPRAY FRONT DOOE LH 1k 5 200,00 Q.00 3 0.00 g 200.00

Page 2/3

for SMRERT Auntomotive Services Pte Ltd

E. & O.F



y SITIRT

AUTOMOTIVE
Customer Code: 3000063
SMRET TAXIS PTE LTD

Block

Orat

60 WOODLARD

CTAMATDAD T
SINGAPORE

SMET Automotive Services Pte Ltd
251 North Bridge Read Singapore 179102
Tal: 65 63311000 Fax: 65 63340247

Tax Invoilice

E5T Reg HNo.

MR-3500001-7

CEN 1320042802
Invoice No. IVIEBD1G0209
Date 10.01:2018
Vehicle MNo. SHBST59G

four Ref Wo TERX/12/17/2126
Jur ReFf He 24093787

Terms : 30 Days

Dascription by Unit Add  / {Discount}) Amount
Cost % Amount
GRAND TOTAL g

Remark
Malke /Model : PRIUSA
Acoident Date 3 22.12.2017
H,B, Payment by cheque should be crossaed and
made payable to fSMRT Automotive Services Pte Litd'.
Ko receipt will be issued unless requestad.

Buthorised Signature

for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 3/3 E. & O.E



S SMRT

Qur Ref : TAXM2/17/2129/EB

Date - 18/01/2018
To : Claims Department
From : SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB5759G AND SKU7245Z & SLC4665Y ON 22/12/2017
ALONG SLIP RD FROM TPE TOWARDS UPPER CHANGI RD EAST

CONFIRMATION OF TAXI RENTAL

This is to confirm the daily taxi rental rate for taxi registration no. SHB5759G is S$125.19/day.

Kindly proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of this accident.

Thank you.

For Manager
SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd
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122652017 Vehicle Hub

Enquire Transaction History

Transaction History Details
Log Date/Time: 26 Dec 2017 £ 13:27:25
Asset Type: Vehicle Transaction Amount:
Asset |D: SKUT7245Z

; ] 18,22 Insurance Enquiry (GIRD :
Transaction Type: Psyrient) Channel:
User ID: ESASEAHO- BALQISH BINTE ABDUL  Business Transaction

' HALIL Reference Ma.:

Search Date / Time: -/22 Dec 2017 22:55.00

Insurance Company:  _~CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE] PTELTD
Information displayed is correct as at the log date and time,

Enquire Related Logs Back to List

hlips:.f.f\rrl.lta.gl:w.ﬁgﬂtﬂu‘wh'aﬂtimﬂﬂuhAQBﬂﬂﬂrnLﬂQD@lﬁﬂ?FUNCT|DN_ID=F1E|:D1 DO4ET

$7.49

External Agency

201712261327256822526
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