Hsiao Tona (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAUto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 August 2018 6:15 PM

To: 'Charandeep Singh’

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: Our ref 74369 Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (O :

DAl - TBA) AND SGX6885P (TP : LKK REF - CC6/DAINT024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Wilthaout Prejudice
Hi,

We refer to the gbove matter.
Case has been settled at $6,500.00{all-in) with Third Party repairer.

We will proceed to close file and submit all the relevant documents to your good office|via email) soonest.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax; 6741-4108

Elk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.singh@directasia.com>

Sent: Saturday, 28 July 2018 12:43 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com=

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: Our ref 74369 _Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (Ol : DAl - TBA) AND
SGXG6885P (TP : LKK REF - CCe/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Dear Hsiao,

Please offer up to 556,500.00 all in.
We will not negotiate for settlement any higher.

Regards
Charan Singh / Claims Specialist
Direct: +65 6603 3617

DirectAsia Insurance
Customer Service: +65 G665 5555
20 Anson Rood, #08-01
Singapore 079912

wiarw . directasia.com
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Sent: Saturday, 28 July, 2018 11:02 AM

To: Charandeep 5ingh

Cc: Admin A

Subject: [EXT] RE: Our ref 74369 _Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (OI : DAL - TBA) AND
SGX6885P (TP : LKK REF - CC6/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

2rd Rerminder
Hi Charan,
Further to our below email,

Kindly let us have your further mandate/ instruction.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkanto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S5{408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Saturday, 7 July 2018 12:03 PM

To: 'Charandeep Singh' <charandeep.singh@directasia.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our ref 74369 _Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (OI : DAl - TBA) AND SGX6885P (TP :
LKK REF - CC6/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Hi Charan,
We refer to our below email.

Kindly let us have your further mandate/ instruction,



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Caze Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 June 2018 12:46 PM

To: 'Charandeep Singh' <charandeep.singh@directasia.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: Our ref 74369 _Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (Ol : DAI - TBA) AND SGX6885P (TP :
LKK REF - CC6/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Without Prejudice

Hi Charan,

Further to your below email.

Flease be informed that third party rejected our offer and proposed global sum $7,000.00{all-in).

For your further instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lklkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Charandeep Singh [mailto:charandeep.singh@directasia.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 5 June 2018 2:33 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Our ref 74369 _Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (O1 : DAl - TBA) AND SGX6885P (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Dear Hsiao Tong,

As mentioned to you earlier there does not appear to be major damages to third party vehicle that warrants a high
repair cost.



At most our offer to the third party is as follows:

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 5.350.00
2. Loss of Rental { ¢ days x $100.00)** $ 70000
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee 3 2,00

TOTAL 6,252.00

Please settle up to the stated amount.

Regards
Charan singh / Claims Specialist
Direct: +65 6603 3617

DirectAsia Insurance

Customer Sarvice: +65 666% 5555
Retall: 88 South Bridge Road, S(058716)
www.directasia.com
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@ikkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, 2 June, 2018 12:16 PM

To: Charandeep Singh

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: Our ref 74369 _Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (OI : DAI - TBA) AND
SGX6885P (TP : LKK REF - CC6/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Hi Charan,
We have reviewed the matter,

According to surveyor, the rear portion of third party vehicle was badly damage due to direct impact from
the rear. The initial estimate from third party amounting to $13,423.34. After check on each and every parts,
surveyor managed fo adjust repair cost at Lump Sum $5.800.00 representing a reduction of 58% on repair

cost. Kindly refer fo our survey photos for your perusal. The dismantiing was not done in front of the SUMvEyor
during the first survey.

Kindly let us have your mandate/ instruction on this matter.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)

From: Charandeep Singh [mailto:charandeep.singh@directasia.com]

Sent: Monday, 9 April 2018 4:13 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LkKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <cadmin-a@lkkauto.coms

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: Our ref 74369 _Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (Ol : DAI - TBA) AND
SGX6885P (TP : LKK REF - CC6/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please reply to my email dated 5™ March 2018,

As mentioned in my email there does not appear to be major damages to third party vehicle that warrants a high
repair cost.

No direct settlement for this case.

Please advise if parts were dismantled in front of the surveyor during survey?

Regards
Charan 5ingh / Claims Spacialist
Direct: +65 6603 35617

DirectAsia Insurance

Customer Service: +65 BEHS 5555
Retail: 88 South Bridee Road, 5[058716)
www . directasia.com
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto;chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 9 April, 2018 8:44 AM

To: Charandeep Singh

Cc: Admin A

Subject: [EXT] RE: Our ref 74369 _Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (OI : DAI - TBA) AND
SGX6885P (TP : LKK REF - CC6/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Hi Charan,

We refer to our email dated 07/02/2018, 05/03/2018 &17/03/2018,

5



Kindly let us have your approval/instruction please.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: f7az-3197 | email: chewht@ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 17 March 2018 8:21 AM

To: Charandeep Singh (charandeep singh@directasia.com) <charandeep.singh@directasia.com>

Cec: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.coms

Subject: RE: Our ref 74369 _Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (Ol : DAI - TBA) AND 5GX6885P (TP :
LKK REF - CCB/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Hi Charan,
We refer to our email dated 07/02/2018 & 05/03/2018.

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction plecse.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 March 2018 9:50 AM

To: Charandeep Singh (charandeep.singh@directasia.com) <charandeep.singh@directasia.com>; Claim
(claim@directasia.com) <claim@directasia.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: Our ref 74369 _Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (Ol : DAl - TBA) AND SGX6885P (TP ;
LKK REF - CC6/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Hi Charan,
We refer to our email dated 07 /02/2018.

Kindly let us have your approval/instruction please,



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Caze Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 February 2018 9:18 AM

To: 'Charandeep Singh' <charandeep.singh@directasia.com>; Motor Claims <motorclaims@directasia.com:; Claim
<glaim@directasia.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our ref 74369 _Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (Ol : DAI - TBA) AND SGX6885P (TP :
LKK REF - CC6/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Without Prejudice
Hi Charan,
We refer to the above matter.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer, Fastech Auto Pte Litd at $7,.308.00(all-in). The breakdown
is as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair [w/GST) $ 6.206.00
2. Loss of Rental (1 1days x $100.00)** 5 1.100.00
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee 3 2.00

TOTAL S7,308.00
**Recommended 07 repair days + 25unday + 2PH = 11days

Enclosed herewith the supporting document for your perusal,

For your approval please.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

From: Charandeep Singh [mailto:charandeep.singh@directasia.com)]
Sent: Monday, 15 January 2018 3:21 PM




To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @Ikkauto.com>; Motor Claims <motorclaims@directasia.com>; Claim

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht @lkkauta.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Aaron Wang
<aaron.wang@directasia.com>; Derrick Quok <derrick@directasia.com>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth@directasia.com>
Subject: Our ref 74369 _Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (O : DAI - TBA) AND SGX6885P (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Dear Sir/Madam,

Ol rear ended third party vehicle . At fault case.

Regards
Charan Singh [/ Claims Speclalist
Diract: +65 6603 3617

DirectAsia Insurance

Customer Service: +65 6665 5555
Retail; 88 South Bridge Road, 5/058715)
wiww.directasia.com

L Ivisdinlolo)
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From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 15 January, 2018 2:39 PM

To: Motor Claims; Claim

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; Aaron Wang; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Charandeep Singh

Subject: [EXT] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (O : DAL - TBA) AND SGX6885P (TP @ LKK REF
- CC6/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please kindly advice liability soonest.

Meanwhile, kindly provide us the claim reference for our necessary action.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Shirlay Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6366-0055 | email; ShirleyHiew@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 29 December 2017 10:45 AM

To: motorclaims@directasia.com: claim@directasia.com

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com:; "Aaron Wang'
<aaron.wang@directasia.com>; 'Derrick Quok' <derrick@directasia.com>; 'Kenneth Lim'

g8



<kenneth@directasia.com>; 'Charandeep 5ingh’ <charandeep.singh@directasia.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKZ3584U (OI : DAl - TBA) AND SGX6885P (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/DAI17024439/Ups3) on 23/12/2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

Woe refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle SGX 6B85P at Fastech Auto Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.
Enclosed for yvour perusal is:

TP's GIA report
Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

FPlease kindly advice liability soonest.
Meanwhile, kindly provide us the claim reference for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE: This message is intended only for the attention of the addressee and may contain legally
privileged and/or confidential information. Its unauthorised use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted. If
you are not the intended recipient, please permanently delete the original, destroy all copies and inform the sender.



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date: 15.01.2013

Direct Asia Insurance (5) Pte Lid
200 Anson Road

#08-01

Singapore 079912

At Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: SGX 6885P  / SKZ 3584U ON  23.12.2017
We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: SGX 6885P . which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no: SKZ 3584U . The vehicle owner has requested and

authorized us to assist him in presenting his‘her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

Iy Cost of Repair (inclusive of G8T) g 6,206.00

2}  Rental 5 1,100.00

3} GIA Search Result b 2.00
5 7,5308.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice ¢) Vehicle Registration Log Card

b} I/'C & Driving License f) Letter of Authorisation, etc...

c) GIA Report / GIA Search Result g) Car Rental Invoice / Agreement

d) Insurance Certificate

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from vou on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

f
Thank you,
Yours faithfully, |1/ ,

A
Jason Tang (jason@fastechauto.com.sg)
FASTECH AUTO PTELTD

]



23.12.2017

DATE
Direct Asia Insurance (S) Pte Ltd
TO
RE :  ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. SGX 6885P and

SKZ 3584U DONLY

ALONG _g) |p ROAD TOWARDS PIE
ON 23122017

I/'We, TAN KOON POH

of (NRIC No/ROC No,)  S'442758!

of 911 LORONG TOA PAYOH #20-06 5-318771

owner of vehicle no. SGX 6885P in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO

PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle SGx 6885p at my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settle receive whatever

amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal
proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,
etc. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I/We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the abovementioned claim cost
which may arisen therewith.

-

- r.\ |:‘l‘_ ‘\.r/ -3

Signature of Owner :

Name of Owner




RELEASE VOUCHER
(Direct Asia Express Third Party Claim)

i r el bl ¢ [
u“-al-I+ A }1/1_.-' i L,. r"-ll'l.' 'i'_. { ¥ L _| &

(*the wockshop™) hereby confinm that wel have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of
Direct Asia [nsurance (Singapors) Pte Ltd LKK &UTO CONSULT*NTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor)

with respect to the amount claimed for £ 65U w‘ {h3ss of use/rental).
: —— (ETAAGHA Y for vehicls a0, { LRREF that was damaged pursuant to the accident
which occurred on 2200 20 1) (dae)along __ 2L P Foed “JorvarA~ P 2

(location) involving vehicles nos. __ & k7 2584 U - This is pursuant o the inspection
conducted on b - 1% I 0L (dare) at “the workshop™.

u‘tL1 1{.*{7_1_-‘. A ]r.l{:..- |!I_.

i

We'l confirm that we/T are/am sutheorized by the owner

4 ...J [ 3 T 2 a
(“the third party claimant™) of vehicle no. derd paas l: to make the claim as set out in the above

paragraph and we/T have full authority to sattle the matter on his'her behalf in 2 manner that we'T deem fit.
We/l enclose herzin the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

We/l further confirm that we/T will indemnify Direct Asia [nsurance (Singapore) Pre Ltd for all damagss,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the svent that “the third party claimant” after
the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffersd

3/ rO e F
pertzining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage o __ >/ A 68kE [

(vehicla no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and fisal settlement of any claim of “the third
party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on & without prejudice
and without admission of liability basis.

This agrsement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapors Courts have exclusive
jurisdiction pver any dispute arising out of the same.
Ol 1

3

Dared this 0 (day) of {month) 20Y (vean




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Direct Asia Insurance (S) Pte Ltd
20 Anson Road

#08-01

Singapore 079912

Tax Invoice. ;20035

Date :15.01.2018
Vehicle No  :5GX 6885P
Make/Model SUZUKI SWIFT
Chassis/Eng# :

Accident Date :23.12.2017

Claim No 11217- 20055

Atn: Motor Claims Department Reference
Palicy No

Amount

To proceed on lump sum repair S% 5,800.00

E.&0C.E. Total : S8 5,800.00

GST @ 7% : 8% 406.00

Amourt Due : 5% o, 3

ke

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
All Invoices are subjected to GST




DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 6741 7244 / 6746 5405 Fax No:67458520
Co. Reg No: 52928467K

To: TAN KOON FOH Invoice : DCR-2018-01-01

Date . 03.01.2018
Agreement No ;19847

Ref : LOD
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle : SKS5871P {  1217-20055 ) 3 1,100.00
Rental Period from  23.12.2017 to 03.01.2018
E.&O.E. Total § 1,100.00
Haply Lee Dok Lesg

for Dynamic Car Rental



Dynamic Car Rental

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883,

TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786
Co. Reg. No. 52028467K

RENTAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS No. 19847
a— -
Nams .T# £ fﬁﬁﬂ f/‘ | REGNe: MAKE MODEL: | f vipg S -
dir LCoain 2 TP T
ADDFESS SER N TN Geser | pernoc [ 1] 1eae] ¢
s s G |
1 KM DA IME
1M | g ! ?f & f ‘*‘ t
RA DALE &1 g
our ST 505
— KM TIME USED T
DAIVEN
" NAMED DRIVER .
?lr‘g Lgac:@% DATE OF EXPIAY PLACE OF ISSUE aours | ess
PASSPORAT NO DATE OF ISSUE PLACE OF ISSUE 11 pavs | @ss {00- ) ff e’ [/1_]
ADD MAMED DRIVER = WEEKS | @as
DAIVING LIGENGE NO | DATE DF EXPIRY | PLAGE OF 153UE MonTHs | @58
PASSPORT NO DATE OF ISSUE | PLACE OF ISSUE BY INITIALLING, BENTER | sup-TOTAL
| AGREES TO PAY ADD FEE
i | FOR COLLISION DAMAGES
IMPORTANT NOTES: WAIVER (C.DW.}
This vahicls s licencad to.carry 04 passengers only
Mo refund will be given for vehlcle retums garly TOTAL RENTAL
Mo rafund will be given los left i vehicle
Hirer s kabls to pay first unsder section | & 1 Inany aockdent plus loss of samings while DELINERY FEE
damaged vehicle is under repair, (%]
Hirar iz liable to pay all parking fea ‘and trathc summonses. COLLECTION FEE
Vehicla return dufing office hour only At e i ey 86000 x
Seri P H o = B '
D U PO e Sy s i e O PER DAY PERWEEK  PER MONTH
ADDITIONAL CONDITIONS: e Exon i St B 5 $ § '
* Geographical areas: Singapors & Weast Malaysia, Witncrmart Extars Dmige 5pone. S0000
* Driver must ba- S BY INITIALLING, RENTER
A} 18 years ol and above: AGREES TO PAY ADD FEE
b} holding & valid relevant class of driving cense: FOA PERSONAL ACCI DENT
; INSURANCE (P.AL}
* Additional Own Damage Excess: of 531,000 is applicable tor any namediunnamed drivers
W
a) age 22 10 23 years old;
b} age 66 to 70 years old, x

¢} with driving exparienca of 1 year 10 |ess than 2 years in Singapare on the relevan classes PER DAY PEA WEEK  PER MONTH

of driving licensa. ﬂ“fﬁﬂh ¢ 3 s
* Additionat All Claims excess of S;Eﬂﬁrls applicabie for any mamediunnamed drivers who;
&} 15 18 yutraold .21 ywss oid sndior PREPAYMENT TOTAL CHARGE

bis 71 years oid and above andior
@] with driving saparonae of [eag than 1 year on the relovant classes of driving keense

CHECK DEPOSIT

* Lipon retuming the repiacement vahicle, you must ensurs that all expensive and mmportant
items to be removed away from this replacemant vehicle. We!l will not be respansibée for | CASH
any reporting of such losses,

RECEIPT MO, NETT CHARGE

* Hirer k& llable to pay first $2000 under section | & 11 in any eccident pus ioss of eaming whia
damage vahscle is undear rapakr

Hirar is responsibla for Additional 2,000 00 Excess AMOUNT DUE | REFUND
o the THIRD PARTY DAMAGE [ INJURY claims

| HAVE READ THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS ON BOTH SIDES
OF THIS RENTAL AGREEMENT AND AGREE THERECF.

SIGNED BY: THE PARTIES HERETD DN THE .l s iessmsioei st ieeisbissisiasrsissssissenrrspsanserinssorsosss DY O i it mperppossiim st siassasinsi s s ems

X < X &7

DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL RENTER'S/DRIVER'S SIGNATURE




Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
I“SME Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE CST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-17-183737
Dale of Request: 2an2/2017 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Lid

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 231272017

Enquiry By KCA USER 1

TP Vehicle No. SkZ3s84U

Accident Date 231272017

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle Mo, Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SKZ3584U Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Ple Lid 19/01/2017-18/01/2018 65322888
SKZ35840 Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid 20/01/2017-19/01/2019 B5322888
Thank You,

The images provided lo you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatscever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_... 23-Dec-17
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GENERAL
INSURANCE

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF
SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm

GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-17-193737
Date of Request: 23/12/2017 Your Ref No:

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue & #01-48
AutoBay@HKaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 231122017

Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TP Vehicle No. SKZ3584U
Accident Date 23M2/2017

Online Purchase

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date;
[X] GIRO[] Cash[] Cheque

https:fisingapone. marimen.comiclaimsiindex.cfmlusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninviplrafid=16T69395CFID=26T622604CFTOKEN=Kd8.., 22



