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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3581 FAX 6256 4315

Reg. No: 188807188R GST Rieg. No. 18-9607138-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CC4/AXA1TT024438/Upb3
s owe: zzzor | |[{H1HNAN
Code . AXA2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLV 57D Veh. Inspected YP 38784
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 272y
X Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c o
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. . ~ Description of Damages
5. General Information :
Accident Date  26/12/2017 |Inspection Date 26/1212017
Survey held at KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
Sa. Remarks i s

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS




KIM CHWEE AUTO PTELTD

VEHICLEND : YP3878)

Qarty PARTICULAR

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS :

1PCS TAILLAMP 0/5 Crx 4o
1PCS REAR LICENSE PLATE Lamp 177

1PCS REAR LICENSE PLATE Lan

1PCS TAILGATE WOODEN BOARD # -

1PCS TAILGATE 6DKM/H STICKER A1

1PCS 24 PAX STICKER A

1PCS TAILGATE WOODEN LOWER MEMBER (e
1PCS TAILGATE STEP WOODEN BOARD Cra
1PCS REAR HORIZONTAL WOODEN BOARD O/fS A A
1PCS REAR ALUMINIUM PANELO/S T

1PCS TAILGATE LOWER METAL PLATE 7L

1PCS REAR SAFETY BAR BUMPER A A

LABOUR CHARGES :

TO CHECK WIRING

TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING

LABOUR TO LIFT UP CARGO DECK FOR REPLACING WOODEN BOARD
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING

TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING

AMOUNT 55

00 v~

$105.00 X

$30,00 /4. A/
$2,200.00

$20.00

$20.00 ¢
$1,200.00 ae _’J

$850.00 ¢ _J
51,500.00 -..c

$300.00 1, 5 ¢ )

$600.00 ;( -
$1,200,00 ¥

TOTAL : $8,291.00

$50.00 2 O
A7 850,00 <
$380.00 )
SBBu,nu{éL C
$600.00 <0 )

TOTAL:  $10,057.00

il
2404
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

-

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:;

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No::

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category;
COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Company

4592C

YP3878)

No

27 Dec 2017

MITSUBISHI

CANTER FEB2Z1ER3SDEB
White

2016

4P10C24825

FEB21EA206563

§33,702.00
10 Aug 2016
10 Aug 2016
o

$1.686.00

No

$0.00

09 Aug 2026

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$47 B89.00

$41,272.00

rage | of £

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTI... 27/12/2017
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From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 3:32 PM

To: LOH Cynthia

Cc SANSON Nel Jason Jover; Admin A, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLVS7D - GA224043 - STMO0G3L - Video

Attachments: MDR 171226 113949 E2 mp4; img-171227152301 pdf; LKK Auto.pdf

Dear Cynthia,
N {'1&(;-.';_‘\{.[\_\.'--\'\'.0*‘ '
Thank for your email. I o
dnK you you -"]'\ { -._.1"E 0 ’ !ﬁ., 'fl"h :
Dear Hsiao Tong, |

FYNA please.
Thank you
To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

flest Fegaras

St Poi| Admg

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 8166-005%% | emall shupe @b gito cnm | fax; 6§741-4108 s | T rJL A “y

Hik 51, Paya UL Industrial Park, Ubl avenua 1, #02-25 | S{208933) ! "ol P L

From: LOH Cynthia [mailto:cynthia. loh@axa.com.sg)
Sent: Tuesday, 30 January 2018 3:00 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SANSON Nel Jason Jover <sanson.nel@axa.com .sg>
Subject: FW: SLV57D - GA294043 - STM0063L - Video
Importance: High

Dear LKK,

FYNA - please liaise with Ol before any settlement.

Thanks & Regards,

Cynthia Loh | Specialist, Motor Claims Department

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com sg
Email: gynthia.loh@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741

redefining /insurance




L

Plerasi nsider the environment before printing this message

From: SANSON Nel Jason Jover

Sent: Tuesday, lanuary 30, 2018 12:42 PM

To: LOH Cynthia <cynthia lohE@axa carm sg>
Subject: SLVS7D - GA294043 - S7TMO0B3L - Video

Dear Cynthia,

Please assist to review the attached video sent by the insured
He wants us to defend his case as he believes that he has no liability at all even if it was a chain collision,
Thanks

1 -_.|I||':._

Nel Jason Sanson | Specialist, Gl Cantact Centre - Palicy and Claim Service

AXA Insurance Pte Lid | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.si
Emalsanson.nel@axa.com.sg

Phione: |b5) 98552650, (65) GEE0 4703

GLOBAL INSURANCE
BRAND

FOR THE 8™
CONSECUTIVE YEAR

—=meee——-- Original Message ——-————-
From: Terence [skied1@gmail.com]
Sent: 29/01/2018 20:54

To: Cslitaxa.com. S8
Subject: Attn: Nel, re: Accident involving vehicle SLV57D
Dear Nel,

| refer to the accident involving my car (vehicle number SLV 57 D) along
the CTE towards AYE, on the 26th of December 2017.

As discussed on the phone earlier, | have video evidence from my car
showing that my vehicle was already completely stopped prior to the bus
behind me, hitting me (causing me to hit the truck in front of me),

The Youtube link to the video evidence is as follows:

hirps.//www. yautube com/watch Pv=xZJOWKF FWEk

T ol 1 !
| have also attached with this e-mail, a copy of the letter | received . ot

from the loss adjuster representing the vehicle in front of me in the
accident (YP 3878 J).

For your convenience | have also attached a copy of the original
2



L
accident report | made when sending my vehicle for repair.

As per your instructions | have not contacted the loss adjuster who sent
me the letter. | have tried my best to provide you with everything to
show that | should not be liable in any way for this accident. Please
kindly confirm that you have received this information, and also let me
know if anything further is required from my end.

Yours sincerely,
Terence Chin

Vehicle Owner: SLV 57 D
Tel: 98571275

-——Disclaimer--—

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
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moss diffssal

Certificate of Insurance

MEITOR VEHICLES [THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION] ACT (CHAFTER 189)
MOTOR VEHICLES [THIRD PARTY RISKS AND COMPENSATION] RULES, 1960

ROAD TRANSPORT ACT, 1987 |MALAYSIA]

MOTOR VEHICLES [THIRD PARTY RISKS) RULES, 1959 (MALAYEIA]

Certificate Number © 5082507645-01 Cover : Comprehensive
1 Ingss mark and Rsgivration Number of Vehicis YP3IETHI
Chagily Nurmbar FEBI1EAZDGRI
2. Name of Policyholder SHLINXLUE BLILDERS PTE LTD.
3. Eftective Date of insurance 10 Aug 2017
d_ Expiry Date of insurance © 09 Aug 2018
L PBersond o Classed of Pergony entitled to drives

(n] The Policyholdar

b} Any other perion who is driving on the Palloyholder's order or with his/her permission
Providid that the parion driving is permitted in accordance with the licensing or other laws of regulations to dfive
thi Motor Vehicle ar nas been w0 permicted and is not disqualified by order of a Court of Law o by reason of any
practment ar regulation in that Behalf from driving the Maotor Vehicke.

B Lmitationm & 1 Uwed
lal Use for socsl domestic and pléasure purposes and in connection with the Policyholder's business or profession,
(b} Use for the carriage of passengers or goodt in connectlon with the Policyhalder's business
Thn Policy does nof cover
ia) Use for hire or rewaro.
(b1 Use for raong, pace-maing, relwbiiity tngl or speed-testing:
(6] Use wnliET graweng @ trailer escept the Towing of any ane disabled mechamically propelied vehicle.

& Limitations rendered inoperative by Section 8 of the Mator Vehicle (Thind Party Risks and Compensatian)
At (Chapher |89} ang Saction 95 of the Road Traniport Act, 1987 (Malayiia), are not 1o be ncludsd under thess

headinigs.
EXCESS (SECTION 1) ¢ 55600
ENCESS (SECTION 1) CoNfA
WINDSCREEN EXCESS : 55100
INSURE WTTH CIOE ¢ YES
HIRE PURCHASE COMPANY r GOLDBELL FINANCIAL SERVICES PTELTD
SUM INSURED i MARKET VALUE OF INSURED VEHICLE AT TIME OF LOS5

I'We herebry Cartify that the Palicy to which this Certificate relates is ssued n accordance with the provisions of the Motar
WVehiches [Thued Party Risks and Compensation] Act [Chapter 189} and Part IV of the Apad Transpart Act, 1987 |Malaysia)

| apency . COWELL INSURANCE (AGENCY| PTE LTD (DODDDE10380)
Date of by 03 Aug 2017 1507 hrs
Heprint 03 Aug 2017 1507 hrs

For NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LIMITED

//"

Authorised Officer Chief Executive

Countersigned By




PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page 1 of 2

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |D Type: Company
Owner |ID: 4592C

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo YP3a78)
Vehicle ta be Exported: Mo

Intended De-registration 26 Dec 2017
Date:

Vehicle Make: MITSUBISHI
Vehicle Moded: CANTERFEB21ER3SDER
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2016

Engine No, 4P10C24825
Chassis No. FEB21EA20663
Maximum Power Dutput:

Open Market Value: $33,702.00
Original Registration Date; 10 Aug 2016
First Registration Date: 10 Aug 2016
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid; $1.686.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Mo
PARF Eligibility Expiry

Dates

PARF Rebate Amount: S0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date 09 Aug 2024

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Pald: $47 B89.00

COE Rebate Amount: $41.284.00

Total Rebate Amount: $41.284.00

The information contained hereln is correct as at 24 Dec 2017

https://vrl Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By Public BeforeDereg Input 2FUNCTL...  26-Dec-17



1002372018 Claim Partal

« I :Mandate |A> - STM0063L [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SLV 57D (O) & YP 3878) (TP) ON 26/12/2017

Type
& Question

Message

Liability: 100%. 3 vehicles chain collision whereby Ol was 2nd car. Inform Ol about third party claim. Agreed
to let insurance handle and aware NCD issue. We seek your mandate at $2,592.00(all-in). TP-Mandate |1A
had been uploaded in Smartclaims. Kindly let us have your approval/instruction. Hsiao Tong - 23-Oct-19

hittps:ivp, smariclaims axs com sgiclaim-portalhtmliindex-vendor-service-reguests himi#service-requests/view-message/ TserviceRequestNumbe m
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Smrmpany Beygratratoee W

i - e il
S IERYE T, EELEES Ay A U0 PSE s TR A TAREK, sESG AP omEil TRE - ieE aIER MR FAYN
Immediate Advice
To : AXA Insurance Pte Ltd
Survey Details:

Date of loss 26.12.2017

Date of appointment 27.12.2017

Date of survey 26.12.2017

Location of survey KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD

Vehicle Details:

Claim Type: Third party

Vehicle number YP3B78]

1 ERAS T VAR

it hlAREL)E

DATE: 23/10/2019

(est)
{est)

Make and Model Mitsubishi Canter (2998cc)

Date of registration 10.08.2016

Excess

Market Value/ Book Value 5 58,000.00

Parf/COE Rebate 5 41,272.00

Nett Value/ ERV 5 16,728.00

Repair details:

[Initial Estimate B 10,057.00 |
Proposed/Revised repair cost:

Parts 5 1,684.00

Check items (estimate) NIL

Labour 5 820.00

Supplementary NIL

Total 5 2,504.00

Lump Sum(if applicable) 5 2,000.00

|est)

|Numher of days for repair |




B 74’ .
;_.J; = ; -lu J;rum Campang Wegealtainn e 19T ER
0 A D A S AN A I IS ST PAHK STST AT iRy R s BIEARNEE] DAY i) m2dadi)E
Remarks:
3 vehicles chain collision whereby insured was 2nd car
Mandate:
Liability(TP) 100%
Proposed repair cost (w/GST) S 2,140.00
Loss of use 5 450.00 (3days x $150.00)
Loss of rental MNIL
Loss of income NIL
LTA/GIA search fees 5 2.00
Others MIL
Proposed Total 5 2,592.00




ﬂsiau Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: Shu Pei [LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 29 October 2019 2:09 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: RE: New message for service request 23445, vehicle number YP3878)

— \-lllllllb- [ Sl 1 _H_t\-f._‘-\-l’" L]

' : _ 27192018

1 19r2718 1244 AM ANG Richard- Please advise status of the claim. Thank you |LSF B-30:27 AM
' B | 11122018

-] 0l GeT VIDED B JCHT |‘I:44:43 AM

| - e (23102019

| **CHECK WITH CYNTHIA: Ol NCD NOT AFFECTED CHT !4114:31 PU

IMessage AXA Liability 100%. 3 vehicles chain collision whereby Ol was 2nd car. Inform O '

- about third party claim. Agreed to et insurance handle and aware NCD issus. We seek OHT [23/10/2019
yaur mandate at $2.592.00(all-in), TP-Mandate |14 had bean uploaded in Smartclaims. 42255PH
[Kindly let us have your approvalinstruction. Hsiao Tong - 23-0ct-12 |

| 25110119 2:54 PM LOH Cynthi Lsp (23102019

- AN ———AiyNve 85555 Al

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(40B933)

——Original Message-—

From: Admin-D (LEKAUto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 25 October 2019 2:57 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: New message for service request 23445, vehicle number YP3878)

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | 5(40B933)

——0riginal Message—

From: cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg <cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 25 October, 2019 2:55 PM

To: admin-d@lkkauto.com

Subject: New message for service request 23445, vehicle number YP3878I

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S7TMODE3L
Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.



KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-50 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 199802379R

Dare : 15.01.2018
AXA Insurance Singapore Pre Lid
8 Shenton Way

#27-01 AXA Tower
Singapore 06881 |

Atin: Motor Claim Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: YP3878J AND SLV5S7D ON 26.12.2017

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: YP3BTBJ |, which was invalved in
the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no: SLV5S7TD . The vehicle owner has requested and authorized

us to assist him in presenting his/her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

1) Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) < 2,140.00
2) Loss Of Use (3days x $150) 8 450.00
3} GIA Search Fee g 2,00

5 2,592.00

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the clamms:

a) Final Repair Invoice b) Vehicle Registration Log Card
) GIA Report d) IVC & Driving Licence
¢) Insurance Certificate ) GIA Search Result

g1 Letter of Authorisation, etc...

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank yvou. { |
Yours faithfully, - :

Jason Tang (jason@fastechauto.com.sg)
For Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd



TAX INVOICE

KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-50 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 199802379R

Tax Invoice : 20057
AXA Insurance Singapore Pre Lud

8§ Shenton Way Date: 15012018
#27-01 AXA Tower Vehicle No:  YP3BTE)
Singapore 06881 | Make'Model: MIT CANTER
Chassis/Eng#
Accident Dae:  26.12.2017
Attn: Motor Claim Department Claim No 1217-20057
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair S8 2,000,00
E. & O. E. Total - S§ 2.000.00
GST (@ T : S8 140.00
Amount Due -~ 8§ 2,140.00
—
0 "rl_.

__.—'

for KIM CHWEE .*\Il;f'l'ﬂ PTE LTD
All lnvolces are subjected to GST



Hsiao TUEE (LKKAuto)

From: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.comsg>

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 12:32 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: YOUR REF:SLVS7D MY REF:YP3878) DOA:26/12/2017 //LKK REF:
CCA/ASM17024438/Upb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Hsiao Tong,
We are pleased to accept your offer of global sum of 52,440.00(all-in) for my client’s vehicle claim.

Thank you

Best Regards

Jason Tang

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave b
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67465405

Hp: 98218445

lason@fastechauto.com.sg

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/
clalmant,

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com|

Sent: Thursday, November 7, 2019 9:02 AM

To: Jason <lason@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: RE: YOUR REF:SLV57D MY REF:YP3878) DOA:26/12/2017 //LKK REF: CCA/ASM17024438/Upb3
Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of 52,440.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyhalder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice



engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related
claims.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | ${408033)

From: Jason Fastech Auto <jason@fastechauto.com sg>
Sent: Friday, 26 July 2019 3:21 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewhi@lkkauto.com>

Subject: YOUR REF:SLV57D MY REF:YP3878) DOA:26/12/2017

Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please refer to our Letter of Demand dated 09/07/2019.
We await your offer.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Jason Tang

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
HO1-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67465405

Hp: 98218445
|ason@fastechauto.com.sg

Flease hote that It is 3 condition of any settiement reached that it shall be without prejudice ta any personal injury claim (if any] of the owner/
claymant.



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Rag Mo. 18-8807T188-R

Affllloted to Fedoration Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

B SHENTON WAY #24-01
AXA TOWERSINGAPORE DEBB11

ATTN.CYNTHIA

Raf

Date: 17-12-2019

Code : ASM

CC4/ASM17024438/Upb3g2

R

1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLV 57D Veh. Inspected YP 3878J
Policy No. GA294043/1 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. S7MO0B3L Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 271122017

2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI CANTER c.c 20988
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. FEB21EA20663 Colour WHITE
Odometer 115642 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD

: Ji Conditions of Tyres

Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/85R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/85 R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/85R15 (D) BRIDGESTONE 6/6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |185/85R15 (D) BRIDGESTONE 6/8 mm

4. ‘Description of Damages ¢ i '
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR O/S PORTION.

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,

55 General Information wl | 1
Accident Date 261122017 Inspection Date 281272017
Survey held at KIM CHWEE AUTO PTE LTD

1 KAK| BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-4B/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883

5a. Remarks n

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE® BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair " dapicm

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOCD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days




¥

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. YP 3878J

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL 6258 3551 FAX: B256 4315
Reg No: 189607188R GST Reg No. 19-9607198-R

Page No.:1 ol 1

REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1| TAIL LAMP O/S (SN) (CONSISTENT) CRACKED 266.00 220.00
1|REAR LICENSE PLATE LAMP (SN) (CONSISTENT) MNOT MECESSARY 1056.00
1|REAR LICENSE PLATE [SN) (CONSISTENT) BENT 30.00 14,00
1I{TAILGATE WOODEN BOARD (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 2.200.00
1|TAILGATE B0KM/H STICKER (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 20.00
1|24 PAX STICKER (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 20,00
1|TAILGATE WOODEN LOWER MEMBER (SN) CRACKED 1,200,00 B50.00
(CONSISTENT)
1| TAILGATE STEP WOODEN BOARD (SN) (CONSISTENT)  |CRACKED 850.00 400.00
1|REAR HORIZONTAL WOODEN BOARD QJS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 1,500.00
({CONSISTENT)
1|REAR ALUMINILM PANEL CIS (SN) (CONSISTENT) DENTED 300.00 200.00
1| TAILGATE LOWER METAL PLATE (SN) (CONSISTENT) TO REPAIR SEE 600.00
LABOLR
1|REAR SAFETY BAR BUMPER (SN) (CONSISTENT) NOT NECESSARY 1,200.00 -
-8,2091.00 1,684 .00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING 50.00 20.00]
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING, NOT NECESSARY 50.00
LABOUR TO LIFT UP CARGO DECK FOR REPLACING y SBO,I]I] 600.00
WOODEN BOARD.)
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING .INCLUSIVE OF THE 680.00
REPAIR OF TAILGATE LOWER METAL PLATE ) :
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 600.00 200.00|
4,760.00 820.00|
GRAND TOTAL 10,051.00 2,504.00
'RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM m . - W
- (TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT COND ‘
Report Ref No. CC4/ASM17024438/Upb3q2
CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appralser

DISCLAMER CF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart is made selely for the uss snd benefil of the Cllent named on ihe ront page of his Repor.
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