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¥y UU LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

- -
";'}"—!
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Na. 10-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S)PTELTD Ref . CC3CTIT024431/K ka3
eonsoromeao o oI
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh.  CB6580G Veh. Inspected SHC 1712L
Policy No. DMB1SN1691201600 Coverage (5} 0.00
Claim No. SNM1TDOT2BE/C02/0 Excess () 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 27122017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.C 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer : Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mim
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/12/2017 |inspection Date 26/12/2017

Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

53 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969

5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjiN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




" f [ Auto

- ~E R Consullants
e Frotul Company Registration No. 199607 198R

51 URIAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA UUBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SING APORE 408933 TEL @ (I63) 625633601 FAX : (065 62504115
Y our ref; TBA Date: 27.12.2017
Our ref: CC3/CTI17024431/K1ka3
The Motor Claims Department
M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD
Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SHC 1712L
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 26/12/2017
at the premises of M/s ComfortDelGro Eneineering Pte Ltd (Loyang) and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S% 3,762.16
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 1.010.56
"Check” Items Amount : 8% -
Market Value : S% =
LTA Reimbursement Value . S% -
Nett Value : 53 -
rmarside
Description of Damage: - ———em—
The vehicle sustained damages at the m =
/S Rear Portion o~

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 2.0 days

Yours faithfully,

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

# == = #

From: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 January, 2018 2:22 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Zaini (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; Jowyn Tay

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving CB6580G (O : SNM17D07286/C02/0)
AND SHC1712L (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI117024431/K1ka3) on 22/12/2017

Attachments: MCHM17170885-CB6580G.pdf

Importance: High

Follow Up Flag: Follow up .

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMK

Dear Mei Kwan &/or Zaini.
Further to our earlier email, we attached our insured's accident report for your immediate attention.

Thank you.

Regards,
Jowyn Tay

Deputy Claims Executive

Motor Division

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6383 6174

Fax: 6224 7175 / 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

jowyn.ta y@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

i**a!*t#*tn**i#*t¢#-**t*iw****-**-*#t**#-**#a*ii**tt*lr*tt*it****tt*t#t!*tt**a*t#**t-*mit**-i*r

e s T T T S L2 L LA LA

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte.
Ltd. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended

recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.
***hﬂ******l**-**l**-**.****#**#**i!*i***!***-*hl*****iW*it*tﬁwi***i*#*#*#H**t*#l**tl*#ii**tt*i

**--+*#**-u**:*t-m*t*¢-+¥**t

From: lowyn Tay

Sent: Thursday, 28 December, 2017 3:35 PM

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)' <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>; Zaini (LKK Auto) <Zaini@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com:

1



- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Zaini and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2132,
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
"Wishes you a Happy New Year 2018”

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lud

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Elk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | Si408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www.symanteccloud.com
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CHINA TAIPING _ CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE [SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD
4 Anman Road #16-00 Spangaal Tower Singapors 0729049
Tol BIEG G111 Fax 6222 1033
Wabsite: wwe.sg. cnlaiping com
Co. Reg, Mo, 200Z08384E

Our Reference - To Be Advised

Date ; 28-Dec-17
Via Ordinary & Registered Mail
MS NLS Bus Service
Blk 231 Compassvale Walk
#04-450
SINGAPORE 540231

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING CB6580G & SHC1712L ON 22 DEC 2017 ALONG LENTOR AVENUE /
MANDATI ROAD

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle §HC1712L is filing a third party property claim against your
vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to administer the said claim on our behalf and they will
soon contact you for more information about the accident. Kindly render your assistance and co-operation
accordingly.

We understand that you or your driver has not filed an accident report within 24 hours as per Mator Claims
Framework, We would urge you to comply with the condition to file your accident report with your vehicle
{whether damaged or not) to us IMMEDIATELY through LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd or any of our
authorized workshops. You may log onto our website www.se.cntaiping.com for location of the respective
workshops.

We regret to advise that we and / or LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd will not be handling the third party claim
and your NO CLAIM DISC OUNT will be penalized upon renewal of your policy if you fail to comply with
the condition of reporting.

tor Division

Claims Department

Fax ; 62247478 / 62247175

Email : claimsdept@sg cntaiping.com

cc. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Attn 1 Zaini
Ref : CC3/CTIIT024431/K1 kal
Contact no; 68412132
via email address : zaini(@lkkauto.com.sg

Agent : ANOSBOA Odds & Ewven
via Facsimile :

FOILKKDSANR2013

—/



COMFORTL LI

ENGINEERING
COMEORIPEGRS Date;Time; 26.12.2017 5 Page 1
Team: ARC Repair TP(CLS0)1 JOB CARD :sales Order: JoNO305100668
Ty RS o ' REGN NO.: MILEAGE
SHC171ZL
UMa COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD ARE: FUEL
JETOMER MO, 7010045 HYUNDAI ORI, | - SO
IDRESS 33_3 SIN MING DRIVE MODEL, DATETIME I
Singapore SINGAPORE 575717 I-40 23112.2017 09:05
Lo A 65508753 (] YR OF MANLL TARGET DATE
P 20.12. 2017
CHASS E COMPLETION DATE/TIME:
SCOUNT CARD NO. ia Wmammams ! ! e
JOB DESCHI
Accident Date! 22.12.2017
NATURE: 3P 22.12.2017
8/HO LABOR CODE DESCRIPTION
JECKED & PASSED OUT BY:
SERVICE ADVISOR CLSTOMER'S SIGNATURE
iowledgamant Slig T Exit Pass
G
1o Wahlcle Mot
-le No.: SHC1TL2L CHIANG @ SHC1712L
& ol Servica Advisor Signature/Date tame of Servica Advisor Date

a raturnad 1o Service Reception upon collectien

| Tobe Kept by Security Guard



| X

|

COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD v
REPAIR ESTIMATE® " \
VEHICLE NO : SHC 1712L DATE 26/12/2017 10:33 t"*il i‘ ‘1\\’
MAKE f L = :
MODEL : HYUNDAI i40 WMol
Oty Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price Amount
Rear Fender (RH) Xﬂ?.rﬁ $  2.020.10
Rear Fender Inner Lining (RH)x b 164.40
Rear Windscreen Moulding > ¥ 60.00
Rear Wheel Hup-Cap (RH) — b 150.70
flon fomm (FH XHropAle
SUB TOTAL s 2,395.20
LESS 20% S 479.04
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 1,916.16
Rear Windscreen Sealant 5 46.00 |Nett

Rear Door Comfortdelgro & Apps Sticker (RH )~

Labour Charge

Panel Beating

Spray Painting Charge

Tuff Kote

Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery Rear
Remove/Refix Rear Windscreen Glass

TOTAL LABOUR

ESTIMATE TOTAL

|Cq Lﬂ- 4 Z firféj

2 (o fx 14017 i
Z /*w |
Py ,
M b r?

5 50.00 |Nett

$ 126.00

Los

1506000

o
150,067
120,067

1,720.00

A B8 e A
L, A
7

"

]

3,762.16

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle.

be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Survevor appointed by

The final repair quantum will

the insurance Company.
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COMFOR #¢DELGRO ENGIN EERING FTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE* ) |
VEHICLE N0 : SHC 1712L ﬁTE 26/12/2017 10:33 {;»L[ H\N !
MAKE - lW' e . '
MODEL __ : HYUNDAI i40 MLl
Qty - Parts Description/ Labour =i_ Type J_ Unit Iill:e L Aml]unt;
Rear Fender (RH)  y ,n.-r..*l-: T [s 202010
Rear Fender Inner Lining (RH)x J** 5 164.40
Rear Windscreen Moulding < 77 1 $ 60.00
Rear Wheel Hup-Cap (RH) — ‘;" b 150.70
for Hom (A X rap Al
SUB TOTAL $ 2,395.20
LESS 20% 5 479.04
DISCOUNTED TOTAL $ 1.916.106
Rear Windscreen Sealant > *1 $ 46.00 |Nett
Rear Door Comfortdelgro & Apps Sticker (RH)~"| = g 80.00 |Nett
% 126.00
Labour Charge Lon
Panel Beating 5 M
Ay Painti - .;? {d\
Spray Painting Charge 5 M
Tuff Kote % ;wg"‘ Ao
Remove/Refix Cushion & Upholstery Rear b 'i:':/D_J.)ﬂ""'I"
Remove/Refix Rear Windscreen Glass b llw'ﬂ X4y
TOTAL LABOUR s 1,720.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL 5 3,762.16
QAL
Lﬁ%'l/;- f':"f"/'t LK . ——
2. / s 5
M P P

[ his i5 an mital éstimate based o a visual j|]-c|_-||;|__'|1|_||'| of the ahove vehicle. The final repair quantur will

be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Survevor appoinied by the msurance company




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

REPAIR ESTIMATE

COMPANY : THIRD PARTY'S CLAIMS (CAS) JOB NO
CUSTOMER: 7010045 REGN NO
ADDRESS : COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD MILEAGE
153 SIN MING DRIVE MAKE
SINGAPORE SINGAPORE 575717 MODEL
65508755 DATE OF REGN

DATE TIME IN
ACCIDENT DATE

JOB / PARTS DESCRIPTION

BART REQUISITION

0001 04-01-0103-0658-G  140VC CAP ASSY-WHEEL HUE 1 150,70 20,00 120,56

0002 28-01-0103-2013-A  140V3 APP LOGO REAR DOOR 1 80,00 2.00- R0.00

SUB-TOTAL
JOB NATURE
(00 L PANEL BEATING 400000
0001 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA 360.00

0002 20-204 REMOVE/REFIX UPHOLSTERY ASST REPAIR

- SUB-TOTAL

TOTAL

Date: 28.12.2017
Time: 08:38:37
Page: 1

305100668
SHC1712L
0000000000
HYUNDAI

1-40

20.12,2017
23.12.2017 09:05

QTY IND UNIT-PRICE DISC% AMOUNT

20M).56

810.00

1.010:56

AUTHORISED : YES / NO

MVA NAME & SIGNATURE
DATE ; DATE :

SURVEYOR NAME & SIGNATURE



COMFORIDELCRO

NGINEERIN
Qur Job Ref No @ 305100668 E E G
W= ComfonDelGr Enginsering Fie Lid
Date : 2812117 50 Loyang Drive Singapore 508969
S B Fax: 6548 8138
FINALIZATION FORM
To LKK Fax :
Altn KALVIN
‘ehicle Reg Mo. SHC1712L 22212017
The survey and estimates of the repairs of the above-mentioned wehicle are as follows:-
1. The repair job shall bill to: CHINA CB6580G
2. The finalized amount shall be:
{a)  Spare Parts after List discount £200.56
(b}  Labour Charges $810.00
Total for Part-By-Part Repair Cost $1,010.56

jc.) Lumpsum Repair (if applicable)
Total for Lumpsum repair cost after Less: 20%

Final Lumpsum Repair cost

3 Estimated normal period for repairs: 2 working days.

4. We shall treat the above amount as Correct and Confirmed if there is no reply from you within 7

working days =

5 Thank you for your assistance. We confirm the estimates and
# finalized amount
-L hy
3 4

Signature : Signature :

Mame - CHIANG TR JCa ek

Tel . 62148314 Date  : 24} )}

Fax - B5468156
For Official Use Only

Document
Item Amount Attached Confinm By Remarks
[ Signature)
Yes or No
1. Rental Rate P/Day YES
2. Loss of Income Paid M
3. Survey Fees
4. LTA Search Fee
5. Medical Fees (on behalf
of driver, if applicable)

6 Ovemun

Remarks:
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From: Catherine Koh Mui Gek <catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 12 January 2018 5:11 PM
To: Zaini (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: SHC 1712L CB 6580G CC3/CTINT024431 /K 1ka3 221272017

Zaini  Ol's sketch plan attached

Dear Zaini

Strictly without prejudice, we accept your offer at $1870.00. Kindly forward DV sconest.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Catherine Koh

Claims Department | ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off - 62148733 | Fax : 62141843

"Zaini (LKK Autg)” <Zainig@ikkauto.com=

'!<: “William Tan Thoo Seng' <williamtan@cdge com.sg>, ‘Catherine Koh Mui Gek' <catherinekoh@cdge.com.sg>

Cc “Hziao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewhi@Ikkauto.cam>

Date 12/01/2018 04,57 PM

Sunject SHC 17120 CB 65805 COWCTHTO24431/K ka3 222017 Zaini Ol's sketch plan attached
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: T 1217/ SHC1712L / WT(st)
Our Ref: CC3/CTI17024431/K1ka3

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING CB 6580G & SHC 1712L ON 22/12/2017

We refer to the above matter

For a quick and amicable settlement, we offer to settle global sum at 55 1,870.00 (all in)

Kindly confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intentlon of resolving the matter amicably without
parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred from this negetiation of terms/sattlement.

in tha evant of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either
party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/ settlement.

Best Ragords

Tainl Kusalni | Cose Hondler

LKE Aute Consultants Ple Lid

oI0: 6841-2132 | emoil; Zaini@kkouto.cam | fox: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Payalbi industrial Pork, Ul Avenue 1. #02-25 | S(408%33)

From: Shirley Hiew [LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 12 January 2018 12:10 PM
To: 'William Tan Thoo Seng' <williamtan@cdge.com.sg>; 'Catherine Koh Mui Gek' <catherinekoh@cdge.com. sg=

1



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singaporne 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607198-R

Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTELTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909

Ref : CC3/CTI17024431/K1ka3n

Date: 17-01-2018

Code: CTI

[NV

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh.  CB6580G Veh. Inspected SHC 1712L
Policy No. DMB1SN1691201600 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM17D07286/C02/0 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 261212017
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model  HYUNDAI 140 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDENM Year of Reg. 207
Chassis No. KMHLE41UMHU100045 Colour BLUE
Odometer 1121 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |[205/60 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOWK 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR FORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/12/2017 Inspection Date 26122017
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
Ba. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

2 Woerking Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapora 4088933
TEL: 6256 31561 FAX: 6256 4315

Automotive Assessor | Investigator

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: This Report is made
WWHMWMWWW teport whelly or in par, A
5 &0 at his oF her owm risk

Report. in whobs o in part, ded

Automotive Assessor

solely for the ues and benefit of tha Client mamed on the front page of this Reporn.

[y third

Reg. No: 199507198R GST Reg. No 19-9607196-R Page MNo.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 1712L
s . Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty P Workshop )| ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR FEMDER (RH}) TO REPAIR SEE 202010 -
LABCOUR
1|BREAR FENDER INNER LINING (RH) SERVICEABLE 164.40 -
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NOT NECESSARY 80,00 -
1|REAR WHEEL HUP-CAF (RH) GRAZED 180.70 150.70
1|REAR DOOR (RHINPA) TO REPAIR SEE - -
LABOUR
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -479 04 -30.14
1.916.16 120.56
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) MOT NECESSARY 46 .00 -
1|REAR DOOR COMFORTDELGRO & APPS STICKER (RH) MECESSARY B0.00 80.00
(SN)
126.00 B80.00
LABOUR
PAMEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR 1,000.00 400.00
FENDER (RH) AND REAR DOOR (RH).
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE. 400.00 360.00
TUFF KOTE. NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
REMOVE/REFIX CUSHION & UPHOLSTERY REAR. 150.00 50.00
REMOVE/REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS, NOT NECESSARY 120.00 =
1,720.00 810.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,762.16 1,010.56
[ RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 1,010.56|
Report Ref No. CC3/CTI17024431/K1ka3n2
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