Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: lee ahbee <ahbeelee@hotmail.sg>

Sent: Sunday, 14 January 2018 8:49 AM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SL6623A / SHF511R on 14
Dec 2017

Attachments: IMG_3242.17 Final &LOA pdf

Your Insured's Vehicle: SHF511R
Our Client's Vehicle: 5L6623A (3242/17/SHK)

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We are pleased to proceed with a direct settlement at 54,850.00, comprises repair cost 54,100.00
and loss of use 5750.00 [(5150x5), BMW520i 2.0L]

Please find attached the final repair bill and letter of authorization, for your perusal.
Kindly let us know whether you are agreeable to the above ?

Thank you!

Regards

Ah Bee Lee

Seng Hong Kee Co

Blk 4 Woodlands Road 393F

Yew Tee Industrial Estate Singapore 677976

H/P: 96996650 Tel: 67605120 Fax: 67602129

Sent from Outlook



Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Maonday, 15 January 2018 11:11 AM

To: claims@transcab.com.sg

Cc: CS A Team; carrisalee@ava-ins.com; icewong@ava-ins.com; ireneng@ava-ins.com;
foonghon@ava-ins.com

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHF 511R AND SL 6623A ALONG BUKIT BATOK EAST AVE 6 ON
140122017

15 JANUARY 2018

Transcab Taxi
Singapore

Dear Sir/Mdm,

OUR REF  : CC4/AXA17024381/5ua3
YOUR REF :5HF 511R

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHF 511R AND SL 6623A ALONG BUKIT BATOK EAST AVE 6 ON 14/12/2017

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from Seng Hong Kee Co acting on behalf of the owner of SL 66234 against your motor
insurance policy.

Basing on the circumstances of the accident reported by both parties, we are of the opinion that we cannot be absolved
from liability,

We also wish to advise that there is an excess of $55,000.00 attached with Third Party Claims. Please be informed that
you shall be liable for the excess following any settlement of the third party claim. The applicability of the excess is as
follows:

(1) Any settlement equal to or above the excess, you shall be liable to make the payment of 555,000.00; or
(2) Any settlement below the excess, you shall be liable for the amount settled.

AXA shall keep you informed of the third party claim settlement and thereafter kindly let AXA have the excess payment
in your cheque payable to “AXA Insurance Pte Ltd”. Please indicate your vehicle registration number and the date of
accident on the back of the cheque.

Notwithstanding the excess being applied and/or received by AXA for the above subject matter, AXA expressly reserves
all their rights under the policy to refund the excess payment in the event that there arises any known policy breach and
or exclusion material to coverage.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under
the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s)
arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date of this

letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to us and acknowledged by us.

1



Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to thinthin@Ilkkauto.com

within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and
further document may be required:

- Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
. Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

* Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

. Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

. Video footage of accident (if any)

. Statement and/or police report from independent witness{es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us informed of
your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim.

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s)
and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AXA's prior knowledge and consent.
If you receive any correspondence or legal document such as a Writ of Summons in connection with this accident,
please forward it to AXA immediately. You may email it to cst@axa.com.sg or deliver it by hand to AXA's Customer Care
Centre,

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of
policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2360 or email us at thinthin@lkkauto.com.
Please quote our claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Yours sincerely,

THIN THIN HLAING

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
DID: 6841 2360

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: thinthin@Ilkkauto.com

This is a computer generated letter and no signature is required.

Cc Motor Claims Department
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
(AXA Third Party Claim)

Iy el ML, Shyowpg {*the third party claimant™)
of w Lo 'l:x'..'h'-L-tl Pisms =\ Ewtu, S i pbpbefl : '-.-"L:'- 23 {address),
owner of S G223 A {vehicle no.) hereby authorize

"-‘_.L'..--_L:;,I- e — l’rf..'T._l L

(“the workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for

repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my

velhicle no. Shsbe2 3R that was damaged pursuant toc the
: - = 1 I|-|'| (1 I|I pe P 5 0 | I|I LAt Ly e
accident which eoccurred on [T, [ {date) along
v Bk XS Bllek GeaX N b {location)
el ths2zA ¥ KT S
involving vehicle no/s )L bS5k & SAE SWK

(“the accident™}.

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned
claim in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further
authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim
with payment chegue/s being made in fawvour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach
on my behalf is on a without prejudice and without admission of
liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other
vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this va. day of }h“““‘“j (month) 20 A3 lyear)
el A ek '\\. . m‘ -
S5igned-by “the thifd party clalmant” Signed by “the workshop”

{with chop)



redefining / insurance &

CLAIM REF : C0463907
INSURED : TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD

DISCHAR! QUCHER

We/I [LOH NGIM CHONG. $15115281) hereby agree to accept the sum of dollars Four Thousand and
Six_Hundred Only] (554,600.00) paid to us/me by AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD as full and final
settlement of all claims of whatever kind including damages for personal injuries and damages to
property that we/l may have against the said AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured or the driver
of motor vehicle no. SHF 511R as a result of an accident along BUKIT BATOK EAST AVE 6 on
14/12/2017 of which we/l were/was the driver/ owner/ hirer/ passenger/rider/pillion/ insurer of
motor vehicle no. SL 6623A.

We/| hereby declare that the said insurer or owner and/or driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SHF 511R in connection directly or
indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/l hereby declare that we/l are/am the person(s) entitled to receive the above settlement and
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in
respect of this settlement,

It is understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsoever
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SHF 511R.

- 1 S
Dated this day of s J 2047 2
Claimant's Signature : 1 LY
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Telephone No. A L e e B S
Witness's Name : Ve AW Bao
Witness's Signature : .ﬁ\% Sh=
Witness's NRIC No. : > B IEHL \‘L"_t—
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B % # 2 @
SENG HONG KEE CO. INVOICE

BLOCK 4, 383-F WOODLANDS ROAD (YEW TEE INDUSTRIAL ESTATE)
SINGAPORE 677976 TEL: 6760 5120 FAX: 6760 2129
PP A
- E 3 -
No.

Motor Vehicles Repairing, Welding and Spray Painting

Your Insured’s Vehicle: SHF51 1R
Our Client’s Vehicle: SL6623A (3242/17/SHK)

Date: 13 January 2018

Motor Claims Department
M/s AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
8 Shenton Way #27-01 AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Final bill of repair to vehicle Registration No. SL 6623 A

We agreed to your surveyor’'s recommendation for the final repair cost to be at a lump
sum of dollars Four Thousand And One Hundred only ($4,100.00).

This repair cost includes the cost of spare parts, labor charge and spray paint.



