
I ;-i,: l'iii i':CEi.J!*.1 / LJF.GEiiThl
Clain i!,:

A\G

I i l-':

iviarle & 1.,,1:,i:i

]:r'ii.qii,r - :i -.--.- '-.\ .J'j l -;l;

"*- !/.y.t t J=t=

-iA T;t:l .?.;iai: A.ncuiir

:i:,11 3

b8K
* 

=i3
r jf'r'-,=1

Caicui*ilcn fl,,t LTi. F.ebai*:
l;ia-:s

: -': ^'.

<Vrc+ t-,

ieiilatioi': foi Ve l';aii on :

Average MV

Calculation ior Repassessed v:r'!,:la:
l-iigh demanej vehjcie:. .Yes / l'.io i - S

ipJ. d.ai?lice lvion'ii'rs :

*irtirSi-ali'b-bf ,:op _ {b)



From:
Sent:
To:
Cc:
Subject:

Ai Phing (LKKAuto)
Friday, 22 December,2017 4:40 PM
Ler, Bernard-JQ
SUR
RE: SKB3988P t877146331sSG I Date of Accident: 0111212017

Dear Bernard,

The Market Value of SKB 3988P is S108K (Est) as at Dec 2017'

"Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2018"

Best Regards,

Ai Phing I Case Handler

LKKAuto Consultants Fte Ltd

Phone: 6zs6-gS6r I email: sur@lliJcauto.com I fax: 6256-+3ts

Blk 5r, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Llbi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(+o8qSS)

From: Ler, Berna rd{Q lmailto :Berna rd-JQ. Ler@aig.com]

Sent: Thursday,2t December, 2OL7 2:57 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@fta.com.sg>; Rogass mail <rogassociates@gmail.com>

subject: SKB3988P / 877L463315SG I Date ofAccident: 0L/72/2oL7

HiAII,

Kindly assist to compute market value of the vehiclb above please'

Thank you very much.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler
AIG
Complex Claims Examiner
Claims lAlG Asia Pacific lnsurance Pte. Ltd

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(O79120)

1s1 +(65) 6419 1946 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bernard-JQ.Ler@aio.com I www.aiq.com.sq

IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,

you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please

immediately notiff me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or

printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner lD Type

o*n"i ro

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.

Singapore NRIC

ii;cici

ixegsssP

Vehicle to be Exported

lntended De-registration Date 05 Dec 2017

v";ilJ" Mad

Vehicle Model A8L 3.0 TFSI QU (sR+HlD)

Primary Colour Grey

Manufacturing Year 201.t

Engirre No. cGW005554

Chassis No. wAUZZZ4H4BN014701

Maximum Power Output

Open MarketValue

: Original Registration Date

: First Registration Date

Transfer Count

ActualARF Paid

213.0 kW (285 bhp)

$82,s93.00
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lntended PARF Rebate Details

inniEiiiiuiiiiv-:

PARF EligibiliW Expiry Date

%;

t3Mar202t

PARF Rebate Amount

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date

. COE Category

COE Period(Years)

i QP Paid

: COE Rebate Amount $20.283.00

TotalRebateAmount $73,968.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 05 Dec2OtT

OK

$s3,685.00
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