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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 4 March, 2019 3:28 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: (SDP 4716K) CC6/EQI17024304/Uhb3

Dear Vic, 

 

We accept your below email of the offer amount, $3700.00 all-in. 

 

Thank you 

 

Best Regards 

 

Winston TeoWinston TeoWinston TeoWinston Teo    

Stytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte Ltd 

Email:Email:Email:Email: stytechent@singnet.com.sg | Mobile:Mobile:Mobile:Mobile: +65 9685 8843 | Fax:Fax:Fax:Fax: +65 6445 3310 

Address:Address:Address:Address: 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-02/ #02-30, Kaki Bukit Autohub,  Singapore 417921 

 

 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, March 4, 2019 1:57 PM 

To: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: (SDP 4716K) CC6/EQI17024304/Uhb3 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Winston, 

 

We refer  to your below email. 

 

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our 

Insured’s part, we propose a global sum of $3,700.00 (all in) to settle your client’s claim. 

 

For your acceptance please. 

 

Please be informed that NO DV is required.  

 

Thank you. 

 
"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and 

should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement 

should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present 

matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer 

in any other related matters.  
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Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge 

Voucher (for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant.  Further all original documents shall be retained by us 

after we have made payment on the settlement sum. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd [mailto:stytechent@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 4 March, 2019 11:25 AM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: Admin A 

Subject: (SDP 4716K) CC6/EQI17024304/Uhb3 

 

Dear Vic, 

 

Any update status for this vehicle (SDP4716K). 

 

Please revert 

 

Best Regards 

 

Winston TeoWinston TeoWinston TeoWinston Teo    

Stytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte Ltd 

Email:Email:Email:Email: stytechent@singnet.com.sg | Mobile:Mobile:Mobile:Mobile: +65 9685 8843 | Fax:Fax:Fax:Fax: +65 6445 3310 

Address:Address:Address:Address: 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-02/ #02-30, Kaki Bukit Autohub,  Singapore 417921 

 

 

 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, February 12, 2019 7:19 PM 

To: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.com.sg> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: ACCIDENT ON 21/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES GT 8896R AND SDP 4716K 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Thank you for your email. 
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Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

 

Please note that: - 

 

LKK ref Officer in charge   

CC6/EQI17024304/Uhb3 Vic  
   

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned 

 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 12 February 2019 1:08 PM 

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 21/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES GT 8896R AND SDP 4716K 

 

Dear Thin Thin, 

Any update for this case ? (SDP4716K) 

 

Please revert 

 

Best Regards 

 

Winston TeoWinston TeoWinston TeoWinston Teo    

Stytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte Ltd 

Email:Email:Email:Email: stytechent@singnet.com.sg | Mobile:Mobile:Mobile:Mobile: +65 9685 8843 | Fax:Fax:Fax:Fax: +65 6445 3310 

Address:Address:Address:Address: 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-02/ #02-30, Kaki Bukit Autohub,  Singapore 417921 

 

 

 

From: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, December 11, 2018 12:41 PM 

To: 'Thin Thin (LKKAuto)' <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 21/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES GT 8896R AND SDP 4716K 

 

Dear Thin Thin, 

 

Any update for this vehicle? 

 

Please revert 

 

Best Regards 

 

Winston TeoWinston TeoWinston TeoWinston Teo    
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Stytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte Ltd 

Email:Email:Email:Email: stytechent@singnet.com.sg | Mobile:Mobile:Mobile:Mobile: +65 9685 8843 | Fax:Fax:Fax:Fax: +65 6445 3310 

Address:Address:Address:Address: 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-02/ #02-30, Kaki Bukit Autohub,  Singapore 417921 

 

 

 

From: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, September 18, 2018 4:20 PM 

To: 'Thin Thin (LKKAuto)' <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 21/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES GT 8896R AND SDP 4716K 

 

Dear Thin Thin, 

 

Any update for this case? 

 

Please revert 

 

Best Regards 

 

Winston TeoWinston TeoWinston TeoWinston Teo    

Stytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte Ltd 

Email:Email:Email:Email: stytechent@singnet.com.sg | Mobile:Mobile:Mobile:Mobile: +65 9685 8843 | Fax:Fax:Fax:Fax: +65 6445 3310 

Address:Address:Address:Address: 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-02/ #02-30, Kaki Bukit Autohub,  Singapore 417921 

 

 

 

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, July 4, 2018 10:27 AM 

To: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 21/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES GT 8896R AND SDP 4716K 

 

Dear Winston, 

 

We refer to the below matter. 

 

Please be inform that we are still pending for further instruction from our Principal. 

 

We will follow up with our Principal and will revert back to you. 

 

Kindly hold hand for time being. 

 

Thanks. 

 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd [mailto:stytechent@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 2 July 2018 7:13 PM 

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 21/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES GT 8896R AND SDP 4716K 

 

Dear Thin Thin, 

 

Any update for this case? 

 

Please revert 

 

Best Regards 

 

Winston TeoWinston TeoWinston TeoWinston Teo    

Stytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte Ltd 

Email:Email:Email:Email: stytechent@singnet.com.sg | Mobile:Mobile:Mobile:Mobile: +65 9685 8843 | Fax:Fax:Fax:Fax: +65 6445 3310 

Address:Address:Address:Address: 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-02/ #02-30, Kaki Bukit Autohub,  Singapore 417921 

 

 

 

From: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, June 7, 2018 12:35 PM 

To: 'Thin Thin (LKKAuto)' <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 21/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES GT 8896R AND SDP 4716K 

 

Dear Thin Thin, 

 

As request. 
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Best Regards 

 

Winston TeoWinston TeoWinston TeoWinston Teo    

Stytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte LtdStytech Auto Pte Ltd 

Email:Email:Email:Email: stytechent@singnet.com.sg | Mobile:Mobile:Mobile:Mobile: +65 9685 8843 | Fax:Fax:Fax:Fax: +65 6445 3310 
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Address:Address:Address:Address: 2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-02/ #02-30, Kaki Bukit Autohub,  Singapore 417921 

 

 

 

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, June 6, 2018 2:32 PM 

To: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 21/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES GT 8896R AND SDP 4716K 

 

Dear Winston, 

 

We refer to the below matter. 

 

We would like to request the PIR result for our necessary action. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 5 February 2018 6:31 PM 

To: 'Stytech Auto Pte Ltd' <stytechent@singnet.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 21/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES GT 8896R AND SDP 4716K 

 

Hi Winston, 

 

We acknowledge your email below. 

 

 
Best Regards, 
 
Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd [mailto:stytechent@singnet.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 5 February 2018 5:10 PM 

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 21/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES GT 8896R AND SDP 4716K 

 

Dear Thin Thin, 
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Refer your below email. 

 

My client got called the police to the scene and show the police that the damage height & body stain color at his 

vehicle. 

 

Please wait for the police investigation result first. 

 

 

Thank & Regards 

Winston Teo 

HP 96858843 

Stytech Auto Pte Ltd 

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2 #01-02/#02-30 

Kaki Bukit Autohub 

Singapore 417921 

Tel: 64448125 Fax: 64453310 

 

 

 

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, February 5, 2018 3:33 PM 

To: Stytech Auto Pte Ltd <stytechent@singnet.com.sg> 

Subject: ACCIDENT ON 21/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES GT 8896R AND SDP 4716K 

 

"Without Prejudice" 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

ACCIDENT ON 21/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES GT 8896R AND SDP 4716K 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is unclear for the 

above mentioned case. There is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either party’s version. Enclosed herewith is a 

copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.  

   

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our OI we will 

revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you 

heard further from us.  

   

Meanwhile, we would like to request the CCTV footage / accident scene photos / evidence in order to seek further 

instruction from our principal. 

 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 

Best Regards, 

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


