Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Hi Sharon,

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 18 October 2018 7:49 AM

‘Sharon’; Lily.loi@ow.sg

‘Adeline Lim'

RE: LOD-ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS8878P & SJQ73G ON 19/12/2017 (AIG)
Private Settlement - SLS 8878P & SJQ 73G.pdf; Cheque.pdf

Please duly sign the attached private settlement letter and return back to us.

We will send out the cheque by post.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sharon <sharon@ow.sg>

Sent: Monday, 8 October 2018 4:04 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Lily.loi@ow.sg

Cc: 'Adeline Lim' <adeline@ow.sg>

Subject: Re: LOD-ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS8878P & SJQ73G ON 19/12/2017 (AIG)

Without Prejudice

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Please chase your insured to make the payment as soon as possible.

Thank you.

Best Regards,



Sharon Ten (Ms)

Claims Executive

Tel: +65 6484-9919 (ext.106)

Fax: +65 6481-1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143
(+65) 6472 2112 |

Branch: 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500
(+65) 6481 1011 |

Branch: 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415
(+65) 6452 9223 |

WWW.OW.SQg

www . facebook.com/optimawerkz

On 06-Sep-18 4:37 PM, Sharon wrote:

Without Prejudice
Dear Hsiao Tong,
Any update from your insured?

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sharon Ten (Ms)

Claims Executive

Tel: +65 6484-9919 (ext.106)
Fax: +65 6481-1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143

1313 | Fax: (+65) 6472 2112 |

Tel:

Tel:

Tel:

Branch: 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500

9919 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011

Branch: 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415

6868 | Fax: (+65) 6452 9223
WWW.OW.Sg
www . facebook.com/optimawerkz

On 21-Aug-18 3:07 PM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:
Without Prejudice

Hi Sharon,

As spoken, our insured would like to do private settlement.

We will arrange with our insured and get back to you.

Thank you.

(+65)
(+65)

(+65)

Tel:

Tel:

Tel:

6472 1313

6484 9919

6452 6868

(+65) 6472
(+65) 6484

(+65) 6452

Fax:

Fax:

Fax:



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sharon <sharon@ow.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 August 2018 12:51 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Lily.loi@ow.sg

Cc: 'Riza' <riza@ow.sg>; 'Adeline Lim' <adeline@ow.sg>

Subject: Re: LOD-ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS8878P & SJQ73G ON 19/12/2017 (AIG)

Without Prejudice
Dear Hsiao Tong,
Our client accept your offer at $2,036.46.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sharon Ten (Ms)

Claims Executive

Tel: +65 6484-9919 (ext.106)
Fax: +65 6481-1011

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 | Tel:
(+65) 6472 1313 | Fax: (+65) 6472 2112
Branch: 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 | Tel:
(+65) 6484 9919 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011
Branch: 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 | Tel:
(+65) 6452 6868 | Fax: (+65) 6452 9223

WWW.OW.Sg
www . facebook.com/optimawerkz

On 21-Aug-18 11:19 AM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:
Without Prejudice

Hi Lily,
We refer to your below email.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,713.46
2. Loss of Rental (3days x $100.00) (w/GST) $ 321.00
3. LTA/GIA Search fee $ 2.00

Total | $ 2,036.46

Please confirm acceptance.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a
without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably
without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of
terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by
either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lily.loi@ow.sg <Lily.loi@ow.sg>

Sent: Friday, 10 August 2018 4:27 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Riza' <riza@ow.sg>; 'Adeline Lim' <adeline@ow.sg>; 'Sharon'
<sharon@ow.sg>

Subject: LOD-ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS8878P & SJQ73G ON
19/12/2017 (AIG)

Our Ref : SLS8878P / TP#613

Your Ref : SJIQ73G

Without Prejudice

Dear Officer-In-Charge,

We refer to the above mentioned accident.

We are claiming as below:

- Cost of Repair (incl. of GST)) S$1,713.46
- Loss of Rental (incl. of GST) S$513.60
($171.20 x 03 days)

- LTA/GIA Search Fee S$2.00
Grand Total S$$2,229.06

Your prompt attention is most grateful and look forward to your
speedy settlement.

Thank you.



Thanks & Best Regards,

Lily Loi (Ms)
Motor Claims Department

OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD

6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 | Tel: (+65) 6472 1313 | Fax:
(+65) 6472 2112 |

9A Serangoon North Avenue 5 Singapore 554500 | Tel: (+65) 6486
9919 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011|

551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 | Tel: (+65) 6452 6868 |
Fax: (+65) 6452 9223 |

WWW.OW.Sg
www.facebook.com/optimawerkz




