Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 April, 2018 5:20 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI'; Admin A

Cc: Alfred Toh: Hwang Shiang Yi; Jess Kong; Angie Foo; janice@oddsneven.com.sg; Chai
Chui Ai

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA7881H (Ol :
SNM17D07241C02/1) AND SHCB016E (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI17024280/K1hs3) on
20/12/2017

Attachments: POLICY SCHEDULE - PA7881H.PDF

Dear Alfred,

we refer further to our below email.
Please be informed that we had settled the matter at global sum (all in) $4,520.00.
We will forward all relevant documents to your good office in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4084933)

FETES s
P [ L]

Save the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Monday, 26 March, 2018 3:25 PM

To: Vic [LKKAuto); Admin A

Ce: Alfred Toh; Hwang Shiang Yi; Jess Kong; Angie Foo; janice@oddsneven.com.sg; Chai Chui Ai

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct settlement - Accident Involving PA7881H (Ol : SNM17D07241C02/1) AND
SHCEO016E (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI17024280/K1hs3) on 20/12/2017

LKK REF - CC3/CTI17024280/K1hs3
CTI REF - SNM17D07241C02/1 (PA7881H)

Dear Vic

Attach herewith the policy schedule for your attention.

Regards



Vic (LKKAuto)

#

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 March, 2018 11:43 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A; Angie Foo

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Alfred Toh; Hwang Shiang Yi; Chee So Chow; KKLau; Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuta); Jess Kong; janice@oddsneven.com.sg

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE= RE; Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA7BE1H (O :
SNM17D07241C02/1) AND SHC6016E (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI17024280/K1hs3) on
20/12/2017

Attachments: TP LOD.pdf

LKK REF - CC3/CTI17024280/K1hs3
CTI REF - SNM17D07241C02/1 (PA7881H)

Dear Vic

We refer to your email of even date pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $4,526.77.
We await your payment advice to enable Boon Sen to act accordingly.

Aside to Angie, please follow up on the recovery of Section Il Excess.
Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#15-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID : +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 T175/6224 7478

Email: claimsdepti@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com

Woebsite: www.sg.cntaiping.com
Discleaimer

This message is cemfidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Inswrance (Singapore) Pre. Lid except where provided

for ima written agreement between vou and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,

either in whole or partial, is prohibited, If vou are not the infended recipient of the message please notify the sender immediatel

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, March 23, 2018 12:38 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTI
<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>; Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA7881H (Ol : SNM17D07241C02/1) AND
SHCE016E (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI17024280/K1hs3) on 20/12/2017



CTl REF —SNM17D07241/C02/1
LKK REF - CC3/CT117024280/Khs3

Dear Boon Sen,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES PA 7881H (01) AND SHC 6016E (TP) ON 20/12/2017
We refer to the above matter.

It was reported that the Insured vehicle was making a right turn and need a wider space. While turning, Insured vehicle
collided to TP vehicle travelling within its lane.

We tried to contact the Insured company and the Insured driver Mr Zhang Bin several times but to no avail. As such,
a letter dated 03/20/18 was sent out to the Insured to notify them of the TP claim. No feedback from 01/0ID till date.

In view of the above, we are of the view that liability is not to our Insured’s favour and the damages sustained to TP
vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident.

Summary to offer to repairer PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair (w/gst) 5 6,574.29 5 3,852.00
Loss of Rental (596.11 x 7 days) 5 672,77 5 672.77
GIA Search Fee 5 2.00 5 2.00
TOTAL $ 7,249.06 $ 4,526.77
Breakdown of days is as follows:
Recommended Days 4 days
Weekends / Downtime / Holiday 3 days
TOTAL 7 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email; vicalpeh@ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

F LoEs -
bvaeza - Save the Farth- Frint only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mall or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you



From: Vic [LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 23 March, 2018 12:07 PM

To: Chong Boaon Sen; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Cc: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto); Admin A; Claims Dept of CTI; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA7881H (Ol :SNM17D07241/C02/1) AND SHCE016E (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/CTI17024280/K1hs3) on 20/12/2017

Dear Boon Seng,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are currently preparing report mandate approval.
We will expedite the matter.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F ESES b
SesRES ~UN Save the Earth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Chong Boon Sen [mailto:boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Friday, 23 March, 2018 12:00 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; Claims Dept of CTI

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA7881H (O1: SNM17D07241/C02/1) AND SHCE016E (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/CTI117024280/K1hs3) on 20/12/2017

Dear Vic/Shirley,

Kindly provide update on matter,
Thank you.

Regards,

Chong Boon Sen

Claims Executive
Claims

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 0793909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 63896171

Fax: 62247175



Email: boonsen.chong@sg cntaiping.com
Website: www.sq.cntaiping com

Disclaimer !

This message is confidentiol; its contents do not canstitute o commitment by China Toiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided
for in o written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance {Singapore} Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination,
either in whole or partial, is prohibited, If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please natify the sender immediately.

From: Jowyn Tay

sent: Tuesday, 26 December, 2017 3:42 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew @ |kkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A<admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jowyn Tay
<jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA7881H (01 : SNM17D07241/C02/1) AND SHC6016E (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/CTI117024280/K1hs3) on 20/12/2017

Importance: High

Dear Vic &/or Shirley,
Please refer to the attachments,
Thank you.

Regards,

Jowyn Tay

Deputy Claims Executive

Motor Division

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079509
Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6385 6174

Fax: 6224 7175 / 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

m:#*imw*t1$a$$$¢l*t#$t*n!+--*-**-****4*t$$ltitti$n-*-*-**#*t*mi***t++-*$i*-*t**t****i**im-w*t*t
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Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte.
Ltd. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.
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From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew @ kkauto com]

Sent: Tuesday, 26 December, 2017 9:48 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>; Asher 5ng (LKKAuto)
<Ashersng@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA7881H (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SHC6016E (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT117024280/K1hs3) on 20/12/2017




WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SHC 6016E at M/s Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd - Changi South.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned,

"Wishes vou a Merry Chrisimas & Happy New Year 2018"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: ShirleyHlewi@ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http:/‘www.symanieccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit htip://www.svmanteccloud.com




PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG:200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Ref: SHC6016E/GS
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

15" January 2018
(By Email Only)

Attn: The Motor Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd

3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore (079909 tf \V (

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC6016E & PA7881H ALONG JOO CHIAT ROAD
ON 20.12.17

We have been authorized by Premier Taxis Pte Ltd. the owner of Taxi vehicle number:
SHC6016E. to claim against the party/parties responsible for the damages arising from
the above-mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number: PA7881H at the material
time of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, Mr Tng Toh Huat

As a result of the accident caused by vour Insured Driver's negligent driving and/or
management of your insured’s Vehicle Number: PA7881H. our client’s vehicle was
damaged and we have been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair $ 38352.00 (Incl. GST)
(2) Loss of Rental - TDays @$96.1 I per day b 672.77
(3) GIA Search fee ) 2.00

s 4526.77

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
(1) Final Repair Bill. GIA report & sketch plan of SHC6016E

(2) Driver’s I/C and Driving Licence

(3) Vehicle Registration card, Certificate of Insurance

(4) Check In/Out Voucher, GIA search



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG:200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Ref: SHCO6016E/G5

We would appreciate if you could look into the subject matter and let us have vour
favorable offer within 14 days. If you are agreeable to the settlement of the above said
claims, please forward us your discharge voucher as for our client’s signature and
pavment made to “Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd™.

Please note that if we do not hear from vou within the stipulated 14 days. we will have no
alternative but to appoint our solicitor to act on our behalf to commence proceedings
against you without further notice to you.

Yours faithfully,

Claims Depafifment — Gary Shi
2 '

£ - ——
Email: garyv.shif@premiertaxi.com
NB: We encourage all parties to liaise with us via email to expedite all matters

PS: Please quote our reference no when replying

c.c. Client — Premier Taxis Pte Lid



E q :"J? ¥ ._=:: Aute
s Consultants
Bl B2 B Pte Ltd

S1UBIAVE L #01-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE H08933 TEL : (0655 62363361 FAX : (6567414108

Our Ref: CC3/CTI17024280/K1hs3

03 JANUARY 2018

SIN ANN TRAVEL&COACH SERVICES PTE LTD
520B TAMPINES CENTRAL 8

#15-51

SINGAPORE 522520

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 7881H AND SHC 6016E ON 20/12/17

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or vour authorized driver under

the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed 1o negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

rs faithfully,

iti
Cuase Handler
DID: 62536 3361

FAX: 6741 4108
Emiail: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Depi)



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I/'We, PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD (“the third party claimant™) of 23 CHANGI
SOUTH AVENUE 2 #03-02 SINGAPORE 486443 (address). owner of SHC 6016E
(vehicle no.) hereby authorize PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

(“the workshop™) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental

and/or loss of use (“claim”) for my vehicle no. SHC 6016E that was damaged pursuant to
the accident which occurred on 20/12/2017 (date) along JOO CHIAT ROAD (location)
involving vehicle no/s PA 7881H (“the accident™).

I/We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to

settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of “the workshop™.

I/'We further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is
on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the
driver/fowner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

i .

Dated this (day) of /14 ARk ![mnmhlll}lﬁ{year}.

Signed by “the third party claimant” Sigried by “the workshop™
(with chop if applicable) ~ (with chop)



N

MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Policy Wo @ DMBISNIBZ1T781701 Claim HNo' : SHMITDO724LC02/L(PATBELIH)
Ctaimant : PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD
Amount % 554,520.00

SINGAPORE DOLLARS FOUR THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED TWENTY ONLY

I/We agree to accept the above mentioned smount to be pald to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident involwing

Claimant Vehicle No. @ SHC ol16E
Insured Vehicle Nop., @ PA TEBLH

Dates of Loss + 205 X2: 2017
Place of Accident : J20 CHIAT ROAD

IN COMSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSUBANCE (SINGAFORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree abscolutely to
discharge CHINA TATIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LID. and/or

Insured MNams ;: SIN ANN TRAVEL & COACH SERVICES PTE LTD
Driver HName : EHANG BIN
from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage

sustained by mefus arising out of the said aceident.

I acknowledos that this payment 1s made without admissien of Iiability on the
part of CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (SINGAPCRE) PTE. LTD.

(1) Glebal Sum (all :in) 5% 4,520.00
TOTAL .+ o o o s 4 3 oo o = .#./H'. 55 4,520.00
/"_ L § = —+t 4 -3 8 = ¢ =} ¢ } 2 _J
o L
Fd ‘;:"‘:_-'-_“a,..l, K C t—
| r’f’_‘/
{ ]
900304475
Claimant Wame : \ -+

i S NRIC No :

Signature : Date . 'S l"q(ﬁ '!T




PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

P R G M ' E R OFFICE: 23 Chang South Avenue 2 #01-02 S{435443)
TEL. 85436876 / B543868% FAX 62141511

AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES €O. REG NO.- 2007077430 GST. REG. NO.: 200707743D
TAX INVOICE
PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD DATE 15-Jan-2018
23 CHANG| SOUTH AVENUE 2 #03-02 PAGE 10F1

SINGAPORE 486443

ITEM Description QTY U.PRICE AMOUNT
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA 3 3,600.00
REGN NO: SHC 6016 E
i,
TOTAL LUMP SUM REPAIR COSTS AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR | % 3,600.00
GST @ 7%| $ 252.00
GRAND TOTAL] § 3,852.00
=
P, —=
- for Premier Aumm?j,!:wfwoes Pte Ltd

P
e

o

o

{ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST)




"PREMIER

TAXIS

29 December 2017
To Whom It May Concern

Dear SirMadam

CERTIFICATION

This letter serves to inform that Tng Toh Huat of NRIC Number S1614293Z is a
registered driver of SHC6016E. Tng Toh Hual is paying daily rental rate of $96.11
(Inclusive of GST).

Should you require further information, please contact us at 6214 8880.
Thank you.

Yours sincerely

F
Chin Bee Lian {Ms)
Assistant Vice President
Taxis Administration

Prepered By: 5Y

PREMIER TAXIS FTELTD

23 Changi South Avenus 2

#03-02

Singapore 486443

Telephone: +is 6214 §880 Fax: +65 G214 0330

sovwepremieripzioon
Co. Rep Me. 200304975H



& PREMIER

TAXIS

*

CHECK IN / OUT VOUCHER

AEPLACEMENT VEH GIVEN YES/NO

VEH NO.

JOB NO.

L L8d BED

DRIVER'SNAME TN G ToH HUAT

NG s | 6142932 |

HANDFHOMES.45-3;44?}

TAXIREGNND. ¢ 'y ~ 6 6 | & E MAKE | MCDEL K6 1
DATE IN _ TIME M DATE OUT TIME OUT
rounxk?7 odoec 26 127 14406
KILOMETRES IN FUEL IN KILOMETRES OUT FUEL OUT
TAX] METER DOWNLOADED
l DATE / TIME TOWED I TO WORKSHOP
DO BB YO F-H Mo
YES NO "t e e
DIATE / TIME GALL 0 DRFVER FOR VEHICLE COLLECTION
DB M YT HoH MM

| ACKNOWELDGE AMD CONFIRM THAT | HAVE
THAT THE SAME IS IN GOOD CONDITION AND

EXAMINED THE ABOVE SAID VEHICLE AND
TC MY SATISFACTION IN EVERY RESPECT

TOGETHER WITH THE ACCESSORIES / [TEMS LIST ABOVE THIS VOUCHER IS USED 1N
CONJUNCTION WITH THE TERM RENTAL AGREEMENT.

INDICATE AREA OF DAMAGE HERE:

=

qﬂﬁo

-

= )

CHECK IN CHECK OUT O O

i Teh Huet ¢ | T Todoat X

DRIVERFS NAME DRIVER'S NAME .

PO s T M O /(2 Or—10
} J -
DRI SIENATURE | DATE / TIME DRIVER'S SIGNATURE / DATE / TIME ] O
FRONT
W BODY MARKINGS
1 - gt Dert 5 - Damaged
- Serious Dent 5 - Ghip
ECKED IN BY CHECKED OUT BY 3 - Light Seraich 7 - Crack

(PREMIER'S AUTHORISED WORKSHOP) {PREMIER'S AUTHORISED WORKSHOP) e o Y o

SERVICE ( REPAIRS DONE DRIVER'S REMARKS

Q SERVIGING QO OTHERS:

0 T/BELT

O AIRCON SYSTEM & ACCIDENT. DATE / TIME of ACCIDENT:

o TURBO 28602197 ©ESY

Q BRAKE SYSTEM

O CLUTCH SYSTEM

0 BULE

O UNDER GARRIAGE TF }' v

Q cPE

O BATTERY




Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANcE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
{ H "
- RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE G5 Registration No: M4000T7733

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-17-191784
Date of Request: 20M2r2017 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd
23 Changi South Ave 2

#01-02

Singapore 485443

Dear SiffMadam,

Enguiry Date 2012207

Enquiry By GOH WEE DEK

TF Vehicle Mo. PATE81H

Accident Date 20122017

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle Mo.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel, No.
PA7881H China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. 13/04/2017-19/06/2018  [6388 6111
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the cenire by the membars of the General Insurance
Assodation of Singapore and we take no responsiblliity for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatscever for any
loss or damage arising out of or In connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

https://www.giarmc.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geni... 20/12/2017



Invoice

NERAL

ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No: GR-17-191784
Date of Request: 20M22017

Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd
23 Changl South Ave 2

GEN
INSURANCE

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm

GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No:

Online Purchase

#01-02

Singapore 486443

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 201272017

Enguiry By GOH WEE DEK

TP Vehicla Mo. PATEB1H

Accident Date 20122017

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S8)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is @ computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:

Date:

[X] GIRO[] Cash[] Cheque
https://www.giarmc.org.sg/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geni... 20/12/2017



