Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 January 2018 3:40 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Linda Liao

Cc: Ivan Teo; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GBD2982H Against SGW9775 Accident on 21/12/2017 *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG17024274/Uea3

Attachments: SGW9775) Accident.mp4; Ol SKETCH PLAN.pdf

Without Prejudice

Hi Linda,

We refer to the email below.

We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement and video for your easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client cut across the
chevron from the left into the slip road and collided with our insured vehicle.

We are of the opinion that our insured is not liable for this accident.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 January 2018 10:36 AM

To: Linda Liao <lindaliao@abwin.com.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Cc: lvan Teo <ivanteo@abwin.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBD2982H Against SGW9775 Accident on 21/12/2017 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG17024274/Uea3

Dear Linda,

We refer to the below email.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Asher at 6841 6051.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
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"Wishing you a Happy New Year 2018”

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Linda Liao [mailto:lindaliao@abwin.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 January, 2018 3:44 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ivan Teo <ivanteo@abwin.com.sg>

Subject: Re: GBD2982H Against SGW9775 Accident on 21/12/2017

Dear All
Please advise the liability as soon as possible.

Thank you
Regards

ABWIN

Abwin Service Pte Ltd

No. 8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4

#07-48 Premier@Kaki Bukit Gate 2
Singapore 415875

Linda Liao
Motor Claim Executive
DID +65 6713 9417 HP:9751 9596

T +65 6713 9400 | F +65 6713 9415
Website | Facebook | LinkedIn

Looking to start a new business soon? Find out how we can provide you with a complete vehicle ownership solution and much more!

Click here to view our listing >>

Sales & Purchase of Pre-owned Commercial & Private Vehicles | Vehicle Service Centre | Vehicle Hire Purchase | Motor Insurance | Gene



