Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 22 December, 2017 11:07 AM

To: ‘Janet Tan'

Cc: Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: Our ref: GBA7078B- Arrange survey for SLQ5019H

Dear Janet,

Received with thanks.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janet Tan [mailto:janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 22 December, 2017 10:56 AM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our ref: GBA7078B- Arrange survey for SLQ5019H

Dear Catherine,

Attach Ol report.

Regards,

Janet Tan
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, December 22, 2017 10:41 AM
To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@egqinsurance.com.sg>




Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Our ref: GBA7078B- Arrange survey for SLQ5019H

Dear Janet,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janet Tan [mailto:janet.tan@egqginsurance.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 22 December, 2017 10:32 AM
To: City Auto <cityauto@singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Bazlin Ahmad <bazlin.ahmad@eginsurance.com.sg>; Tan Wei Yin <weiyin.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: Our ref: GBA7078B- Arrange survey for SLQ5019H

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Dear Vronica

Please be informed that Hansel Ang is no longer at EQl and Tan Wei Yin is no longer handling motor claims.

For future cases, please email to elaine.cheong@eginsurance.com.sg; Bazlin Ahmad bazlin.ahmad@eginsurance.com.sg

and janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg

Otherwise, please fax to 6223 4190.

Aside to LKK, please take note of the date of assignment and proceed to direct settle if possible.

Regards,

Janet Tan
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Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

From: City Auto [mailto:cityauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, December 22, 2017 10:01 AM

To: Hansel Ang <hansel.ang@eqinsurance.com.sg>
Cc: Tan Wei Yin <weiyin.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>
Subject: Arrange survey for SLQ5019H

Dear Motor survey department,

Kindly arrange LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd survey on Tuesday 26/12/2017 10:00AM-12:00PM on following
vehicle :

Resurvey TP

Your vehicle : GBA7078B

Our vehicle : SLQ5019H

D.O.A : 18/12/2017

LOCATION :Blk 8, Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector B #01-58/60/62 Singapore 575643.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vronica Law

City Auto Pte Ltd

Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate,
#01-60/62 Sin Ming Road,
Singapore 575643

Tel : 6453 1235

Fax : 6453 7944



