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Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 January 2018 9:54 AM

To: 'Alan Quek Ai Lun'

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: SLA3366C / FBB3550A Date of accident:06-12-2017

Attachments: REPORT.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

 

Dear Alan, 

 

We refer to the above subject. 

 

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by the parties involved, the liability is unclear. 

 

Should you have any available substantial evidence (CCTV, scene photos or independent witness statement), please 

send us a copy for our review. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Joy Irene | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-5792 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged 

information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender 

immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email 

is strictly forbidden. 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, 5 January 2018 9:33 AM 

To: 'Alan Quek Ai Lun'; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Admin A 

Cc: SUR; assignments 

Subject: RE: SLA3366C / FBB3550A Date of accident:06-12-2017 

 
Dear Alan, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Dear Joy, 

 

Kindly assist. Our Ref: CC4/AXA17024201/jb3 

 

"Wishes you a Happy New Year 2018" 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Alan Quek Ai Lun [mailto:alan.quek@cyclecarriage.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 5 January, 2018 9:27 AM 

To: 'sur@lkkauto.com' <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments@lkkauto.com 

Subject: RE: SLA3366C / FBB3550A Date of accident:06-12-2017 

 

Dear LKK, 

 

Did AXA assign you this case? If yes, kindly assist to check liability for direct settlement. Thank you. 

 

 

Your Sincerely 

 

Alan Quek 

Service Advisor 

Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center 

Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd  

188 Pandan Loop Service Center  

Tel: 6771 4377 | DID: 9186 5112 | Fax: 6872 1272 

Website: www.mercedes-benz.com.sg 

 

     

���� Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

 

 

 

From: Alan Quek Ai Lun  

Sent: Monday, 18 December 2017 6:24 PM 

To: 'MOTOR.SURVEY@AXA.COM.SG' 

Subject: SLA3366C / FBB3550A Date of accident:06-12-2017 

 

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD  

Attn: Motor Claims Dept 

 

RE: Accident involving motor vehicle nos.  SLA 3366 C & FBB 3550 A. 

Along ADAM ROAD TOWARDS LORNIE ROAD INFRONT OF SPC. 

 

We have instructs by our client’s of motor vehicle no:SLA 3366 C, which was involved in the above accident. 

Our client’s vehicle was damaged and. We now claiming against you for costs of repair and other 

consequential loss. 

 

In order that you are the insurer of vehicle no:FBB 3550 A are willing to DIRECT SETTLEMENT and other 

incidental claims. We shall be grateful if you could kindly settle the cost of repair directly with us. On this 

note we will be much appreciated and looking forward to your Confirmation of settlement. 
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Your Sincerely 

 

Alan Quek 

Service Advisor 

Mercedes-Benz Body Care & Repair Center 

Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte Ltd  

188 Pandan Loop Service Center  

Tel: 6771 4377 | DID: 9186 5112 | Fax: 6872 1272 

Website: www.mercedes-benz.com.sg 
 

     

���� Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail. 

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the 

individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended 

recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is 

strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and 

destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily 

the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.  


