Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 26 March, 2018 2:34 PM

To: jaan_sixt9@gmail.com'

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SLR 784J,0ur Ref: CC3/CTI17024198/Sws3,Accident involving Vehicle

SLR 784J & SG 58147 ON 19/12/2017

WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SLR 784]
Our Ref: CC3/CTI17024198/Sws3

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident involving Vehicle SLR 784 & SG 5814Z ON 19/12/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them

Please be informed that our surveyor has tried his very best to negotiate with TP work shop ,Third-Party settlement
breakdown is as follows:

Cost of repairs $1,251.40
Loss Of Income $ 650.00
LTA search fee $ 5.00
$ 1,906.40

d) Professional Fee (w/gst) $ 400.00

As per above, the final and adjusted amount of the third party claim is $ 1,906.40
Please note that a professional fee of $428.00 (w/ gst) is applicable if you would like to settle privately.

Please revert within 7 days from the date of this email. If we will not hear from you after 7 days, we shall proceed to
settle the third party claim and the standing of your NCD will be affected.

Kindly call the undersigned should your need further assistance.

Please acknowledge.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 March, 2018 11:04 AM

To: 'jaan_sixt9@gmail.com' <jaan_sixt9@gmail.com>

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: SLR 784J,0ur Ref: CC3/CTI117024198/Sws3,Accident involving Vehicle SLR 784J) & SG 5814Z ON
19/12/2017

WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SLR 784]
Our Ref: CC3/CTI17024198/Sws3

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident involving Vehicle SLR 784] & SG 5814Z ON 19/12/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them

Please be informed that our surveyor has tried his very best to negotiate with TP work shop ,Third-Party settlement
breakdown is as follows:

Cost of repairs $1,251.40
Loss Of Income $ 650.00
LTA search fee $ 5.00
$ 1,906.40

d) Professional Fee (w/gst) $ 400.00

As per above, the final and adjusted amount of the third party claim is $ 1,906.40
Please note that a professional fee of $428.00 (w/ gst) is applicable if you would like to settle privately.

Please revert within 7 days from the date of this email. If we will not hear from you after 7 days, we shall proceed to
settle the third party claim and the standing of your NCD will be affected.

Kindly call the undersigned should your need further assistance.

Please acknowledge.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



