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Insuted Tel No HP B’l,ﬁ";‘f‘”" Make / Model ! \\0
Excess Sec 11 :S§ poA: B\l ﬂ"-ﬂq Place of Accident : mont acd
Is drrver the owner? { YES / ND ) Wamre of Accadem
If NO, Driver Name / Age O GIA REPORT: YES / NO ; TP GLA REPORT: YES / NO
Driver Tel No. : (V- YES/NO) Instired Liability L Final ? Yes /! No
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INSRS -. INSRS: INSHS: INSRS:
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Tel Td: Tel Tel:
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Date/ Time _.
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I 1 | o Non-Reportng by (Ind)
[MNon-Reporting b (Final)
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EH / Htg 130 . ?’_; y |Motification bir Gf nonpickup) | = |
de T .r, fier call ir to O
'fh ;M wxtion To Act 1I % i
II!_.._lz.’lm Vouches:
[Finat Repair Bt _
Jcar Remmal tnvoice |
Towing Invoice ] L]
Jura s Gia
Medical Bill:
L
I |Mandae Reyect instruction
LOD
Povment Breakdown Form
PRELIMINARY ADVICE Date/Time: Sent By Pust-Repair Photos Ll
[Others: 1 T —
FINALIZATION Dute/Time Confirm with Confirm by
Repair Cost s§ | days) Reduction’ % Email | __jcall | ]
FINAL SETTLEMENT __ D/ Time ym%@.\ Confim with M Heag Tl -
Final Libility: % Lee | Assessed) BOLA SN No.: 9 |IfNO or B 28, Ass. Lia:
Repair Cost: 55 1960.00° '
Loss of Reatal (LOR): s$ [ days)
Loss of Use (LOU): s% l{ﬁn 00 s GO x § days)
Loss of Income (LOI): S5 [h 1 davs) ]
LoRoaly [ | LoUenly [ Jtor+tou_J tor=1ot ] [rick only ane | ____j-_lly?
GLA/LTA Search ss 5.4 \
Medical ss N 1) Claim status: Normal/Reject/Private Settle
Disbursement ss {eg Tow' Independent ) 2) Report Format
Legal Cost S$ 3) Survey fee
Totak: ss 3345.26 Global Sum S§:
FINAL PAYMENT Date/Time: ____ Confirm with Emaill | caill__|
Payes | B 'ﬂ_$33 85. 35 MName 1! ﬁU&H maiﬂ'ﬂ WERM i}
Payes2: (Strike N A" 1% _ [Name2 - ;
Payes 3: (8t kny 1A 3% P . . 8 L T U




ASS. REG. BY
Ko pnerh ASIGNMINT
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t Workshop s lrvan Ve — |Coon /e MG insured!StdINIINA
of Sp.Reading E?_ng,;‘,f T/Radio: Insured | Std | NI | NA
Insured: EngMNo:
PoicyNo. CiNo VIKYBAA 202 Ce FPcies
Claims No. Gen. Cond: @od) Falr | Poor | Burnt
5um Insured: Excess: Steering: Inqrefer | Jammed | Leaked / Bumt or
(Cliant's Record) Brake: Indider | Jammed | LeakedJ Bumt or
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(Red 4 (537.29 35/
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CiateTir, Pl Rinturn 107 {Pomgomtex:  §
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GUAN MOTOR WORKS

Prsariess Mogn. Moo OB TN

140 San Ming Drtve #0208 Sin Ming Aulocare Singapore 5757210 Tel 6453 6111 Fax. 6451 8292 1P 9742 GOD3

REPAIR ESTIMATE FOR GBD4922T

No.

=

Wb

woB w M

Qty

b

SV
4 /JC?,

/f_fm-‘-:?

Spare Parts
List Items
Rear RH body panel 5 # 1,976.50 il
Rear RH body panel sliding door rall S Ji~ 14580 X
[ 2,122.30
Less 30% S 636.69
Total: S 1,485.61
Nett Items
Rear bumper ﬁ/’/'ff 75800 “—
Rear bumper side retainer s T3040 —
RH taillamp § v 40680 —
S 1,235.20
Less 10% S 123.52
Total: S 1,111.68
Labour
Labour Charges for remove/refit, panel beating, cutting 5 1,000.00 ?cr-'crf
welding and replacement of damages.
To putty and spray Spray Paintings charges. 5 600,00 7 Zc !
To check wirings and lightings. 5 40.00 Zeor
To remove, refix rear RH upholstery & fittings. 5 12000 St
To apply antl rust treatment 5 80.00 .-,
Total: & 1,84000
Total Parts and Labour: § 4,437.29

u"T;;c:»a.-dt_f
f zyﬂc?‘

CJ/E-"E.?/

{&



" Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 December, 2017 12:39 PM

To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com; Admin A

Cc: Tan, Lily (AIG); Fong, Andy-SY; Kaur, Baljit; Chin, Lee-Ying; Abu Kassim, Noor
Mariesa; Md Ishak, Mohd Imran; Chan, Yoke Shi

Subject: aigencrypt - Pre repair inspection request - GBD4922T VS SJA9100L (OI) DOA:
06/12/2017

Attachments: Fax6950.tif 12-46pm © so]12(1%

Vehicle In
H peion@ Ah
Please refer to the enclosed request from CK TEO & CO. Sq&@ kﬂ;ﬂ 2

Kindly carry out Policy coverage verification first before conducting the pre-repair inspection within 48 hours

If you have any queries/concems, please let us know.
Kindly assist to assign Kenneth Kong as Single Joint Expert as requested.

Thank you

Best Regards

Lim Sheng Yang

AlG

Claim Adjuster ||, Singapore FNOL. Claims Operations — Auto
Shared Services — Malaysia | Global Business Services

AlG Shared Services (M) Sdn Bhd (887191-D)

Menara Worldwide, Level 12, 188 Jalan Bukit Bintang, 55100 Kuala Lumpur, Malaysia
Tel +6 03 2719 6000 | Ext 1012101 | Fax +6 03 2685 5898

ShenagYang.Lim@aig com | www.alg.com

From: Willow Tuang [mailto:wtuang@gmail.com]

Sent: Wednesday, December 20, 2017 12:27 PM

To: Lim, Sheng Yang

Subject: Re: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SJAS100L AND GBD4922T
ON 06/12/2017

Dear Sir,

We refer to your email of even date.

We are agreeable of appointing KENNETH KONG (LKK AUTO) as a Single Joint Expert.

Our client's vehicle is available for pre-repair survey at:



Venue : Guan Motor Works

176 Sin Ming Drive #02-03
Sin Ming AutoCare
Singapore 575721
Tel: 6453 6111 (AH HENG)

Regards

Tuang Willow

CK TEO & CO

Tel: 65354788

On Wed, Dec 20, 2017 at 10:48 AM, Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYanp.Lim@aig.com> wrote:
Wi judice

Your Reference : GBD4922T

Our Reference : SJA9100L

Dear SirfMadam,

We refer to your Notice of Accident on 19/12/2017,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/vour customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor warkshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the joint
pre-repair survey as a single joint expert:

Name of Surveyor Company Name
Lim Kok Chong AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
Kumar Uthaya AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
Ken Wong AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
Lawrence Ng Chun Kee Priority Services




leffrey Ong Leng Kiat Priority Services
| Jimmy Lee Priority Services
EC Looi Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Ricky Teng RT Appraisal Pte Ltd
Elson Teng RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

Michael Cheong

RT Appraisal Pte Ltd

Pang Kiah Keen (Frankie)

Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd

Ng You Han

Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd

Soon HanXin (Gary)

Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd

Chow Bo Xiong Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd
Chua Soo Teck {Benjamin) Formteam Adjusters Pte Ltd
Kalvin Ang LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Xing Guo Qiang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Marcus Chua

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Mohamad Taufikh LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Adrian Ling LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Henry Ng LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Mohammed Rasul

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Steven Fnung

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Wei lie

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Ma Chin Fook

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Kenneth Kong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors
as a single joint expert. You may select one or more of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of the pre-

repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Lim Sheng Yang

AlG

Claim Adjuster Il. Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations — Auto




.Shared Services — Malaysia | Global Business Services

AIG Shared Services (M) Sdn Bhd (887191-D)

Menara Worldwide, Level 12, 198 Jalan Bukit Bintang. 55100 Kuala Lumpur, Malaysia

Tel +6 03 2719 6000 | Ext 1012101 | Fax +6 03 2685 5898

ShengYang.Lim@aig.com | www.aig.com

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group. Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

View Received Message

This mak s associated with @

*GBD492IT (49792452015G)
[m::uml
SYSMA CONSTRUCTION FTE LTD
Der & 2017 11:004M
[Fraser John Thomas Howie
Guan Maotar Works

“Reply | Repiy AN | MarkasUnresd | ot Message | Delete Message | Forwart |

From AIG Asia Paciflic Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 21/12,/2017 11:14 AM.
To LKK_HQ
[= NoorMariesa Abukassimilaig.com

Subject  NO Ol GIA REPORT

Hi

Kindly be informed that 01 has not reported yet. O] details as below
Name | Fraser John Thomas Howie

Address : 1 Belrmont Road, The Belmont #03-00 Singapore 265852
Maobile No. : 81022476

Thanks
Hanesa

|DOCUMENTS SUMMARY - -
There are no documents.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=8V Cmail&fuseaction=dsp... 22/12/2017
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§1 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408833 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC4/A1G17024137/Kua3
22" December 2017

Fraser John Thomas Howie

| Belmont Road

The Belmont #03-00

Singapore 269852

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJA 91001 AND GBD 4922T ON 06.12.2017 ALONG /
AT BELMONT ROAD

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appointed to act on the behalf of your
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd (AIG) to settle a THIRD PARTY claim
against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date and location.

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this
letter, giving the version of the accident amongst other things related to the accident. The
GIA report can be lodged at any of AIG reporting centres. You may refer to your
Certificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centres.

If you have any information to add or any amendments to make, please contact the
undersigned within five days from the date of this letter.

Please note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD, premium & etc
would be affected.

Yours faithfully,

Y

Thin Thin
Claims

Tel : 6841 2360
Fax: 6741 4108

Email : thinthin@|kkauto.com

ec. Claims Manager
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)
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S1UBLAVE 1L #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX :1065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC4/AIG17024137/Kual
22 JANUARY 2018

FRASER JOHN THOMAS HOWIE
| BELMONT ROAD

#03-00

SINGAPORE 269852

Dear Sir'fMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJA 9100L & GBD 4922T ON 06/12/2017

We refer 1o the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further quenies.

Yours faithful]v,

THIN THIN HLAING

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: thinthin@lkkauto.com

ce.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)
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accident involving 6 /T\:smr vehicles

m_é;Eg_ﬁE:r ﬂh« SJ;} Q00 o4 2 >0y Qbmf/
ad  pement R

1. WARRANT TO ACT

IIWE A on | G ITRi.r['Hf,hl pr= L fNRlC HDJ tha ﬂB?gi W

o LBaleckier Rl 03- 669 Bafesties Hil Shopping_Confre {(32002)
hereby authonse M/is QUW Ml'ﬂi‘? W! to act on my/our

benall in respect of the above matter

2. AUTHORITY

a) We nereby authorise you 10 commence legal proceedings in my/our name(s)
and to take instructions from my car-repairers who l/iwe have appointed as
miy/our agent(s) in respect of my/our claim

b) I/WVe hereby authorise you to pay to yourselves all Party and Party costs you may
at any lime raceive in connection with the above matter and confirm that there
will be no need to pay the same into the Client(s)'s Account with your Bankers

c) IWe hereby further authorise you to release all proceeds of settiement monies

-ﬂcewed by, ﬁ}ﬁﬂ(aﬂer dgflucung of your Legal costs) to my repairers
in settiemant of

my uutﬁtanmng billfaccount with them

d) IWe enly wish to be informed of my/our case when It is necessary on your pan
IWWe hereby direct you 1o keep my car-repairers informed of all matters relating to
my claim, as and when it is necessary to do so

el iIWe hereby authonse you to deposit in your Firms’ client's account any chegues
received by you and made in my/our firm’'s nama.

fl I e have read and understood the above

sTSMA CONSIRUC IO ETE LTD

.............

Execcutive .I:lu.uw

{Signature)
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RELEASE VOUCHER

“Wel, LUAN MOTOR WORKS (“the workshop”) heseby confirm that we']l have reached ar
agresuicnt with the appointed surveior of AIG Asie Pacific Insurance Pre Lid LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LID (name of surveyor) with respest to the amoun: ¢'aimed for §3
220000 (Repair Cost), BS480.00 iL.oss of Use/Remed). S§ .38 (Disbursement) for vehicle no
GBD 49271 that was demaped pursusnt to the aceident which occurred oo 96/122017 (date) along
EELMONT ROAD (location) involving vehicle no/s §JA Y10OL. This Is pursuant to the
inspection conductad on 20/12/2017 (date) at “the workshop'.

Wed confinm that wel wrefant authoslzed by the owner SYSMA CONSTRUCTION PIE LTD
(“the third parny claimant™) of vehicle no GBD 4322T make the claim as set out in the above

paragraph and wefl have full authority o sentle the matter on hisher behalf in & manner thar we/l
deem 1. We/l enclose herein the letter of mahority given by “the third party claimant™

Wel further confirm thar we/l will indemnify AIG Asna Pacific lasurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and'or expense that they will or huve alisady hicurred in the event thal “tha third party
claimam” after the above sald agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
experses suffered peraining ro costs of repairs and/cr rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage 0 GPP 49217 (vehicle no.) as a result of the sccident

Wel confirm thal the sgreement reached above is i full and final senlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant 1o the sccident and that further this settlement 15 reached on &
without pre udice and without admission of liability basis.

This agresment is subject to the spplication of Singapore law and the Singapose Courts have
exelusfve Jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

0] |2 14

(dayrof __ ________ (month) 20___ (year)

, e

Signed by sppointed surveyor

RS

al/a1




23/@82/2018 ©&:37 54538252

R E S R
GUAN MOTOR WORKS

Business Regn. Mo 061026-00E
176 Sin Ming Dirive #02-03 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 575721 Tel: 6453 6111 H/P 9742 6003

FRacE ol

SYSMA CONSTRUCTION PILLID

— — Invoice No: 4846

19-12-2017

Movars

FANTT

= - — — —

NISSAN NV2on - GRD 49221

T RS D a Tl LT - T

| Lump sum for total repair cost inclusive of spare parts
anid lubour charges,
L 2.800}00

Dollars Two thousand Nine hundred only

E.&OE.
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Enquire Vehicle & Owner Intormatian | Vehicle No. SIA2100L As At 06 Dac 2017 / 11:05:00 )

Laws Flim Search Detalls

Search Heguen Pl ante “lair o relation to srabhe pogdent

L Flimn £ e Mg, TCEWITLTA X 176G

Currert Cwner Detalh

Oweer 12 Typm Singapcre NI

Promer 7 STILI0TR

SAmEr e FRASER JOrM THUMAS =00/

Reglstered Adoress Type: Private Residetisl (Land Aot or Housal Shonpng/ Ofee Complass
Aegatered Bock/Hinke

Mo,

Tegisiered Stwet Name:  RELMONT ROAD )
Angistead Linit Na: #0300

Regisiered Bulang harme -
Reglyrered Poursl Code: 249952
Current Viehicle Detalla

Vet s Moy SJATLOOL
Makce Ceseriot'ovMadel: VOLVD / XC90 12 (4 AINS AlPBAG
frgurance Cormguary Mame MG SS1A PACIFIC INSURANCEFTE LT
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastinne

:un-t .H.I'IH:H.D"EH mmﬂﬂﬁ N )
Case |Ha1.‘1huﬂ |Est iunrnm:ed |Ad1 Assigned | Ad] Rpt | Ad} Submitted iTrli Auth'ed Status =
| 20 Dee 2017 (20Deca01? oe) 900,00 5$2,900.00 "'"‘"E""""m"
Hain Eant Aeg | e edi Estmates. || view e |
| e | £ agf Rot | | | Cancel Cane |

Claim Details

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
Insured: | FRASER JOHN THOMAS HOWIE, [D: 571610791

Main Claimant: | SYSMA CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD, Co, Reg, No.: 196303931
‘Wehiche Reg. No.: GBD4922T | Date of Loss: |W12.FMI7 11:00-:59

| CIaim Type: TP [ 497924520156 'Pnlwf:wrr Mate Na.- nﬂumm (Comprehensive)
'u'nhu;ll  Rog. | l‘m |;1nh.rn-_|:|;| SIASi00L | Panp Nao. H:lan'nlnt] | AZBEI0DTIFSMEL
| Excess:
| Guan Motor Works (HQ) 176 Sin Ming Drive #02-03 Sin Ming Autocare, 575721 Sin Ming - Tel: 64536111

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Express) - Tel; 65-6419-3000 ... [Handied by Chan, Kian-Chuan]
| Minn-Chuan.Chan@aig.com

Claimant’s Insurer: MSIG Insurance {!kwu_ﬂ Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel! +65 GE27 TRBE

Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by KENMETH KONG] ... [Final Rpt
sk (due 02/01/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

» AIG_5G (21/12/2017): NO O GIA REPORT

| [Created by adjuster]

‘View Al | Compose Case mail ||

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS— View All | Search Tasks | Creste Mew Task | Compiete |

Due Date Priarity Type Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
Iunruults.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_c... 7/2/2018
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Claim Documents

*GBD4922T (49792452015G)
[S3A9100L]
TP
SYSMA CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD
Dec 6 2017 11:10AM
[FRASER JOHN THOMAS HOWIE]
Guan Motor Works

Uplaad Docurmenty [ Upload Photos | Compose New Letter |  Upioad videa |  upioad Ao | Wiew [view in Browser v |
Letters/Correspondences o |[Epersse TV &
Mo [Fmaized On  LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
1__|{Deft) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Braakdown 4] Edit
Assessment Reports o [iperpage ] & |
Mo |Finalized On .l._:_l..'rm Pacific Insurance Pte, Ltd, (54G) | Thumbnail = Print
1 fammam e | NSt omsast: SAEA X000 TGS HOME © | wsonm |

|
|
[Photos/Images \3perpage [v] 4
|No |Rlﬂhtlfltuml:r LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnall | Print
1 |01/02/1817:24  General View 0| s |
2 |01/D2/18 17:24 | Genaral View O (o )rG '
3 (0102181724 General View — O s @
4 _in1mz;ta 17:24  General View 0| toadirc (A
5 |01/02/18 17:24  General View Q| s A
6 |01/02/1817:24 | General View O wiws &
7 !.I:.FI_.FE;'..;'-IE 17:24 IEITHII View Q| weowrs M
8 fnuum_n_n:n | ol Viesy B @ weaaws @
9 0102181724 Odometer Reading @ weiws |@
m .bﬁnﬁ:ﬁ Chassis Number Q| awrs M

Documentation IH_EI' 154
|ua Imumurd-r LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnall = Print
':mm:-_ 15:54  ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO AIG DD 20.12.2017

1

2 IJ_U..I"III"I? 15 54 NOTIFICATION Flﬂuﬂm_l-fﬂmw
3 |[20/12/17 17:56 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED
4 '!UH‘H? 05:04 | Nen reporting letter

5 'D‘?fﬂl.'lﬂ 0954 |WORKSHOP INVOICE
E

7

E

'E

ﬂ?fﬂl'!lﬂ 09:54 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM

i

o | D

|

|

aﬁam‘f -Y-1-)

58
3|3

|

|07/02/16 0954 | Release Voucher
|07/02/18 09:54 | LTA SEARCH
(07/02/18 D9:54 | LETTER TO OI

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | swve | pont |
There are no document checklists configured.

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 7/2/2018
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Our Checklist Remarks - LK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: [ Handling 1neurer
FaitE BEmas AT POREE uniEs via Bhae T 1D Sther parten
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
I"l"thicll No: SJAS100L (Insd veh) Model: ISSAN NV200 1.5 D MT ABS
GBD4922T (TP veh) IRBAG 2WD 6DR (A)

| Date of Accident: |06/12/2017

Global Sum Settlement | | [ | Yes | [X] No

Repair Estimate £ 4,437.29

Final Repair Cost % 2.800,00

Loss of Use 1 480.00 6.00 days at £80.00 per day
Rental (if any) :§ 0.00 days

LTA ! GIA Search Fee '8 535

Others: 4 | 0.00

%

Final Setllement Sum - 3.385.35

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X] NO  (Kindly indicate
below)

A} For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: Papiosbe "

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability {*); (%)
* Assessed Liability lo be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) | Guan Motor Works & 3,385.35
2 ' $
3) '$
4 s
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN °§u';'§‘
LKK Auto Consullants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
|Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher, Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report! Bill {if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreg ne 1588071008

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Indusirial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel; 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@ikkauto com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG17024137/KUA3O2

Date: 07022018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. Policy No 2100239829-06000
Claimant Vehicle ;gn4g2z7 Insured Vehicle No : SJAS100L
Date of Loss: 06/1272017 Mature of Claim TP Claim No: 497924520156
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No GBD4922T
Make & Model: NISSAN NV200, 1.5 D MT ABS AIRBAG 2WD BDR (A) Engine No:  K9KC4D0D053543
Reg Date: 18/11/2014 (Man. Year: 2014) Chassis No: VSKYBAM20Z0090384
Caolour: Silver Odometer: 853684 km
Engine Capacity 1461 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insurad (S%): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable); Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Froni Tyre Size: 17570 R14 Rear Tyre Size: 175/T0R14
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 7 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
Fronl Right Side: Eridgestone 7 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
The above valves represan/ [he remaining hyre ireads deplh
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %)
Paris 258729 249523 102.06 383
Miscellansous llams 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.840.00 1,150.00 690.00 37.50
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 4437.29 3,645.23 792.06 17.85
Approved Total (Overriddan) (55) 2,900.00
Nett Amount (S§) 4.437.29 2,900.00 1.537.29 34,64
+ Loss of Use (6.0 x S$80.00/day) (S5) 480.00
+ DociSearch Fee (S§) 5.35
Nett Liability (S$) 3,385.35
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 201122017
Date Inspecied: 20/12/2017 Inspected Af; Guan Motar Works (HQ)
176 Sin Ming Drive #02-03 Sin Ming
Autocare
Singapore 575721
Estimated Period of Repair 6.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfim?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_p... 7/2/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: THIN THIN HLAING

NOTE Thes report represants aur findings 3t tha lime and pisce of inspaction stated herein. Such ingpection has been camed ouf io the beat of owr
krowledge and abilly but any affer kabifty under any offer crcumstances s heredy expressly excluded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 “REAR RH BODY PANEL Bent 1.97650FL =1.8768.50FL
2 1 ‘REAR RH BODY PANEL SLIDING DOOR RAIL Serviceable 145 B0 FL *~FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER Dented / Cul 758.00FN  *75B.00FN
4 2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER Distorted 70.40 FN *70.40FN
5 1 “RH TAILLAMP Broken 406 80FN  *406.B0FN
F=Franchise parl L=ListhemDas NeNattitamDac
Sub Total (S§)  3,357.50 3211.70
- List Item Discount on L Items 30.00/30.00% (S§) 636,69 562 05
- Nett Item Discount on N ltems 10.00/10.00% (S%) 123.52 12352

Total Parts (S§)  2,597.29 2,495.23

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellanecus ltems selectad,

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 LABOUR CHARGES FOR REMOVE/REFIT ,PANEL Mew 1.000.00 700.00
BEATING,CUTTING WELDING AND REPLACEMENT OF
DAMAGES
2 TO PUTTY AND SPRAY SPRAY PAINTING CHARGES New 600.00 320.00
3 TO CHECK WIRINGS AND LIGHTINGS New 40.00 20.00
4 TO REMOVE,REFIX REAR RH UPHOLSTERY & FITTINGS MNew 120.00 B0.00
5 TO APPLY ANTI RUST TREATMENT New 80.00 30.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1.840.00 1,150.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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