Team B

From: Kitty Teo Poh Guek [Kitty. Teo@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 10 July, 2012 5:10 PM

To: Team B

Cc: Flossie Ang; Goh Bee Ling (PSC); Ong Eng Hong (PSC); Tan Chia Ling (PSC)

Subject: DS/ TRANS-CAB / P0420554 / OD-GM7228M / TP-SHD124K / 15.06.2012 / EST
$10,697.96 / FA

Attachments: GIA REPORT .pdf; PA - SHD 124K.pdf; WSP EST.pdf; GM7228M - 150612.pdf

Categories: STIL NOT ATTENDED

RISK 1-P0420554

Claim received on 10/07/2012.
GM7228M(INSD) C/W SHD124K
VTP

SITF 10.07.12

NCD-Y

FA 10.07.12

Kitty TEO

Claims Assistant — Motor Claims

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way #27-01 AXA Tower Singapore 068811
kitty.teo@axa.com.sq

DID: (65) 6880 4602 Fax: (65) 6880 4838

Website: www.axa.com.sg

M redefining / standards

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you
and AXA. Any unauthorised disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the
message, please notify the sender immediately.

5% Please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Team B [mailto:admin-b@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, July 10, 2012 2:21 PM

To: Kitty Teo Poh Guek; Tan Tiong Beng; Winnie Ho Ping Ping

Cc: Choi Fang; Khai Xin

Subject: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl GM 7228M (OI) & SHD 124K (TP) on 15/06/2012 (LKK Ref: CC3/AXA12011929/
Khc3) (Your Ref: To be advice)

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHD 124K at M/s TRANS CAB.

Enclose herewith a copy the TP’s GIA Report ,estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice for your perusal.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Just for your information, the case handler in charge for this case is Ms Khai Xin and she can be contacted at 6841
2928.



Thank you.

Best Regards,
Cindy Tan
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6366 0055
FAX: 6741 4108



