Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 26 October 2018 5:02 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Catherine Thia; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG7389Y (OF:
SNM17D07150C02/9) AND SLIS391T (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI17024088/ea3) on
16/12/2017

LKK REF - CC6/CTI17024088/ea3
CTI REF — SNM17D07150C02/9 (GBG7389Y)

Dear Asher

wWe refer to your email pertaining to the above matter.
You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 54,126.00.
We await your payment advice to enable Catherine to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID:; +6563896183

FAX: +65 6224 7T478/6224 7175

Email: claimsd .cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sqg.cntaiping.com
www . sg.cntaiping.com

TS ARY
Ll

1 ! 1
I Singapore viwce 1938

Disclaimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. Any unauwthorized disclosure,
wse or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited, If vou are not the intended recipient of the message. please notifv the
sender immediately

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, October 26, 2018 2:39 PM



To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Elaine Cheong <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com=; Alfred Toh <alfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com=>; Chee 50 Chow

<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG7389Y (Ol: SNM17D07150C02/9) AND

SLIS391T (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI17024088/ea3) on 16/12/2017

Hi 5ir,

We refer to the email dated 18.10.18.

Third party chasing for offer / settlement.

Please kindly let us have your approval / instruction if any.

Thank You,

best Regards,

Asher Sng | Cose Hondler

LKK Auto Consullants Pte Lid

phone: 4841-6051 | emaoil: gshesna@lkkouts.com | foaw: &7 41-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubl industriol Park, Ui Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 18 October 2018 3:33 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=
Cc: 'elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com’ <elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Alfred Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>,

'Chee So Chow' <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject;: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG7389Y (Ol : CAl - SNM17D07 150C02/9)
AND SLJ5391T (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI17024088/ea3) on 16/12/2017

Your ref: SNM17D07150C02/9
LKK REF: CCB/CTI17024088/Aeain2

Dear 5irs,

We refer to the above matter.

The said chain collision involved 4 vehicles whereby our insured was the 2nd vehicle.

In accordance to the MCF guideline for chain collision, we have to settle the front vehicle's claim at 100%.
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) maybe affected.
We seek your approval to offer repairer " MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD" at $4,126.00 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -



Amount Claimed  Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (w/GST) 5 8,671.37 $ 3,424.00
2. Loss of Rental (7days x 5120) $  840.00 $  700.00 (7days x $100)
3. LTA Search Fee 5 2.00 4 2.00
Total $9,513.37 s 4,126.00

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Thank You.

Besl Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Hondler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone; 4841-6051 | emai gshesng@ikkouto.com | fax &741-4108
Bl 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Uni Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5[408933)

From: Asher 5ng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 24 August 2018 11:56 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'elaine.cheong@sg.cntaiping.com' <elaine.cheon cntaiping.com>; 'Alfred Toh' <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=;
Chee 5o Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com=

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG7389Y (O1: CAl - SNM 17D07150C02/9) AND SLI5391T (TP : LKK
REF - CCB/CTI17024088/ea3) on 16/12/2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed for your perusal is:

e TP MARKED ESTIMATE
e PRELIMINARY ADVISE

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handlel

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 6341-6031 | email: ashersng@ikkauto.com | fox: 4741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 27 December 2017 5:59 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>




Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com=; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG7389Y (Ol : CAl - SNM17D07150C02/9) AND SLI5391T (TP : LKK

REF - CCB/CTI17024088/ea3) on 16/12/2017

Dear Mei Kwan
Attached our insured’s accident report for your attention.

Best Regards

Joel Goh
Claims Executive (Motor Division)
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-02

Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6184

Fax: 6224 7175/ 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg cntaiping.com
joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer : This message is confidential; its contents dao nat constitute @ commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapare) Pte.
Ltd. except where provided for in a writien agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the
message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 27 December, 2017 10:22 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: Joel Goh <joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@|kkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a |kkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving GBG7389Y (Ol : CAl - TBA) AND SLJ5391T (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/CTI17024088/ea3) on 16/12/2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
"Wishes you a Happy New Year 2018"

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email; MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | Si408933)



From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
sent: Tuesday, 19 December, 2017 7:40 FM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com=; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com=; Vic (LKKAuto)
cvicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a |kkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBG7389Y (OI : CAl - TBA) AND SLI5391T (TP : LKK REF -

CC6/CTI17024088/ea3) on 16/12/2017

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case from M/s Modern Automotive Pte Ltd.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP's GIA report for your perusal.

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.
To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http:/www.symanteccloud.com




MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD1 #01 -81

SINGAPORE 408717

GST REG. NO : 200501102H

TEL: 6745 4422 / 6745 4422 FAX : 6747 6720

Email: chin@modernautomotive.com.sg

YOUR REF : GBG7389Y
OUR REF : SLJ5391T

Date : 14.08.2018

The Claims Manager

China Taiping Insurance Co (s) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00

Spring Leaf Tower

Singapore 079809

Tel : 6222 2366

Fax : 6222 1033

RE : ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ5391T & GBG7389Y ON 16.12.2017
ALONG BOUNDARY RD TWDS AMK B4 OVERHEAD BRIDGE

We refer to the above matter.

We have been authorized by our client Mr Foo Cheow Sun (Fu Zhaori)
to make claim against your insured vehicle No. GBG7389Y in respect of the above
accident for the following :

Repair Cost $ 3.424.00 (Incl GST)
Loss of rental (7 days x $120) $ 840.00
Search fee 3 2.00

Total: $ 4,266.00

Enclosed herewith a copy each of the supporting documents for your perusal.
Kindly process the above and remit the payment to us asap.

Yours faithfully

AR |
Modern ﬁuton{miue Pte Ltd

L1




Asher Sng !LKKAutu}

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 January 2018 10:30 AM

To: ‘JLJNE_CLASSECIDEAS@YAHOD.CDM.SG‘

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 7389Y AND SLJ 5391T / OTHERS ON 16/12/2017

I &

- mw W Consultants
S BA B Pl Lid

51 UILAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE S08933 TEL : (065) 62563361 FAX : (063) 62564313
Our Ref: CC6/CTI17024088/Aeal

08 JAN 2018

CLASSIC IDEAS FURNITURE PTE LTD

Dear Sir'fMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBG 7389y AND SLJ 5391T / OTHERS ON 16/12/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information
given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed
to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng(@lkkauto.com

Cit, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

e \8 [ ] (3

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
Dear Sir,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE
ON i o T casscasn ALONG.. BOUNA Ay Bl dwds A

This letter is to authorize MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD at Block 3023A, Ubi Road 1,
#01-61, Singapore 408717 to resolve the above matter.

In respect of this authorization, MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD has my/our authority to
decide on my/our behalf whether to accept any offer of settlement from the third party
insurers. I/we also agreed that all payments include Loss of Use to make in favour of
MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD.

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD is also authorized to sign all the required documents
include Discharge Voucher from the third party insurers on my/our behalf.

Yours Faithfully

Signature of Owner

Fop Chsow (U

NMame / NRIC



Palicy Naoo DMCVSNLITEZR41T00Q Claim No @ SHM1IT7DOFLSQCOZFD
Glaimant FOO CHEQW SUN (FUO EHRORI)
Amotint E 554,126.00

DOLLARS FOUR THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED AND TWENTY ZIX ONLY.

I/We agree to accept the sbove mentioned amount to be paid to me/us in full &

final settlemant of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries {/ damages
sustained by me/us through an accident invelving

Claimant Vehicle Weo. : SLJ 5391T
Insiored Vehicle No. @ GBG 7389%Y

Date of Loss + 16/12/2017
Place of Acoident : BOUNDARY RD TWDS AME B4 OVERHEAD BRIDGE

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementionsd sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPCRE) FPTE. LTID., I/We agree absolutely to
dizcharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE {SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Hame 1 CLASSIC IDEAS FURNITURE PTE LTD
Driver Name t OH BENG KHOOW

from 211 claims, present or future in respect of all lgss, dnjury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the said accident.

1 acknowledge that thisz payment is made without admission of -liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) FIE. LTD.

(1) General Damages 55
(2) Cost of Repair/Exceeos 8% 3,424.00
{3) Loss of Hse/Rental+iBessing 55 700.00
{4) GIA/Police Reports/

Investigation Results/Search Fees 5% 2.00
{5} Medical Reports/Expenses 55
{6} Burvey Fees/Towing Fee/Disbursement 55
{7} Cost including Disbursement 55

TETBRL e e o m me me omyom b A s be e D 4,126.00

Claimant Name : FOO CHEOW SUN (FU ZHACRI) NRIC Mo : S5724%054A

Signature : Date




MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1#01-58/61 SINGAPORE 408717
TEL : 67474422, 67454422 FAX | 67476720
GST REG. NO : 200501102H

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE CO (S) PTE LTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00
SPRING LEAF TOWER SINGAPORE 079909

Attention : Maotor Claim Department
Contact : 62222366/63896111 Fax No.: 62221033

Tax Invoice : TP0O01236

Date © 10/08/2018
Vehicle Num. : SLJ 53817

Make/Model : TOYOTA SIENTA-2016

Chassis/Engh .
Accident Date - 16122017
Claim No. :

Reference |
Policy No. ' 5095804457

SM Quantity Particular Unit Price Amount S
LABOUR :
ACCIDENT REPAIR (LUMPSUM) 3,200.00
Labour Total 5% : 3.200.00
Total S% . 3,200.00
GST@ 7% S§ : 224,00
Amount Due S% 342400

'\H.ﬂuﬂﬁi _

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD




DAWN ENTERPRISES

AR WEST FARMWAY 1

SIHGAPURE 798125
TEL): 6383 3 2661 FAX: 6484 2836

MO, 430058/000 No. l 9 3 5 {1 _
}\-\\_\‘.‘I

A

OFFICIAL RECEIPT C Date,.

A
Received from —— ﬁ:‘%&\ j\ik;\]( M\i g K .
the sum of Dollars et \ ﬁ\'?\ ( ﬁ““‘]_ \_\._ _"\_\ﬁ‘,
B L

being Payment Of = . <2 SV .

\ DA E ﬁn*&npmses
g W Y

Cash/Chegue Na

=
e
—

e —————



s -

DAWN ENTERPRISES

21 Seletar West Farmway 1
Singapore 798125
Fax: 64842836

Tel: 63832661

Reg No.430058/00D

RENTAL AGREEMENT DATE
HIRER'S PARTICULARS S, DRIVER'S PARTICULARS
/
C e O \W\ "
e k
Address 1 pT ﬁ&\m ‘ﬁ Addrass
L €
SINACY
|/C or Passpart No. E ] t.'s A‘ ﬁ Country \IC or Passport No. ____ Country ____
Ocoupation Cictupaion
Date of Birth e Date of Birth —  Ago
Drjving Licence Mo. W@ DatePassed Driving Licence No. Date Passed
Tel; (HP) (Fesidence) Tel: {Dffice) (Residernce)
IMPORTANT NOTES: CHARGES
{1 Mo insuance Coverags If tha d%r palow 24yTe old or |ess than 2 yea's driving licence -
z :T:rj:mﬁu?:yﬂﬁaﬁ ;H::':::::Hm::lmw Bocidard puis loss ? Dﬂjf al $ I\W _BD_ DETEIE‘;'.': Q&%*UU
dummmwm:,mw Day at 5 FIEIWEBR
4 For usage 1o Malayaia st o higher ex5ess allciss of 555,000.00 and dfferen rects e ¥
: xmﬁmmlmmﬁmmmmuwmmmmum Day at 5 par month
T M roburd will be gheen for petrl lef i vehice.
B’ Haror k= kable 16 pey ol parking fes and raflic Bummonses
g vahicles o be during affice 1
10 Mo 5&'\'1:: mm Holigay ard ::rd:;w TOTAL AMOUNT WD_
M L
¥ B N AR LT
BALANCE DUE
Time Mileage Days Extension From To
2% \\ NN
\ \ mg Amount Deposit (refundable) $
i
FROM T0 \
5 VY >\ |\

iiwa have read and understood the tarme and condilions
ahowve and hereby agreed to abide

X

Hirer's Signature

Driver/Gurantor's Signaturg

DAWN ENTERPRISES




Invoiee Bhijie 2 of 3

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 0483580

iNSURANCE Phone +65 6224 0010 Fax: +G65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Oiperating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration Mo Ma0Q017735

CORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE
Cur Ref Mo GR-17-190525
Date of Request: 181202017 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Madern Automaotive Ple Lid
Blk 30224 Ubi Road 1
#01-61 & #01-58
Singapore 408717
Dear SirMadam,
Enquiry Date 181272017
Enguiry By Chin Soi Shong
TP Vehicle No GBGT3E9Y
Accident Date 16/12/2017
DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enguiry 187
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[¥] GIRO[ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

https:/singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsa s&fuseaction=dsp ... 18/12/2017
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[HIARRILES

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
GENERAL 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSURANCE Phone. +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday 1o Friday Gam 1o Spm
CERAS MANAGEMENT CENTRIE GST Registration No: MAQDD17735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-17-1905235
Dale of Request: 18122017 Your Refl No: Online Purchase

Modern Aulomotive Ple Lid
Bik 3023A Ubl Road 1

#01-61 & #01-58
Singapore 408717

Dear Si/Madam,

Enguiry Date 182/2017

Enquiry By Chin Soi Shong

TP Vehicle No GBGTIBESY

Accidem Date 16122017

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. Mo,
EIG?ESQY China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. 10/40/2017-09/10/2018 6389 6111
GBGT3IEgY China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Ltd. 11/10/2017-10/10/2018 6388 6111
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the eriginal reports farwarded to the centre by the meambéers of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/in dex.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_... 18/12/2017



