Print Received Message

This mail is associated with ;

*SJX8073S (C0483069)
[XD7648E]
™

VELLASAMY AMRATHAVALLI NEE KURUSAMY
Dec 9 2017 8:00AM
[VEOLIA ES SINGAPORE PTE LTD]
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

From AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (AXA_SG), sent on 18/03/2019 15:40 PM.

To LKK_HQ; AXA SG

cc ashersng@Ikkauto.com

Subject Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XDT848E (Ol : AXA - C0463069) and SJX80735 (TP ; LKK REF -
CC4/AXA1T024069/Dka3) on 09.12.2017

Please submit report and bill. Case passed to lawyer

| <-- Original Message -->

From: AXA_SG

To: LKK_HQ

CC: AXA_SG; ashersng@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 21/02/2019 05:19 PM

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XD7648E (OI : AXA - C0463069) and SIX80735 (TP : LKK REF -
CC4/AXAL17024069/Dka3) on 09.12.2017

Hi Asher,
TP has passed case to lawyer. please |et us have your survey report. Attached TP LOD for your easy reference

Thank you
Wancong

<-- Original Message -->
From: LKK_HQ

To: ernest.tay@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; ashersng@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 16/05/2018 12:50 PM

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving XD7648E (01 : AXA - C0463069) and SJX80735 (TP : LKK REF -
CC4/AXA17024069/Dka3) on 09.12.2017

Hi Ernest,

We refer to the above matter.

Insured reported and the GIA report uploaded in merimen.

Please advise also whether we can proceed for direct settlement for this case,
‘Thank you,

Best Regards,




Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | emall: ashersng@l|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)




Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd
lﬂ%l‘k 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Singapore 408934
Faya Ubi Industrial Park

]'aUe Tel: 6844 2475 Fax: 6844 2474
o Email: claims@teamworkgarage.com
G5T Register No: 201015366H

Fta Ltd

14" May 2018

Our reference: 1712-21-5C
Your reference: C0463069 MC/FA (XD7648E)

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd BY HAND
8 Shenton Way
#27-01 AXA Tower

Singapore 068811

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Claimant : VELLASAMY AMARTHAVALLI NEE KURUSAMY
Address  : APARTMENT BLOCK 6 EVERTON PARK #05-04 SINGAPORE 080006

We are instructed by the above named to claim damages against your insured/your
insured’s driver in connection with a road accident on 09 DEC 2017 along AYE EXIT TO

KEPPEL ROAD involving our client’s vehicle registration number SJX8073S and vehicle

registrations number XD7648E driven by you/your insured’s driver at the material time.

The accident was caused by your insured negligent driving and/or management of the
vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and our client has

been put to loss and expense, particulars of which are as follows:-

Cost of Repair - $ 19, 260.00
Loss of Rental ¢ S 3, 240.00
LTA Search Fee : $5.35
‘Total B : $ 22, 505.35

Revised 01 April 2016



A copy of each of the following supporting documents are enclosed:-

a) Our client’s Accident Report/Police Report;
b) COE/PARF Certificates;

c) Certificate Of Insurance;

d) Owner / Driver’s IC & Driving License;

e) LTA search & Reciept;

f) Letter Of Authorisation;

g) Profoma Invoice;

h) Satisfaction & Discharge Voucher;

i) Rental Agreement & Official Receipt;

The demand herein is in respect of our client’s claim for damages pertaining to their motor
vehicle and any settlement following or subsequent of this demand shall not prejudice our

client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to personal injuries.

Please send to us an acknowledgement of receipt of this letter with 14 days of your receipt
of this letter, failing which our client will have no alternative but to commence
proceedings against you without further notice to you or your insurer. Our client’s claim
is quantified based on the supporting documents in our file. Until a settlement is reached,
all negotiations are conducted on the basis that the damages quantified herein are subject
to revision if so instructed by our client.

Yours faithfully,

% PTE

f?g""s" ¢ o

(& il

'.\E \ : X
s

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd

Encl.

Revised 01 April 2016



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

To Hisr s s nonspeonmersaors s 4}{4 .................. (Third party insurance & Workshop)
Cltmant ., Velairy  dmodhavall? W furutimy
Dear Sirs,

I'rwc"ﬂjgf{??aﬁﬁf Inerthavalls lee '('{fr“fgm;l:ofwhid: Ho. SIS 073
Garase  rle b .

hereby authorize my/our repairer, ,2’5@;.;.1_._{

act as my/our agent and proceed on behalf for mejus with respect to my/our claim for repair costs and/or rental

andjor loss of use (“claim*) for my/our vehicle no. ST EOTIS that was damage pursuant
to the accident which occurred alfalong

AYE o A Leppel foao! oo  of e Joi¥

involving vehicle nos. vl JEvIE

I{We hereby irvevocably assign absolutely to you that I/we have authorized and assigned all compensation
menies  perfaining  the above mentoned accident due to mefus to myjour repairerfsolicitors

Aromr eonsh raqc ke Lt - . I{We hereby authorize you to forward and release
all compensation settlement cheques{s) due to the scttlement to myjour repairverfsolicitors
=

Vomuonte  Licr age sk skt pertaining to above said accident whom Ijwe

authorized and assigned to collect the said compensation monies,

[/We further acknowledge that any setilement the workshop may reach on myfour behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driverjowner{insurers of the other vehicle/s

concerned.

I/We acknowledge that the Discharge Voucher applies only to my/our property damage and will not affect any
of the personal injuries claim(s) involved and/or uninsured losscs claim in a later date. Further the sefilement
terms herein should not be used as an evidence to prejudice fo any personal injuries claim({s) involved andfor
other uninsured losses claim arising of the subject matter in the action.

Thank you.

Dated this of dayof e (month) 20_ 7 (year)

. . eyl

Signature of owner vehicle (claimant). OO 35 447 100 B0 .

Name of ownez of vehicle (claimant) . 005, VELASANY  AMARTHAVALLL .

f
7 !

'f._f ."I 'r"

NERIC Number {Lllixnﬂnt].‘:'-*\'l",.-'.‘-'.,H,.,.,..

Ary omandments make in thk loem wil nol be volid unies opproved ond endared by the managarmen of fhe workshop

Page 4 of &
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SATISFACTION & DISCHARGE OF VEHICLE (AFTER REPAIR)

L. j@‘jﬂﬂeﬂad é}é Hdm% owner/driver® of vehicle no. fﬁ‘:}pf Fo ?’Jf .

declare that the repairs of my/our vehicle has been completed and to my/our satisfaction and Ifwe agree that
I/We hereby irrevocable absolutely accept the settlement amount and the liability from the 3™ party on the
repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use which are final and that the sum of amount are to be release and

Teamconte bame e  LiA. Foi: siiich Tepaits’sve tn' ful

paymcnt to

discharge of myjour claim in  respect of the damages caused n  the accident at/along

AYE et b feppe! fowel! o9  Of CDec dor¥#
WG 0 649

I'We further acknowledze that any settlement the workshop may reach on my/our behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s
concerned,

I'we acknowledge thal the Discharge Voucher applics only Lo myfour property damage and will not affec!
any of the personal injuries claim(s) involved and/or uninsured losses claim in a later date. Further the
settlement terms herein should not be used as an evidence to prejudice to any personal injuries claimys)

mvolved and/or other uninsured losses clamm arising of the subject matter mn the action

Dated this A day of jé"? {month) 20 /dy [wear)
Signature of owner/ *driver (on behalf of owner vehicle) . VJ‘

ﬁjfé etk Fﬁ: Maxw

MName of owner of vehicle | *driver (on behalf of owner vehicle) . ... 2 08 2 Tl s

LA LA o N,

NRIC Numberof owner! *driver {on behalf of owner vehicle)..............

* Pleose ‘nobe 1hot by signing of thes docurmant, the diver's sgnoiure Wil epresent the gacalon sopreval-and on Behall of Ihe swasr which 5 fnal ond
mevocoble.

* any amendments maka in this form will nod be valld uriess opprovedond endorsed by e manageman| af the warkshap

Fage1ofl



TeamWork Garage Pte Ltd

I’rw)rk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-23/24 Spore 408934

Paya Ubi Industrial Park

ra g e Tel : 6844 2475  Fax : 6844 2474

Pte Ltd E-mail : claims@teamworkgarage.com
GST registered number : 201015366H

PROFOMA INVOICE - PI-1351

VELLASAMY AMARTHAVALLI NEE KURUSAMY Date : 10.5.2018

53 Paya Ubi Industrial Park Vehicle number - SJX8073S

#01-24 Make Model : CHEVROLET CRUZE

Singapore 408934 Accident date - 09-Dec-17
Reference number : 1712-21

Description Amount SGDS

Inclusive of supplying parts, labour, panel beating and spray

painting

Lump sum repair : 18500.00

7% GST : 1295.00

Grand total . 19795.00

Singdollars:

Mineteen Thousand Seven Hundred And Ninety-Five Dollars

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd



K & t Cars

53 Ubi Ave 1 #01-23 Paya Ubi Ind Park Singapore 408934

Tel: 6844 5938 Fax; 6285 5228 Email : kntcars@gmail.com
Biz Reg. No.: 53208955

No.. 2412

OFFICIAL RECEIPT e 07 FEB 2078

Received from VeL(@any Amerthavall? ree ﬁxraam..f / _/-?‘étf,q Ganant 7 ;’ﬂ

The Sum of Dollars 7;2:, Fowondd Hoo Honcdooed P Vdffﬁ:ﬂin;;f
foutte)

Being payment of L7042 727 /c"'/u Ao o/ o/

K & t Cars

$ 2v0/2”

g A

~hegue No.:

Authorised Signature



K &: 1]: Carg VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT NO.:KT-03210

53 Ubi A"f’f—'s;; g;ji raye ;fi” indPark | veh.Mo: <o £330 ReplaceVeh.No.: /7 7o 72 ¢
Te;:g:f :jii : :‘g}; rﬁiﬁﬁcgizﬂ Veh. M/ M: T'JL?:)'*CU \sls Replace Veh. M /M: /., [ £ (reze
Biz Reg. No.: 53208965% )
HIRER'S PARTICULAR |:| sAME A5 HIRER  DRIVER'S PARTICULAR
Name: \pilgnamy Amarfbavall’ Hee Fury LimyName: Tz aaneagh Fr/a VMWMW
Address: . | Address: {?f fo E:Ié 4 é Lrg:a,,é 7 //E, e
dor-of  [ruyjapae ©8ooo0k
we: £rrariy?o. D.0.B: VC: £44 f.,!‘f".}_r{;gz. D.OB: /) Dre /734
Contact: G J[ |41 Pass Date: o Contact: J7r/ W22¢ |PassDate: 3 & 7Zp Jewd
A - ACCIDENT Hirer's acceptance
-~ " C - CRACKED
N ;[“‘l [\ II N S | ”Em D - DENTS Driver's acceptance
S - SCRATCHES
RENTAL DETAILS

Mileage Out REMARKS Mileage In REMARKS

Date Out ek o 12 Date In 0 Jan rorf
Time Out 92 Time In {175 o

ASSIGNED BY CHECKED BY

RENTAL CHARGES PETROL / DIESEL LEVEL
| paily |@$| /& |_¢d payse|s 2rvo | our E % v % F
Weekly | @$ __ Wkse@s  / | —
Monthly @ $ Mth @ 5 IN E Ya Va Y F
- Hfl‘"' }@5 - __ Hrs @5 | | -
"Inclusive of additional charges (if any} Petral Charges YES NO |AMT:
Amtgpie 19 32%9 eow YES | NO |AMT:
Fnyment:- OCASH ONETS OCHQ O VISA [0 MAST | Security Deposit YES NO AMT:
Bank / Cheque No.: Advance Payment YES NO AMT:

I/We have read and agree to the terms and conditions stated on this page and overleal 'We am/are also aware that should there be any parking and/or traffic offence committed

during the leasing period when the vehicle is in my/our possession, we will be billed accordingly, Subsequently, our personal detalls may be tender accordingly to the government

parking andfor traffic offence department, With us undersigning below, 1'We am/are sure that all information |/We have given to K & t CARS in connection with this agreement are trug

and dccurate,

IMPORTANT INFORMATION (Te be go through by the personnel of K & t CARS to the hirer and/or driver upon leasing of vehicle)

% Only persons above 26 and below 60 years of age with 2 years driving experience, authorised, licensed and signing this agreement may drive the vehicle,

& Wehicke is strictly for Singapore use only and may not be driven out of Singapore withouwt prior consent of the company K &t CARS,

% Use of the vehicle lllzgal purpose such as in connection with theft, drug peddling or trafficking, smugaling is strictly prohibited.

% Additional drivers are required 1o register with us before they are allowed to drive the vehicle, Othenwise, he/she will not be protected by the insurance cover,

< The hirer shall be Rable for excess charges for any late return of the rate shown per hour or on a per day basis.

% In case of any accident, the hirer MUST report to K & t CARS Immediately regardless of the seriousness of the impact cccurred. If there are bodily injuries, a police report MUST be
made within the next 24 hours,

@ in view of all accident, the hiter will bear the full responsibility for the SGD53,500- excess payable to K & 1 CARS and also the first SG053,500/- excess for damaged to the third party
wehicle.

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT
= e —"]" ~
I.'"I }"{i.--""
X
Signature of hirer / driver (company stamp if any) For and on behalf of K & t CARS (authorised signature only)




12112017

inl T |'..t-'-.‘..n."r%-m: hariti

Land Transport Autharity
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Receipt No, : ITNET-00000-171211-001362
Previous Receipt Mo :

S/N  Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.

Result of Insurance Enguiry - XD7648E

As at 08 Dec 201 7/08:30:00

Insurance Co: AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

1 Insurance Enquiry - XDT648E
Enquiry Fee
20171211145820902061

Receaipt

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Print Date/Time : 11 Dec 2017 [ 14:58:57
Receipt Date/Time : 11 Dec 2017 /14:58:57

Amount GST Amount
Before Amount After GST
GST (55) (5%) (53)
5.00 0.35 535
Sub-Total 500 0.35 2.35
Total Before Rounding 5.00 0.35 5.35
Rounding Difference 0.00
Total Amount Payable h.ah

Paid By

Direct Debit. aMETS
2017121114 7

girie Rasvbd Debil {Internet Banking) S8
Total 5.35
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 5.35
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider | financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee may

apply.

https:fivrl lta.gov. sgitafvrliacticnicompletePayment?FUNCTION _ID=F1301001TT

M



121172017 Wehicle Insurance Particulars Enguiry

Vehicle Insurance Particulars Result

Vehicle No. Incident Date/Time Insurance Company Name

XD7648E 0% Dec 2017 /08:30:00 AXA INSURANCE PTELTD

Print OK Save as PDF

https:itvrl ta.gov sgltatvrl/actoninsEnquiryPaymentAck PFUNCTION |ID=FOT0S006ET &biz TrnNum=TNET-00000-171211-001362

"



