Richmond Ho

A L ]
From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 16 January, 2018 2:01 PM
To: Richmond Ho
Cc: Natalie Lee; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement For SLJ9420S & SHC2044A

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Richmond,
Further to the below matter.

Please be informed that the liability is clear as per BOLA settlement guideline and shall proceed with direct
settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle,

The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.
And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our SUrveyor.
Kindly arrange to survey of your client’s vehicle asap.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: ...« IR 2| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Natalie Lee [maiito:natalie@iii.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 16 Jlanuary 2018 1:59 PM

To: 'Richmond Ho' <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>

Cc: Jas Khine {LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement For SU9420S & SHC2044A

Dear Richmond,
Yes, kindly liaise with LKK for direct settlement.

Best Regards,

Natalie Lee

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street #05-01 {OB Building
Tel: 6347 6100 | Fax: 6224 4174
S&P ‘A-’ (stable) rated Company



From: Richmend Ho [ . .. - il 3 )
Sent: Tuesday, 16 January, 2018 1 08 PM

To: Natalie Lee
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement For SL39420S & SHC2044A

Importance: High
Hi Natalie,

Can we settle direct for this case

Richmond Ho

: V = Wearnes Automolive Pte Ltd
AVIE NEIRNTL S www . wearnesauto.com richmond.hc@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is corifidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thark you



From: Motor Claim - III [ 2 <o =i oo
Sent: Monday, 18 December, 2017 9:13 AM
To: Richmond Ho

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement For SL.19420S & SHC2044A

o LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
¢ Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee
Motor Claims Dept.

64 Cecil Street | #05 108 Building | Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext - 248

From: Richmond Ho [ . L, ]
Sent: 18 December, 2017 8:53 A

To: Motor Claim - Hll < - i

Subject: Direct Settlement For SLIS420S & SHC2044A
Importance: High

Hi,

Please refer to above attachment and check if possible for direct settlement.

Richmond Ho

- V Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
AVE NN S www wearnesauto.com richmond. ho@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidenfial and may aiso be privileged.
If you have received it in error, piease notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment l¢ any other person. Thark you.



/2812018 Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*$1.494208 (MCT17110990)
[SHC2044A]
TP
LEE XIUWEI. ADELE
Nov 28 2017 5:00PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (III_SG), sent on 28/09/2018 10:00 AM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$3057.70) - SLJ9420S - Claim Handler: NATALIE LEE

Approved:3057.70.

htlps:Nsingapore.merlmen.comfc\aimsf\ndex.cfm?fusebox:SVCma|I&fuseac1|on=d5p_Print&C FID=41371753&8CFTOKEN=e70a09ch927801d0-280EE... /1



9/27/2018 Merimen e-Claims

Ciaim Audit

=" AUDIT TRAIL

19 Dec 2017 LAd Hiew
1 17:28 Clm Veh Model Changed (204220) vOLVO V40 1.5 T2 (A} May
’ Fung
19 Dec 2017 Reg No: SL194205. Acct Date: 2017/11/28. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: India Internationa [A] Hiew
2 17:28 Clm Created | Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ). Work  May
’ shop: Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd (Alexandra Road) Fung
[A] Hiew
D . .
3 1?_2? 2017 pdj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): May
' Fung
[A] Hiew
4 i?_ggc 2017 adj Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2017/12/29 May
’ Fung
A] Hiew
7 [
5 }23? 201 Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp: Ad) decides. May
’ Fung
Al Hiew
19 17 ) . !
6 17-l§§c z0 Label Added {30651):Vehicle Not 1n,(30653):Direct Settlement. May
¢ Fung
[A] Hiew
7 13_2;‘ 2017 adj Adjuster Assigned  [None) -> MOHD TAUFIKH May
' Fung
; . . ’ - [A] Hiew
g 21‘Dec 2017 Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> COMFORT TRANSPORTATICN PTE LTD. Claimaint’s ID: -> 199303 May
11:56 B21R.
Fung
[A]
Jasmine
- .Req:0.00: ! o i ND ..BOLA 2 .
9 ZB'Dec 2017 Adj Mandate Request Cur,Req:0.00:LIABILITY: 100% REMARK : Ol REAR E ED TC VEHCILE..BO 7 APPL Khine
12:08 1IES
Phoo
Wai
(1]
10 fg.ggc 2017 Adj Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2017/12/29 NATALIE
i LEE
(1
11 29 02017 pgj Mandate Set Approved:0.00. WATEGIE
’ LEE
. _ e 1]
M : : ! -5 L
12 22. ar 2018 CIm Cancelled Ca_ﬂcelled As reguested by Jas. TP repairer did not arrange for survey of their client's v NATALLE
15:03 ehicle.
LEE
Ij
M [
13 %g_sgr 2018 Clm Cancelled Reopened As requested by Mei Kwan from LKK. ANDREW
: LIM
A] HOW
Mar 26 [
14 fg_;r 18 | abel Removed (30651): Vehicle Not In. MEI
‘ KWAN
[A] HOW
15 igh;?r 2018 Adj Adjuster Assigned MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID -> MCHD RASUL MEI
. KWAN
[A] HOW
16 fg’;;r 2018 A dj Rpt Initiated ME]
: KWAN
(A] HOW
17 fg”;;" 2018 im Detalls Notified MEI
: KWAN
27 Sep 2018 Cur.Req:3057.70:PODS Liability: 100% Quantum: a} COR(w/gst): $2,877.70 + bjLOU [A]
18 17:58 Adj Mandate Request {$60.00 x 3 days): $180.00= Total: $3,057.70 Vehicle Model: YOLVO V40 -1498 cc For Chong
' your approval Poh Kin
Date From A 3 ﬂ Date To LB 2] b Audit Type None ¥ Go |
ACTIVITY

[22/01/2018 10:01] HOW MEI KWAN:
PENDING FOR SURVEY

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

LKK Auto LKK Auto
1760986 28/1053_/5220]8 Motor Consultants Pte  Consultants Pte 51194205 10.70
B Ltd Ltd (HQ)

hilps://singapore merimen comiclaimsfindex.cim?usebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=66771 8&extid=259800&CFID=4131058 ... 1/2
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WEARNES

Our Reterence: SLJ94208/7013571 By Email / Mail
Your Reterence: SHC2044A

24 May 2018

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD C/0 LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS
Attn: Third Party Claim Department -

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLJ9420S & SHC2044A ON 28/11/2017

Dear Otficer.

We wish to inform vou that the repairs to our client vehicle have been completed.

We hereby submit the claims as follows:

| Details " Remarks \W.Dr

| Cost of Repairs _ | \  2877.70
Loss OF Use ' 60.00x 3 days | 180.00 |

- Others - | _ |
TOTAL | 3.057.70 i

Kindly let us have vour offer to Christing.y ow ¢ wearnes.com

Your soonest reply 15 much appreciated. Thank you.

Yours farithiully

Christihe Yow

D (63) 6430 4899

Wearnes Automotive Pte Lid
Bodyshop and Pait Division
249 Alexandra Road
Singapore 139933

This is a computer generated printout. no signature is required.

Wearnes Automeotive Pte. Lid.

i B G



o

AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

l L ?e )('u M‘ J Mﬂ‘e -7 ("the third party Claimant®)
o_Lpt Bk 5t Tampines Aue | # /007> SEA T Madsress),
owner of L0 ﬁl/ S0S ~ {vehicle no.)

hereby authorize Wearnes Automotive Pte Lid - {“The workshop”)

to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and / or rental and / or loss of use
(“¢laim”) for my Vehicle No. S ZJ &74)0 5 that was damaged
pursuant to the accident which occurrad on ») 5)’ / /! __/ L0 /F ~ (date) along
Jgfdc‘k Nﬂf’ﬂl A\/e 3. (tocation)
Involving Vehice Nofs __ > 1 (" 26 HUA - {*The accident”).

| further authorize the workshop to sign the discharge voucher on my behalf to settle my above
mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment further to settiement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the
workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settiement the workshop may reach on my behaif is on a without
prejudice and without admission of ability basis insofar as the driver / owner / insurers of the ather
vehicle/s is concerited.

Date this 2 day of M\l:tx)\ (month) 20 IS .

\Y

Signed by “the third party daimant” Signed by “the Wprkshop®
Policyholder's Signature only '
& Company Chop - (if registered undér & company)




. “. DA INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD
’ L ] INTERN ATIONAL G0 Reg No V4BT08792K ) GST Reg. No, M2 (GO78806-%
3 . b} el Street | #04 | 805 | son.02 1108 Building | Singapore 04971 |
( INSURANCE Gitfire (85} A347H100 Emint  insurehiin com sg

RN LA R LR 3 Fax  (05) 62244174 Website wwwiil.com,sg

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

DISCHARGE VOUCHER
lll-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: TP/MCT17110890 .-
Claimant Ref : 51 j942057013571 - -

-

We/l, _Weames Automolive Pte Ltd (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/! have reached an agreement

with the appointed Surveyor of India International Insurance Ple Lt LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd {name
of Surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S§_2.877.70 - {repair cost), S§__ 180.00 - (loss of
use/renial, 5§ - (search fee), vehicle no. SLJ 94205 that was damaged pursuant to the accident which ogcurred
on_ 28112017 % (date) at _ Bedok North Avenue 3 - {location} involving vehicle no. SHC 2044A(insured

vehicle). This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on  27/03/2018 ~ {date) at “the workshop”,

Well confirm that we/! arefam authorized by the owner  Lee Xiuwei, Adele - ("the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SLJ 54208 to make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle
the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. Well enclose herein the letter of authority given by "the third

party claimant",

Well further confirm that we/l will indemnify India International Insurance Pte Lid for all damages, loss andior expense that
they will or have aiready incurred in the event that “the third party claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a
further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining 10 cost of repairs andfor rental and/or loss
of use pursuant to the damage to SLJ 94208 (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

Well confirm that the agreement reached above is in fult and final settlement of all claims of “the third party ciaimant*
pursuant to the accident and that further this settiement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability

basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any
dispute arising out ofthe same.

-

Wefl authorize youto pay thetotal amount of S$_3,057.70 _to  Weames Automotive Pte Ltd -

Dated this a[ day of 2018 7
CLAIMANT: WITNESS: ,
r/} 'l Sl
Signature: d ) Signature: r LE
Signed by "the workshop” (with chop) ©T Signed by appointed Surveyor

Name: WELLALS O\k‘w@w\ﬁlﬂ\]@ ?l(@\-“{ l Name:

NRIC: 9950 IHOOR. NRIC: IS L
Adress: NABexcndim Read e BTN

< faapefe N pug- L e
Nationality: W Natlonafity: Tel: 6

Sodyshop and Paint Division

Oceupation: ut-Aaxandra-Road Occupation:

Singapore 159835




WELECARNES
LK

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Lid.

45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 1 +65 65430 4700 www.wearnesauto. com

Loreg no 199501400R /7 GST reg no M28970878X




Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Cirect Settlement

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Notihied Bar hunmutted sdd] Assgned Ady kot Ad) Suiim e [ns Auth's: Stats

’ 19 Dec 2017 ' Pending for Survey
20 Dec 2017 00:00 $%2,689.44 5%2,689.44 Report

Main
Edit Reg Edit Adj Rpt Edit Eshimates I View Rpt l Cancel Case
[ Main 11, Reference U Claim Details U Documents 1 Show All I

~E ¢ R H 5 PR g . S TEal e £ o e s Der

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS .[Created by adjuster]

Insured COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co. Reg No.: 199303821R
Main LEE XIUWEL. ADELE, ID: $8610126B
Claimant:
Vehicle Reg. . 28/11/2017 17:00 - :58
No.: _SU94205 Rale of Lossy {10 Months and 28 Days from LTA Reg Date (Man Yr}]
Clam Type: TP / MCT17110990 Policy/LOVET e om0015
Note No.:
Vehicle Reg. Policy No
No. SHC2044A ,y : D16MTPY01013294 '“
; (Claimant):
{Insured}. .
. Excess:
" Repawer:  Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd (Alexandra Road) 249 Alexandra Road, 159935 Alexandra - Tel: 63783370
oade India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63376100 ... [Handled oy Pooi Chin Han Daniel]
IC[:ZLH::rr?t & Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 5461 6355 :
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tek: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by MOHD RASUL] ... [Final Rpt due 29/12/2017)
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All I Compose Case Mail ‘

. 1I1_SG (28/09/2018); Alert - Adj Mandate Approved ($$3057.70) - SL)9420S - Claim Handler: NATALIE LEE
o 111 5G(29/12/2017): Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (5$0.00) - SL19420S - Claim Handler: NATALIE LEE

ALL ASSOCTIATED TASKS™ View All Search Tasks j Create New Task j Complete
Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Dane?
No results,

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm’fuscbox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp_... 8/10/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2

Claim Documents

*5139420S5 (MCT17110990)
[SHC2044A]
TP

LEE XIUWEI. ADELE
Nov 28 2017 5:C0PM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

Upload Documents } Lploag Photos Compose New Letter i View Viewin Bmwser:ﬂ
Photos/Images 3 per page ~ ¥
Mo Relabel/Reorder LKK Auto Consuitants Pte Ltd (HQ) VThumbnaiI: Print.
1 27/09/18 17150 " Odometer Reading €% cad PG i
2 27/09/18 17:50 Chassis Number €%  cacpc M

27/09/18 17:50 General View € cac rG 2
4 27/09/18 17:50 General View £ Load JPG
5 27/09/18 17:50 General View & e W
6  27/09/18 17:50  General View €& cadrc M
7 27/09/18 17:50 General View €% Lloadirc W
8 27/09/18 17:50 General View £ adrc o
9 2709718 17:50 General View € g M
10 27/09/18 17:50 General View ﬂ " Load IPG ' [+
11 27/09/18 17:50 General View €% (lcadirc W
12 27/69/18 17:50 General View £y (lcadrc
13 27/89/18 17:50 General View @ ‘ Load PG . %]
14 .27'./0‘)/18 17:50 General View 4 ] " Load PG ] ‘
15 27/09/18 17:50 General View 4] " Load 1PG M
16 27/09/18 17:50 General View ' €% cacrc W
17 27/09/18B 17:50 ‘General View . ﬂ 7 Lead JPG . o}
18 27/09/18 17:51 Reinspection Photo 6 g o
19 27/09/18 17:51 Reinspection Photo €6 Load PG v
20 27/09/18 17:51 Reinspection Photo € Load 6G A
21 27/09/18 17:51 Reinspection Photo G - Lecad JPG z
22 27/09/18 17:51 lReinspection Photo 0 lcadirc ¥
23 27/09/18 1/:51 Reinspection Photo 4 ] ' Load 1PG ' vl
24 27/09/18 17:51 Reinspection Photo ) 0 " Load PG ] 4
25 27/09/18 17:51 Reinspection Photo 0 Load 1PG .;ﬂ
26 27/09/18 17:5% Reinspection Photo ' (1] Load PG ]
Documentation ) 1 per page .lJ ]
Nu  Relabel/Reorder LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) o ) . y } . VIThumbnail:P_ri_ng_‘
1 19/12/17 17:29 ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO III BD 18.12,2017 €  oeornF
2 19/12/17 17:29 TP GIA REPORT €Y lcedPDF
3 05/04/1801:03 TP ESTIMATE - MARKED ©  Lcarpr
4 27/09/1B 10:58 WORKSHOP INVOICE ) €% LloagrDF
5 08/10/18 09:16 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM - € loagPor
6  08/10/1B05:16 DISCHARGE VOUCHER D Lcadeor
7 08/10/1809:16  LOD €  loacroF
N Finalieed On India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) _Thumbnail Print
1 20/12/17 N8:53 Singapore Accident Statement ﬂ Load POF

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc...  8/10/2018



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of' 2

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST zeset | save | bror |

There are no document checklists configured.

Qur Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)
i

| Show Remarks To: C Handling lnsurer
| notes Remarks are private Lnless you <now L 1o othe” partes

https://singapore.merimen.conyclaims/index.ctfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction—dsp _doc... &/10/2018



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

L KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd o regno 19s60718R;

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com:assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/IIN7024058/R1FA3Q2

Date: (8/10/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: India International Insurance Pte Ltd Policy No: MCOMOO15
ﬁ:’[mant Vehicle o sumpe Insured Vehicle No :  SHC2044A
Date of Loss. 28M11/2017 Nature of Claim; TP - Claim No: MCT17110990
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLJ9420S5
Make & Model: VOLVO V40, 1.6 T2 (A) Engine No: B4154T51853844
Reg. Date: 30/12/2016 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No. YVIMV28HOH2404345
Colour: White Odometer: 26141 km
Engine Capacity: 1498 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION QF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabie) Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/40Z R18 Rear Tyre Size: 225/40Z R18
Front Left Side. Michelin 6 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin B mm
Front Right Side; Michelin 6 mm Rear Right Side Micheiin 6 mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre treads depih
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 3.877.40 739.44 3,137.96 80.93
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,050.00 1,850.00 1,100.00 36.07
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 6,927.40 2,689.44 - 4,237.96 61.18
+ GST 7.00/7.00% {S$%} 484.92 . 188.26 296.66 61.18
Nett Amount (S§) 7.412.32 2,877.70 4,534.62 61.18
+ Loss of Use (3.0 x $$60.00/day) (S8) 180.00 .
Nett Liability (S$} 3,057.70_
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 1971212017
Date Inspected: 27/03/2018 Inspected At: Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd (Alexandra
Road) .-
249 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159935
Estimated Peried of Repair: 3 0 days

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fuscbox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 8/10/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: Chong Poh Kin

NOTE. This report represents our findings at the time and place of mspection stated herein Such inspection has heen carned out 1o the best of our
knowledge and ability but any other hability under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.ctm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuscaction=gen_... 8/10/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-S5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 26 Sep 2018)

Parts: 144 VOLVO V40 1.5 T2 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmifted. no print-code for SLJ94205)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *BUMPER COVER REAR V4 Repair 1,428 70FS -FS5
2 1 *BUMPER SPOILER REAR Deformed 630.70FS *567.63FS
3 1 *BUMPER BRACKET LHR V Serviceable 88.70FS *-FS
4 1 *“BUMPER BRACKET RHR V Serviceable 88.70FS *-F8
5 1 *TOW COVER REAR V40 1 Cut 73.90FS *66.51FS
6 1 *BUMPER RAIL (BEAM) R Serviceable 1,.336.30FS *FS
7 1 *BUMPER INSTALLING MT Serviceable 8340FS *-FS
8 10 *BLIND RIVET 4.0"21MM Serviceable 30.00FS *FS
g 10 *BUMPER CLIP Necessary 43 00FS *43.20F3
10 10 *PLASTIC RIVET P/W RA Necessary 69.00FS "62.10FS

F=Franchise part S=SpcNetl
Total Parts {S$) 3,877.40 739.44

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuscaction=gen_... 8/10/2018



Adjuster Report

Racommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour Items
1 TO REPLACE REAR BUMPER,REAR LOWER SPOILER ,REAR New 1.600.00 800.00
SKID PLATE [ETC
TO PUTTY SPRAY PAINT ON REAR BUMPER ,ETC New 1,000.00 700.00
TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE RESETTING OF ALL New 450 00 450.00
ELECTRICAL MODULES
Gross Labour Cost (S%) 3,050.00 1,950.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?tusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 8/10/2018



