H_siau Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 24 January 2018 4:41 PM

To: Eileen, May Hwee Yap'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING S5LG 9510G(AIG) & SLM 9739H ON 11/11,/2017

Your Ref: SLG $510G
Our Ref: CC&/LCR17024056/Upb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLG 9510G(AIG) & SLM 9739H ON 11/11/2017

We refer fo the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resalve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

We have received a claim from SLM 2739H against your insurance policy.

Bosed on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us.
We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Flease call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

TO: PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTELTD

FROM: OWNER OF VEHICLE NUMBER SLMATAAH

ACCIDENT INVOLVING L5106

ALONG/AT QUEE NSWAY ow H!n“:}

We hereby authorize you to act on our behalf in pursuance of our claim for all damages during
the repair arising out of the above accident.

This letter serve as the '"AUTHORITY TO ACT'.

We also hereby authorize all agreed settlement payment be made in favour to PEGASUS
ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD.

Name : Grab Rentals 2 Pte Ltd

Co Reg Mo ' 2016172006

Address : 28 Sin Ming Lane #07-71 Midview City Singapore 573969
Contact : 6655 0005

Date Ll

Signature \

Owner



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

TO: PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

FROM: HIRER OF VEHICLE NUMBER _ SLM T 739H

ACCIDENT INVOLVING ___ SL4 75106
U’ {

I hereby authorize you to act on my behalf in pursuance of my claim for loss of earnings during
the repair arising out of the above accident.

This letter serve as the '"AUTHORITY TO ACT'.

We also hereby authorize all agreed settlement payment be made in favour to PEGASUS
ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD.

Racali Bin podut Rauwb

Mame

NRIC : SMEodte D -
Address : Block 934 TEMEfJ-':fm Sheef 4] #Hor-3.-) £ (£20924) .
Contact 9815 338

Date ,- 13 [11] son

Signature

Y/’

r

Hirer



RELEASE VOUCHER
AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim

“We/l. PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm
that we/l have reached an agreement with the appointed survevor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple
[1d LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amoun
claimed for $84,100.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no. SLM 9739H that was damaged pursuant to
the accident which occurred on 11/11/2017 (date) along QUEENSWAY involving vehicle no/s
SLG 95106

T'his is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 19/12/2017 (date} at “'the workshop™,

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD (“the third
party claimant”) of vehicle no. SLM 97391 make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and
we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his’her behalf in a manner that we/l deem hit, We/l
enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™.

Weil further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages.
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the thied party
claimant™ alter the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former lor any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SLM 9739H (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l conlirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject 1o the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courls have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this fﬂ (day) of ’j"t"[:"lf {month) Illi[ year)
I

.'/.‘ -
e -
8 0. /
Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)
AT fy 4o wehiche
*Tha contents o his documenl apply R
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"% 7 PEGASUS

ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD

GST/ ROC COMPANY NO : 201101753C

Tax Invoice
From : : Customer :
PECASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD GRARB RENTALS PTELTD B
Ci0 51 DEFU LAME 10 18 SIN MING LANE
SINGAPORE 538216 #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
3 EINGAFORE 573960
Officer in Charge : WEE TZE FAH
Tol; Attn ;
Email : Tel:
Fax:
Inv No : IV17/12-1225 Inv Date : 20/12/2017 | Torm : 30 DAYS
Vehicle No @ SLMO739H Chassis No : MHFB29F3402009110 )
“todel : VIOS
| Remarks : TP INSURER; AIG, INSURED'S VEHICLE NO: SLGS510G, DATE OF ACCIDENT: 11.11.2017
[ iTEm | DESCRIPTION QTY | UNITPRICE | AMOUNT (SGD)|
1 TO LUMP SUM REPAIR AS RECOMMENDELD BY SURVEYOR 1 3,300,0000 3,300.00
Cheques should be made payable to PEGASUS ENGINEERING & TRADING PTE LTD Sub Total 3,300.00
GST(7.00%) 231,00
Total (SGD) 3,531.00

Authcriscd Signature



111132017 VAL Application
Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. SLG?510G As At 11
Nov 2017/ 23:05:00)
Law Firm Search Details -
Search Reason: Insurance claim in relation to traffic accident
Law Firm Case No:: SLMS739H
Current Owner Details B
Owner 1D Type: Company
Owner 1D: 201624597K
Owner Name: LCRF PFTELTD
Registered Address Type: ‘P::vmaptg:ssidenﬁai (Condo Apt or House) / Shopping / Office
'L }Pz?:istered Block/l House 60
Registered Street Name: ~ ANSON ROAD
Registered Unit No.: #11-01
Registered Building Name: MAPLETREE ANSON
Repistered Postal Code: 079914
Current Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: S5LG9510G
Make Description/Model: HONDA /GRACE 1.5 HYBRID DX CVT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD
Insurance Company Name: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
o Print QK
i

https:ivel. Ha.gov.sglitatwrlactionfawFirmDetail PFUNCTION_ID=F180107T1ET

11



| Rentals
Our Bef: GR-ACC-20497-02
01 Jun= 2017
Pagasus Enginearing & Trading Pte Ltd Mailing Address
Mo, 5 Defu Lane 10 18 Sin Ming Lang,
Singzpore 539216 #01-08 Midview City,

Singapore 573850
Co. Mo, 2018172003
Tewhom it may concern,
Re: Vehiciz Rental Rates for Loss of Rental Claims.

With regards tothe above subject matter, we are pleased o inform you our Grab Rentzl raie
far our various vehicles which are as follows:

SINo. | Make & Mode] ) Daily Rental Rates {S$)
o1 Toyota Prius 1,798ce, 90kw, 120bhp, Automatic 579.85
02 Mazda 3 1.5 (A) Sedan 56695
03 | Nissan Qashaal 1.2L R 7
04 | Honda Vezél 1.50 §77.85
05 | Honda Vezel 1.5L Hybrid { $84.95
06 . | Toyota Vios 1.5L f §66.95 ]

Please note that the above stated raie is our daily rental rate to our drivers, For your necessary
attions on third parly accident clalms on loss of rental.
/
Yours fa@i:]j@,-ﬁy,.
oo
I
b
L]
o ohf
fay Chee Wee
Grab R;snta! Pta ltd -
i

/
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