Hsiao Tuna (LKKAuto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com=>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 January 2018 3:12 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: YOUR REF: SJG6379M OUR REF: C0463110MC/KM ***LKK
REF:CC4/AXA17024020/Apb3

Attachments: CCF01172018.pdf; 5AS2325398 5JG6379M pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong

Enclosed is our GIA |, invoice , LOA .
As request following :

1. RC 55800 ( AS AGREED)
2. LOU $900 ( 5100 - our client's car is under limo x 9 days - 7 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS +
1 day weekend )

@ 100% ( as agreed with AXA )
Total 56700

Please let us have your settlement & offer soon . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
LC AUTOMOTIVE
HP: 92712214

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com=
Sent: Tuesday, December 19, 2017 7:15 PM

To: chan pick yuen

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Zaini (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: 5JG6379M OUR REF: CO463110MC/KM ***LKK REF:CC4/AXA17024020/Aphb3

Dear Chris,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong at 6742 3197,
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin
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LEONG MEI TENG
244 LORONG CHUAN
#06-06

SINGAPORE 556745

Dear Sir/ Mdm

OURREF  : CC4/AXA17024020/Apb3

YOUR REF  : P1990210 (SLL 2788S)

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL 2788S & SJG 6379M ALONG/AT SLIP ROAD FROM ONE
NORTH CRESCENT TO STAR AVE ON 14/12/2017

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed
by your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from LC Automotive. acting on behalf of the owner of SIG 6379M against
your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the opinion that liability is not in our
favour. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim
against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the
rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek
to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please
reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to us
and acknowledged by us.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to
chewht@lkkauto.com within 10 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting

centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

s Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status
(if any)

o Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

s Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

e Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

e Video footage of accident (if any)

¢ Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you
are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim



To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of
the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without
AXA'’s prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because
of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s). AXA shall keep you
informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If vou need any clarification. please do not hesitate to contact us at 6742 3197 or email us at
chewht@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist vou more effectively.

Yours sincerely

Chasiy

Chew Hsiao Tong

Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX; 6741 4108

EMAIL: chewht@lkkauto.com

(16 AXA Inswrance Pre Lid
fMotor Claims Depi)
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.C AUTOMOTIVE

BLOCK 25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 #05-26 SYNERGY @ KB Singapore 417800
Fel : ( 63) 696645206 HIP: 92712214 Fax: (65) 69664526

F.mail :chris_chanbehe@hotmail.com

INVOICE

RD LIMO PTE LTD
25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
#05-26 SYNERGY @KB
Singapore 417800

Accident date: 14" DECEMBER 2017
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SJG6379M TOYOTA AXIO

Date: 17" JANUARY 18

Descriptions AMOUNT
jLump Sum repair cost as recommended by $5,800.00
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor ;: Mr Adrian Ling

= Totaj __$5800.00

S/IDLRS: FIVE THOUSAND ONLY




