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HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit

Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896

ESTIMATE
DAWN ENTERPRISE ( Date :19.01.2018
21 SELETAR WEST FARMWAY 1 : Vehicle no SLD 1973 Y
5798125 Make/Model ‘TOYOTA WISH
Accident date :18.12.2017
No Description Qty Amount (55)
List Items
1 Rear bumper 1 5 541.1 |
2 Rear bumper side holder @ $98.90 * 2 5 1978 ¢
3 Rear RH fender 1 5 1002.5
4 Rear RH fender quarter glass rubber ~ 1 S 496.2
5 Rear RH door r 1 S 1533.5°
$ 37711
Less 25% Disc S 94277
Total 5 2828133
Special Nett Items
1 Rear RH sport rim v 1 S 8o@
2 Rear RH tyre 1 S 280 »
Total S 1080
Labour Cost
1 Remove ,replace & repair consistent to the accident T 5 990=
2 Respray painting 5 hEr
3 Remove & reinstall rear RH quarter glass S 800 x
Total 5 1850
Grand Total 5

5758.33
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HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

AUTOBAY @ KAKIBUKIT
1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C #01-34/#01-61, Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 Fax: 6743 4896 H/P: 9666 9680
Feg. No. 2S48TROOM

P
Your Ral ¢
Our Ret Date. Y5 05 - w14

Attn: Motor Claims Dept

ACCIDENT ON 18.12.2017 INVOLVING VEHICLE 5LD 1973 Y & SLL 2497 G ALONG

MALAYSIA CHECKPOINT

With regards to the above, we are writing on behalf of the registered owner of vehicle SLD 1973 ¥
which was involved in the above mentioned accident.

We are informed that the above accident was caused solely by the negligence of your insured
vehicle S5LL 2497 G, As a result of the accldent, our client's vehicle was damaged and our client
had instructed us to submit his claims for loss and expenses, particulars of which are follows:

1) Repair Cost 5 800.00
2) Loss of use-5150 ¥ 03days s 450.00
3) LTA serach 5 5.35

Total 5 1,255.35

We hereby enclosed herewith the following documents for your consideration of the above claim.

a) Final Repair Bill Of SLD 1973 ¥ c) LTA SEARCH
b) GIA report d) Owner / Driver NRIC & Driving License
CN E{; @ A A&
T M Y PAINTING WORKSHOP
SUTOBAYERAK BUKIT

WL ial AVE L #01-34 SINGAPORE 417883
Yours faithfBl, 1 o7 B0 o, 6748 5519 FAX: 6743 48906

HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP



Hsiao TnnE {LI{I{Autu!

From: Hua Meng <huameng@|ive.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 25 March 2079 2:10 PM

To: Hsiao Tong [LKKAutD)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 18/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLD 1973Y AND SLL 2497G

JILKK REF: CCB/AIG17024007 /Apa3

Dear HsiaoTong
Please let us have your DV asap.
Thanks & Regards

June
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, March 15, 2019 8:09 AM

To: Hua Meng

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 18/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES 5LD 1973Y AND SLL 2497G //LKK REF:
CCB/AIG17024007/Apa3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm

We refer to the above matter.

We ore of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no concrete evidence(ie: Video

tootage) ye! to support either party's version. Enclosed herewith in this emall is o copy of our insured's
occident report for your perusal,
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For an amicable setflement, we are prepared to offer at a global sum of $500.00(all-in).

Please conlirm acceplance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving

the matter amicably without partles resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms fsettiement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsegquently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the lssues
of liabliity/damagaes, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email; chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-3108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Indusdrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 2:47 PM



To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 18/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLD 1973Y AND SLL 24976

URGENT

Dear HsiaoTong

We refer our tele-conversation last week, please revert urgently.
Thanks & Regards

lune
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop

From: Hua Meng <huam >

Sent: Friday, October 13, 2018 4:29 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 18/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLD 1973Y AND SLL 2497G

Dear ThinThin
We have sent you numeorous email for offer revert but till-to-date we have no heard from you.
We will pass to lawyer to settle.

Thanks & Regards
June
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workashop

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, October 4, 2018 2:25:16 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 18/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLD 1973Y AND SLL 2497G

URGENT
Dear ThinThin
Please revert us your offer soonest.

Thanks & Regards
June
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, October 1, 2018 4:29:10 PM

To: Thin Thin [LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 18/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLD 1973Y AND SLL 2497G

Dear ThinThin
Kindly revert your offer urgently.

Thanks & Regards



June

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, September 28, 2018 4:46:35 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT ON 18/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES SLD 1973Y AND SLL 2497G

Dear ThinThin

We do not have evidence.

Photo is taken after accident.

Kindly let us have your revert urgently.

Thanks & Regards
June

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, January 11, 2018 11:47:08 AM

To: Hua Meng

Subject: ACCIDENT ON 18/12/2017 INVOLVING VEHICLES 5LD 1973Y AND SLL 2497G

"Without Prejudice”
Dear June,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is unclear for the
above mentioned case. There is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either party’'s version. Enclosed herewith is a
copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal,

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our O1 we will

revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you
heard further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request the CCTV footage / accident scean photos / evidence in order to seek further
instruction from our principal.

Best Regurds,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultunts Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080:11)
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S1 UNIAVE L #11-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAN : (0A5) 62564112

Our Ref: CC6/AIG17024007/Aua3
22 NOVEMBER 2018

CHEW PIN CHENG

BLK 816 WOODLANDS STREET 82
#06-453

SINGAPORE 730816

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL 2497G & SLD 1973Y ON 18/12/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them,

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter. Based on both parties statement, we are of
the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions (both parties reported changing lane).
There is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either’s parties version. Therefore, we will
proceed to negotiate and settle with Third Party at 50/50 liability due 1o lack of evidence
from both parties.

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 7 days i.e. by 30/11/2018, after we shall
proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and
any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by yowyour driver against the
other party's insurer ansing from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if vour policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

L

THIN THIN HLAING
Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

Fax: 6741 4108

Email: thinthinf@ lkkauto.com

e.c.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



AUTHORISATIO ACT

I/ We, bawn EH*”"‘P'VL* 4 ("the third party claimant”) of
31 Sthetav WeAt Fawvaway) o SC 141 Y50 (address),
ownerof SLD [A¥3Y (vehicle no) hereby authorise HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING

WORKSHOP ("the workshop") to act for me with respect to my claim for repalr costs and/or
rental and/or loss of use ("claim") for my vehicle no. S 14 '?E_L that was damaged pursuant

to the accident which occurred on /8 - /2 5017 (date) along _%&MMM“T
(location) involving vehicle no/s _> LL %75 &("the accident").

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem
fit and the waorkshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim
with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the waorkshop.

| further acknowledge that any settiement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar 2s the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this__? & _(day)of __! > (month) 20_| Plyear)

£ 8 % 7
AUA MENG SPEAY PAINTING wm@ﬁ (
@KAKI BUKIT

’ § 9013 SINGAPORE 41785:
5747 8064, 6748 5510 £AX: G743 :::;

Signed by "the third party claimant” Signed by "the workshop”
(with company stamp if applicable) (with company stamp)




RELEASE VOUCHER
AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim

“We/l, HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WKSP (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK

AUTQ CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
S$8500.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no. SLD 1973Y that was damaged pursuant to the accident
which occurred on 18/12/2017 (date) along MALAYSIA CHECKPOINT involving vehicle no/s

SLL 2497G.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 18/12/2017 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner DAWN ENTERPRISE (the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SLD 1973Y make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SLD 1973Y (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Datedthis__ ¥ (day)of__0% (month)20 _L? (year)

£ w K ® K
@ HUA VENG SPRAY PANTING WORKSHO
Y @KAKI BUKI
l WA i - AUTC:E: 1.34 SINGAFORE 41788
\ TEL: & g 5518 FAX: 6743 430
Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)
'.l ML " ' .': " —_ -:hi"“ :
wﬂl (] ||,|'H.-r . l-'|L - ;o i

iy
CLAM "P;ngu el AR



L .
HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

AUTOBAY @ KAKIBUKIT
1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C #01-34/#01-61, Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 Fax: 6743 4896 H/P: 9666 9680
Reg. Mo 2546TEO00M

B

SINGATORE ENTREFRENELIRY
AWREDY 2013 2004

Your Ral
18/5/2018

Our Ref Dale . a

VEHICLE NO SLD 1973 Y

MAKE / MODEL TOYOTA WISH

NAME :DAWN ENTERPRISES

ADDRESS 121 SELETAR WEST FARMWAY 1

§$7938125
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR VEHICLE NO:SLD 1973 ¥
TO SUPPLY AND REPLACE PARTS, LABOUR CHARGES FOR 5 800.00

REPAIRING, KNOCKING, WELDING AND TO RESPRAY PAINTING
(LUMP SUM REPAIR)

SINGAPORE DOLLARS:EIGHT HUNDRED ONLY




1ZMBRMT ¥ Racoip

Land Transport Authority

Land Transpon Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701
GST Registration No. | M2-0006529-2
Print Date/Time : 18 Dec 2017 / 12:20:40

Receipt Date/Time : 18 Dec 2017 / 12:20:40

Tax Involce/Receipt
Receipt No. | [TNET-00000-171218-000880
Previous Recaipt No. .
8iN ltem Description/ Amount GST  Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No, GST (5§) (5%) [85)

of Insuranca Enquiry - SLMTS42X

12 Dec 2017/12:40:00

Co: GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY
Enguiry - SLMTS42X

5,00 0.35 535
Sub-Total 5.00 0.35 535
nee Enquiry - SLRTE58A
C INCOME INS CO-OF LTD
Insurance Bpquiry - SLR7558A
5.00 0.35 535
Sub-Total 5.00 0.35 535
iry - SJLT035Y
As a1 15 Dec 2017/18:30:
Insurance Co: TOKIO INSURANCE SINGAPORE LTD
3  Insurance Enquiry - SJLT035Y
Enquiry Fes 5.00 038 535
201T1218121844325664
Sub-Total 500 0.35 535
Resull of Insurance Enguiry - SLL2497G
As at 18 Dec 2017/02:40:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
4  Insurance Enquiry - SLL249TG
Enqguiry Fee 5.00 0.35 535
200 218121944366810
Sub-Total 5.00 035 535
Total Bafore Reunding 20.00 140 2140
Rounding Diffarence 0.00
Total Amount Payable 2140
Paid By
Direct Debit: sNETS
2017T1218121857636 Debit {Intemet Banking) 21.40
Total 21.40
Cash Changa 0.00

i el ltn, gow sgiitavil/mction completePayment TEUNCTION _ID=F1301001TT
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiang

IB:I.AIH SI.II-FOI.D!R TIM‘.‘I]HE S B S |
Cane Hotified |r:u Submirmes Ad) Assigned | Ag) Rpt | Ad] Subrmirted Ins Auth’ed STatus 1'
= [ 1
- 19 Dec 2017 é:'?ﬂ‘ m7 $$800.00 S££00.00 imhrlunﬂ
| Eulll._“ | Ean ady gt | EI‘*HJE""I view gt | m:-ll:-|_ ‘

Main Reference Claim Dwtails

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETATLS [Created by adjuster]
Insured: | CHEW PIN CHENG, 1D: 5831152594

i .
| Claimant: DAWN ENTERPRISES, Co. Reg. No.: 430053000

I 1B/12/2017 02:00 - :59
BLEDIRTEY. |Date of Loss: |/og yonths and 14 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr}]

Policy/Cover
TP/ 115348479056 Noxe No.: 2100501303

Policy Ne.
SLL2ABTG « : & y | SPITVOIZAT/VPZ/ROE

— — —i | — — — o

Meng Spray Painting Workshop (HQ) No 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #01-61 Autobay@Kaks Bukit, 417883 Kaki Bukit - el
| 67478064, 67465519

AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65 64153000 .. [Handied by Lok, Chee-Heng | Ches-Heng, LohBalg com

'ubmirmmuu (HQ) - Tal: (65) 6221 8611
|LKK Auto ConsuMtants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handled by ADRIAN LING) ... [Final Rpt due 29/12/2017]

'ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view &l | Compase Case Mail ||
There are no mail for this case.

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view Ml | Search Tasks | Create Mew Taik | Compiete |

Oue Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Agsigned By Complated On Cruatod On Done?
N resuis.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuscaction=dsp c... 4/4/2019



Merimen ¢-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLD1973Y (11534847905G)

[S5LL24587G]
™
DAWN ENTERPRISES
Dec 18 2017 2:00AM
[CHEW PIN CHENG]

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop

unlnldhmml mm[ L‘mw-mmrl uplullm' Uphllhml
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| D9OS/1813:51 | General View D | adws | 4
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hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 4/4/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

aeset | save | primt |

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
fotd ) Remaans ang Dot ureBes yoau N i [0 DI DR

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_docvi... 4/4/2019



Preview Page 1 of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT EREAKDOWN)
|".I"ihl=ﬂ| No: SLL2497G (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA WISH 2.0 (A)
SLD1973Y (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |18/12/2017
Global Sum Settlement | | [X] Yes | [ ] No
Repair Estimate -3 6,508.32
Final Repair Cost s 500.00
Loss of Use 5 2.00 days at 5100.00 per day
Rental (f any) 5 days
LTA [ GIA Search Fee -]
Others 5
' 5
Final Settlement Sum (Global Sum) 5 500,00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindyindicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 50 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenano No

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability () (%)
* Assessed Liability to be fillad oniy for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Paymaent Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1)_|Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop 5 500,00
2) s
3 s
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN o
LKK Auto Consultants Pta Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ BIN (If any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg ne 1sse07108m)

§1 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6258-3561 Fax: 6B44-8805 Email: sur@lkkauio com; assignments@Iikkauto. com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CCE/AIG17024007T/APA3C2

Date: Da4/2018

REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Paolicy No: 2100501303
SRS Yhos siD1eTSY insured Vehicle No :  SLL2497G
Date of Loss: 18M2r2017 Mature of Claim: TP Claim No: 115348479056
PESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLD187T3Y
Make & Modet TOYOTA WISH, 2.0 (A) Engine No: 3ZRA434229
Reg Date: D4/01/2010 (Man. Year. 2009) Chassis No. JTDGJ20WB05001802
Caolour; Siiver Odomeler 109417 km
Engine Capacity: 1887 cc
Markel Value/New Car Price; N/A
Sum Insured (S%) Market Value/New Car Price

ITION OF VEHI AT THE TI F Y
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable). Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yas
Handbrake (Serviceable) Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-accident Condition
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/85 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/65 R15
Front Left Side: Maxtrex & mm Rear Left Side Maxtrex & mm
Front Right Side Maxtrex & mm Rear Right Side Maxtrex 6 mm

Thee above values represent (he remaining lyre freads depth

COST OF CLAIMS = Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %
Paris 3.008.32 400.00 3,508 32 88,77
Miscellaneous [lems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,600.00 700.00 1.800.00 73.08
Paintwork Labour 0,00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 6,508.32 1,100.00 5,408.32 B1.10
Approved Total (Overridden) (S§) B00.00
Nett Amount (S§) 6,508.32 800.00 5,708.32 87.T1
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x S5100.00/day) (58) 200.00
(585) 1,000.00
Liable Amount (50.00%) (S5} 500.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (5§) 535
Nett Liability (S$) 505.35
Global Sum Settlement (S5) 500.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignmant: 18/122017
Date Inspected 18/12/2017 Inspected At
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Hua Meng Spray Painting Warkshop (HQ)
No 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #01-61
Autobay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE: Thia reporf represants our findings af the lime and place of napection stated herein. Such inspection has bean carmed outl fo the best of our
krowiedge snd shulity but any other labilly under any other croumatances /s horedy sxprassly sxciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount

1 1 *REAR BUMPER Repair 541 10FL *FL
2 2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDER Mot Necessary 197 BOFL *-FL
3 1 "REAR RH FENDER Repair 1,002.50FL *FL
4 1 "REAR RH FENDER QUARTER GLASS RUBBER Mol Necessary 496.20 FL = FL
5 1 *REAR RH DOOR Repair 1,533.50FL *-FL
B 1 "REAR RH SPORT RIM Cut BOOOOFS “40000FS
7001 *REAR RH TYRE Not Necessary 280.00FS *-FS

FuFranchise part S=SpcNetl LelisiitemDsc
Sub Total (S8) 4,851.10 400.00
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S§) 942 78 0.00

Total Parts (S§)  3,008.32 400.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous tems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 REMOVE,REPLACE & REPAIR CONSISTENT TO THE New 800.00 100.00

ACCIDENT

2 RESPRAY PAINTING New 800.00 B00.00

a REMOVE & REINSTALL REAR RH QUARTER GLASS New 800.00 0.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 2.600.00 700.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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