Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January, 2018 5:51 PM

To: ‘Lalitha Krishnan - III'

Cc: 'Motor Claim - III'; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Zayyer (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: PODS III Ref: MT/00228839 LKK Ref: CC6/11115009242/Rra3 Accident on

26.05.2015 involving XD3613G (India) and SJT6808Z (TP) along/at Junction of Cecil

Street towards Cross Street

Attachments: LKK Inspection Photos.pdf; LKK Reinspection Photos.pdf; LKKAdjustmentl.pdf;

LKKInspection.pdf; LOD.PDF

PODS - Express Settlements

PODS III Ref: MT/00228839 LKK Ref: CC6/11115009242/Rra3 Accident on 26.05.2015 involving XD3613G

(India) and SJT6808Z (TP) along/at Junction of Cecil Street towards Cross Street

Dear Lalitha,

We advise our recommendation as follows:

(a) Liability : 50%
(b) Quantum
COR :$1,872.50

LOU/Rental- :$200.00 ($100.00 X 4 Days)
LTA Search Fee :$ NIL

Total :$2,072.50
Veh Model : BMW 335i
(c) Remarks : Surveyor recommend 4 days

Please revert with your approval / mandate / instructions, if any. The relevant documents are attached.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 16 January, 2018 5:41 PM

To: 'Lalitha Krishnan - IlI' <lalitha@iii.com.sg>

Cc: 'Motor Claim - lllI' <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
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<chewht@lkkauto.com>; Zayyer (LKKAuto) <zayyer@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: PODS Il Ref: MT/00228839 LKK Ref: CC6/11115009242/Rra3 Accident on 26.05.2015 involving XD3613G
(India) and SIT6808Z (TP) along/at Junction of Cecil Street towards Cross Street

PODS - Express Settlements

PODS III Ref: MT/00228839 LKK Ref: CC6/11115009242/Rra3 Accident on 26.05.2015 involving XD3613G
(India) and SJT6808Z (TP) along/at Junction of Cecil Street towards Cross Street

Dear Lalitha,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we received LOD from TP. As such we will proceed direct settlement with TP.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 October, 2016 11:50 AM

To: Lalitha Krishnan - 11l <lalitha@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com>; Zayyer (LKKAuto) <zayyer@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PODS IIl Ref: MT/00228839 LKK Ref: CC6/11115009242/Rra3 Accident on 26.05.2015 involving XD3613G
(India) and SJIT6808Z (TP) along/at Junction of Cecil Street towards Cross Street

PODS III Ref: MT/00228839 LKK Ref: CC6/11115009242/Rra3 Accident on 26.05.2015 involving XD3613G (India) and
SJT6808Z (TP) along/at Junction of Cecil Street towards Cross Street

Dear Lalitha,
We refer to the above matter.
Be informed that till date TP’s repairer had finalised with our surveyor since 02/06/2015 after inspection .

TP’s repairer did not submit the LOD until now. In view of no further development, we will proceed to temporary close the file
and submit the report to your office.

If any new development in future, we will keep you informed for an update and follow up the matter accordingly.



Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lalitha Krishnan - III [mailto:lalitha@iii.com.sq]

Sent: Thursday, 2 July, 2015 3:53 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto)

Cc: KKLau; Sharon Yee; Vic; Kathy Lai; Admin A

Subject: RE: PODS III Ref: MT/00228839 LKK Ref: CC6/11115009242/Rra3 Accident on 26.05.2015 involving
XD3613G (India) and SJT6808Z (TP) along/at Junction of Cecil Street towards Cross Street

Dear Mei Kwan
We refer to your email below dated 10.6.15.
We agree with a direct settlement in this matter.

Best Regards,

LalithaKrishnan

Motor Claims Department
India International Insurance Pte Ltd
DID : 63476139
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From: Roger Yap

Sent: Monday, 15 June, 2015 10:50 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto); Lalitha Krishnan - III

Cc: KKLau; Sharon Yee; Vic; Kathy Lai; Admin A

Subject: RE: PODS III Ref: MT/00228839 LKK Ref: CC6/11115009242/Rra3 Accident on 26.05.2015 involving
XD3613G (India) and SJT6808Z (TP) along/at Junction of Cecil Street towards Cross Street

Hi Mei Kwan,
Please ignore the previous claim number.
Its wrongly input.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Roger Yap

Motor Claim Dept.



India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street

IOB Building #05-00

Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext: 248

From: Roger Yap On Behalf Of Motor Claim - III

Sent: Wednesday, 10 June, 2015 3:00 PM

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKK Auto)'; Lalitha Krishnan - III

Cc: KKLau; Sharon Yee; Vic; Kathy Lai; Admin A

Subject: RE: PODS III Ref: G92001202 LKK Ref: CC6/11115009242/Rra3 Accident on 26.05.2015 involving XD3613G
(India) and SJT6808Z (TP) along/at Junction of Cecil Street towards Cross Street

Hi Mei Kwan

We refer to your email below dated .
We attach copy of our driver's SAS report as requested.

Kindly note that the claim handler is Ms Lalitha.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Roger Yap

Motor Claim Dept.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd

From: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 10 June, 2015 9:55 AM

To: Motor Claim - III

Cc: KKLau; Sharon Yee; Vic; Kathy Lai; Admin A

Subject: PODS III Ref: (TBA) LKK Ref: CC6/11115009242/Rra3 Accident on 26.05.2015 involving XD3613G (India)
and SJT6808Z (TP) along/at Junction of Cecil Street towards Cross Street

PODS - Express Settlements

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SJT 6808Z at M/s Mbm Wheelpower Pte Ltd.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP’s SAS report, estimated cost of repair and photographs of TP vehicle in its
damaged condition for your perusal.

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair is $9,027.06.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Kathy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2928.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



